








REQUEST FOR BOARD CONSIDERATION-COUNTY OF MUSKEGON
 
COMMITTEE BUDGETED NON-BUDGETED PARTIAllY BUDGETED 

Courts and Public Safety x 0 0 

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT 

14th Circuit Court ~ Family Division 
COMMITTEE DATE 

February 3, 2009 
~ESTOR SIGNATU~~ 

171 ;A; /J ./ /J. ~~ 
SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 

The Family Division received approval in the FY09 budget to purchase two new full size automobiles. 
The Muskegon County Board of Commissioners authorized (2008 - 503) the Family Division to seek 
bids for the automobiles on October 14, 2008. The bid sheet is attached and Don Rypma Chevrolet 
is the lowest bidder at a cost of $19,868 per vehicle. It is recommended that the bid from Don Rypma 
Chevrolet be accepted and the purchasing process move forward. 

Vehicles # 01 (1998 Ford Taurus) and # 03 (2001 Chevy Lumina) will be retired for auction upon 
delivery of the new vehicles. 

Revenue generated from mileage reimbursement from the State of Michigan will be used to 
reimburse the Equipment Revolving Fund for the cost of the vehicle. 

SUGGESTED MOTION (STATE EXACTLY AS IT SHOULD APPEAR IN THE MINUTES) 

I move that the Board of Commissioners authorize the Circuit Court-Family Division to purchase two 
2009 Chevy Impala's from Don Ryma Chevrolet at the cost of $19,868 per vehicle. 

ADMINISTRATIVE ANALYSIS (AS APPLICABLE) 

HUMAN RESOURCES ANALYSIS: FINANCE & MANAGEMENT ANALYSIS: 

r~~~-Jtf-rrtf-vdtb 

CORPORATE COUNSEL ANALYSIS: ADMINISTRATOR RECOMMENDATION: 

n 
( 

AGENDA DATE: ;2/3109 IAGENDA NO.: 
r:.PSO q/o;;J-(}S BOARD DATE: d ~;) Jo 9 IPAGE NO. 

Revised 12/08/04 
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Page 1 

COMMODITY #: 070-00 

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles 

Family Court 
Vendor Name Full-Size 

Sedan 

Red Holman Pontiac 
35300 Ford Road No Bid 
Westland, Mi 48185 

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY 

X BID -­ QUOTATION -­ PROPOSAL RFB 09-1625 
* Prices are per vehicle * 

DEPT: Family Court OPENING DATE: 1/2109 

Sedan 
Alternative 

Fuel 

No Bid 

No. of Bids Mailed 32 

No. of Bids Reoeived 10 

No. of No-Bids Reoeived 4 

No. of Non-Response 17 

No. of Web Bids Received 1 Late Bid 

Comments 

Family Auto Center 
3146 Henry Street 
Muskegon, MI 49441 

No Bid No Bid 

Don Rypma 
8130 Whitehall Road 
Whitehall, Ml 49461 

Chevy 
Impala 
$19,868.00 

No Charge 
E85 

Signature Ford 
1960 E. Main Street 
Owosso, MI 48867 

No Bid No Bid 

Great Lakes Ford 
2469 Apple Avenue 
Muskegon, MI 49442 

Ford 
Taurus 
$20,673.00 

N/A 

Don Seelye Ford 
3820 Stadium Drive 
Kalamazoo, Ml 49008 

Varsity Ford 
3480 Jackson Road 
Ann Arbor, MI48106 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Western Mllnternational 
Whiteside Fleet 
Jorgensen Ford 
Integrity Trailers 
Harold Zeigler 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
Bid received 

Late 

DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe 
RECOMMENDATION: 

WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson 
PURCHASING 
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Joe Siedenstrang 

~ THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO: 



JUVENILE COURT CAR FLEET
 

CAR # 01 
MODEL 1998 TAURUS 
LIC# 064x477 
COLOR DKBLUE 
CAGE YES 
VIN# 
1FAFP52U1 WG266958 

CAR # 03 
MODEL 2001 LUMINA 
LIC# 064x479 
COLOR GREEN 
CAGE YES 
VIN# 
2Gl WL52J411298202 
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REQUEST FOR BOARD CONSIDERATION-COUNTY OF MUSKEGON
 
BUDGETED NON-BUDGETED PARTIALLY BUDGETED 

x 0 0 

COMMITTEE DATE REQUESTOR SIGNATURE 

February 3, 2009 Vernon Nash 

SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 

The Ways and Means Committee recommended and the Board approved a motion on 12-19-06, to 
authorize a hiring freeze on all General Fund full-time positions and on all full-time positions outside 
the General fund, which are supported by the General fund in the amount of 50 per cent or more. If 
it is critical to a Department's operation to fill a position, the Department Head may request that the 

The Department has a vacant Shift Supervisor position. The position is vital to operations at the 
facility as the Shift Supervisor is responsible for the facility in the absence of Administrative staff. 
Filling the position in a timely fashion will eliminate overtime budgetary issues. 

The Department requests that the Board of Commissioners waive the hiring freeze and allow the 
Juvenile Detention Center to fiJI the Shift Supervisor position # N46503 

SUGGESTED MOTION (STATE EXACTLY AS IT SHOULD APPEAR IN THE MINUTES) 

Move to approve the Juvenile Detention Center's request to waive the hiring freeze and fill the vacant 

FINANCE & MANAGEMENT ANALYSIS: 

IU~orr~£b 

ADMINISTRATOR RE JOMMENDATION: 

r)( j) )
)~~ JY1;

-

BOARD DATE:';;/Jc~JOCj I PAGE NO. 

COMMITTEE Courts and Public Safety 

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT 

Juvenile Detention Center 

Board waive the hiring freeze for that position. 

Shift Supervisor position # N46503 

ADMINISTRATIVE ANALYSIS (AS APPLICABLE) 

HUMAN RESOURCES ANALYSIS: 

Recommend Approval 
DG 

CORPORATE COUNSEL ANALYSIS: 

AGENDA DATE: ';'/3)OCJ A{!J5S01/0:J -(){~ 

Revised 1/28/09 



REQUEST FOR BOARD CONSIDERATION-COUNTY OF MUSKEGON
 
COMMITTEE Courts and Public Safety IBU~GETED NON-BUDGETED PARTIALLY BUDGETED 

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT PROSECUTOR ICOMMITTEE DATE 2/3/09 IREQUESTOR SIGNATURE 

SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 

The Prosecutor is requesting to accept a contract amendment from the State of Michigan DepartmentI 

of Human Services whereby the Prosecutor provides legal representation for the Department of 
Human Services for all neglect and abuse cases occurring in Muskegon County. The contract 
amendment sets the rate at $90 per hour for 2008 and $90.72 for calendar years 2009 and 2010, not 
to exceed $40,824 for 2008 and not to exceed $41,151 for 2009 and 2010. The contracted number 
of units, or hours, is set at 2,160 per year. The contract period is January 1, 2008 through December 
31,2010. 

SUGGESTED MOTION (STATE EXACTLY AS IT SHOULD APPEAR IN THE MINUTES) 

I move to accept the contract amendment between the Muskegon County Prosecutor and the State 
of Michigan, Department of Human Services, effective January 1, 2008 through December 31,2010, 
which provides for legal representation for Muskegon County neglect and abuse cases at a rate of 
$90.00 per hour for 2008 and a rate of $90.72 for 2009 and 2010, not to exceed $41,151 annually and 
to authorize the Chairman of the Board to affix his signature to the contract amendment. 

ADMINISTRATIVE ANALYSIS (AS APPLICABLE) 

FINANCE & MANAGEMENT ANALYSIS: HUMAN RESOURCES ANALYSIS: 

Ku-~0/r1nrJ~ 

ADMINISTRATOR RECOMMENDATION: CORPORATE COUNSEL ANALYSIS: 

Concur
 
TW
 DL)r1/ 

v 

AGENDA DATE: BOARD DATE: <;:;;//.;)./0 r IPAGE NO: cPh loet IAGECft NO.: /~PS/)Cj, 0;)' 0"7 



Michigan Department of Human Services - Office of Contracts and Rate Setting
 
Amendment Cover Sheet
 

Unit Rate
 

Contractor Name: County of Muskegon 
Contractor Email Address: 
Check all Contract Year(s) o Year 1 
affected by this amendment DVear4 

I Contract#:PROFC-08-61001 

['g] Year 2 ['g] Year 3 
o YearS o Year 6 

Contract Administrator Name: Jennifer Parks 
Phone No.: 517-241-8264 
Complete the sections below only if account structure is changing: 
PCA: I Index Code: I ACC: 

CM-F901-U (Rev. 7-07) Previous ed~ion obsolete. MS Word 
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Contract No.: PROFC-08-61 001 
Amendment No. 1 
1st Year Amount $ 40,824.00 
2nd Year Amount $ 41,151.00 
3rd Year Amount $ 41,151.00 
Total Contract Amount: $ 123,126.00 
County: Muskegon 
Method of Payment Unit Rate 

STATE OF MICHIGAN
 
DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES
 

WHEREAS, the Department of Human Services of the State of Michigan (hereinafter referred 
to as the "DHS") entered into a contractual Agreement effective January 1, 2008, with County 
of Muskegon, having a mailing address of 990 Terrace, Muskegon, MI 49442 (hereinafter 
referred to as "Contractor'), for the provision of certain services as set forth therein; and, 

WHEREAS, it is mutually desirable to DHS and to the Contractor to amend the aforesaid 
Agreement. 

THEREFORE, in consideration of the promises and mutual covenants hereinabove and 
hereinafter contained, the parties hereto agree to the following amendment of said 
Agreement: 

Article I 

The maximum dollar amount of the Agreement shall be increased by $ 654.00 from $ 
122,472.00 to $ 123,126.00 for the period January 1, 2008 to December 31,2010. 

From the total amount the maximum amount that may be expended during the following 
periods is: 

Caiendar Year Contract Amount 
January 1,2008 through December 31,2008 $40,824.00 
January 1, 2009 through December 31,2009 $ 41,151.00 
January 1,2010 through December 31,2010 $ 41,151.00 

Article II 

The unit rate shall be increased by $ .72 from $ 90.00 to $ 90.72 

Article III 

CM-F901-U (Rev. 7-07) Previous edition obsolete. MS Word 

II 



The maximum number of units to be provided by the Contractor during the specified funding 
period shall be as follows: 

Unit Title Number of units # Calendar Year 
Legal Services 2160 2009 

Legal Services 2160 2010 

-2­
CM-F901-U (Rev. 7-07) Previous edition obsolete. MS Word 



-------

This Amendment shall be attached to the Agreement, and is effective January 1, 2009, said 
Agreement being hereby reaffirmed and made a part hereof. 

The Undersigned has the lawful authority to bind the Contractor to the terms set forth in this 
Agreement. 

County of Muskegon 
Dated at , Michigan 

this __day of By: 

(Contractor) 

Witness: 

Dated at , Michigan ------­ DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES 

__ day ofthis 

Witness: 

By: 
Director-----~---------

Contract # PROFC-08-61 001 

-3­
CM-F901-U (Rev. 7-07) Previous edition obsolete. MS Word 
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REQUEST FOR BOARD CONSIDERATION-COUNTY OF MUSKEGON
 
COMMITTEE Courts & Public Safety IBU~GETED NON-BUDGETED PARTIALLY BUDGETED 

0 0 

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT Sheriffs Office ICOMMITTEE DATE 2/03/09 REQUESTOR SIGNATURE 
Dean Roesler 

SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 

The State of Michigan, Department of State Police, OHSP has awarded the Sheriffs Office $5,000.00 
for a "MACP Award Grant" for fiscal year ending September 30,2009 for the purchase of equipment. 

As a result of winning the MACP Award for Excellence in Traffic Safety, the Muskegon County 
Sheriffs Office would like to purchase a hand held data recorder, appropriate software and printers 
and docking for all patrol cars. 

SUGGESTED MOTION (STATE EXACTLY AS IT SHOULD APPEAR IN THE MINUTES) 

Move to authorize the Sheriff's Office to accept the "MACP Award Grant" from the State Office of 
Highway Safety for equipment in the amount of $5,000.00 for year ending September 30,2009 and 
establish a budget. 

ADMINISTRATIVE ANALYSIS (AS APPLICABLE) 

HUMAN RESOURCES ANALYSIS: FINANCE & MANAGEMENT ANALYSIS: 

Recommend Approval 
SO 

CORPORATE COUNSEL ANALYSIS: ADMINISTRATOR RECOMMENDATION: 

Concur 
JE 

AGENDA DATE: d)J3/09 BOARD DATE: 6)//;;).. /0 9 IPAGE NO. IAGcp~DOq /Od - 08 

Revised 1/29/09 



ASSOCIATION OFFICERS 

Presid(;lnt 
. Chief George G. Basar 

Howell 

First Vice President
 
Chief Larry R. Hrinik
 
Davison Township
 

Second Vice President
 
Chief Michael A. Lauretli
 

Eastpointe
 

Immediate Past President
 
Chief Patrick C. Wyman
 

Mackinaw City
 

Secretary-Treasurer
 
Chief Millon L. Scales
 

District 7 - SI. of Michigan/DEQ
 

BOARD OF DIRECTORS
 

Chief Daniel Grant
 
District 1 - Wyandotte
 

Chief Theodore H. Quisenberry
 
District 2 - Royal Oak
 

Chief Bruce J. Smith
 
District 3 -Chesterfield Twp.
 

Chief George N. Sippert
 
District 4 -Flint Township
 

Chief Timothy Bourgeois
 
District 5 - Kalamazoo Twp.
 

ChiefThomas Korabik
 
District6-North MUskegon
 

Chief Matthew E. l:iarshberger
 
District 8 ~ Ypsilanti
 

Chief Stanley A. Dinius
 
District 9 - Central Michigan
 

University
 

Chief Craig A. Oatten 
District 10 - Carrolltown Twp. 

Chief Joseph C. FitzGerald
 
District 11 - Gaylord
 

Director James Hansen 
District 12 - Escanaba 

Chief James R. Barren, Ph.D 
District 13 - Detroit 

Col. Peter C.Munoz, Director 
District 14cMSP 
-":	 . 

EXECUTIVE STAFF 

Thomas A. Hendrickson
 
Executive Director
 

Jamie K. Foster 
Executive Assistant 

Michigan Association of Chiefs of Police 
2133 University Park Drive, Suite 200
 

Okemos, MI 48864 .
 
,Phone: 517.349.9420 Fax: 517.349.5823
 

www.michiganpolicechiefs.org
 

f11: II e 
January 15, 2009 

7)~t..j 
Sheriff Dean Roesler 

J~\;",Muskegon County Sheriff's Office
 
25 W. Walton
 12e~L.!~ 
Muskegon, MI49440 

Q~r 
RE:	 AAAlMACP/OHSP Traffic Safety Award Banquet
 

Thursday. February 5, 2009 .
 

Dear Sheriff Roesler: 

Congratulations, your department has been chosen as the First Place recipient in 
the Sheriff for the 2008 MichIgan Association of Chiefs of Police (MACP) Award for 
Excellence in Traffic Safety. You will be awarded aplaque from AAA Michigan and 
up to $5,000 from the Traffic Services Section to purchase traffic safety equipment 
or schedule overtime at the 2009 MACP Mid-Winter Awards Banquet, Thursday, 

. February 5, 2009. The banquet begins at 7 PM in the Ambassador Ballroom at the 
Amway Grand Plaza Hotel. The awards program follows beginning at 8 PM. 

Each agency will receive one banquet ticket. Ifyou require additional banquet 
tickets you may purchase them for $35.00 each. If you are already registered for 
the entire conference, a banquet ticket was included in your registration. 

Please RSVP your plans to attend by emailing me at jafoster@msu.edu no 
later than Wednesday, January 28, 2009. PrOvide me with the name(s) and title(s) 
of the individual(s) who will be representing your agency and how many banquet 
tickets you need. We prefer that you pay for additional tickets in advance; if this 
is not possible please let me know. You may pay for the banquet tickets in advance 
by check or credit card, or you may pay with cash or check at the door (no credit 
card payments that night). Tickets and name tags will be available at the MACP 
Registration Desk in the Center Concourse until 4 p.m. on Thursday, February 5th 

, 

MACP staff will also be in the Crown Foyer from 6:30-7 PM with tickets. 

If you have any further questions regarding the banquet tickets please call me at 
517.349.9420. 

Sincerely, 

Ja~ter 
Executive Assistant 

Cc:	 Lt. Michael Poulin 

/5 



County of Muskegon 
Sheriffs Office 

Accounts Description 
1210-0319 

510000 Fed Pass Thru 

747010 Operating Supplies 
947000 Software 
978000 Equipment 

Total 

MACP Award 
2008/2009 

Budget 

5,000.00 

2.961.00 
445.00 

1.594.00 

5,000.00
 



REQUEST FOR BOARD CONSIDERATION-COUNTY OF MUSKEGON 
COMMITTEE Courts & Public Safety IBU~GETED NON-BUD~ETED PA;'::ALL~Uf GETED 

REQUESTING DEPARTMENT Sheriffs Office COMMITTEE DATE 2/03/09 IREQUESTOR SPNA-rtJRkJ\, 
Dean Roesler L 4 ' ___ 

SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 

The Sheriff's Office requests permission to accept the grant from the Office of Drug Control Policy for 
continuing a WEMET officer. The grant is for $34,024.00 ofwhich $17,012.00 is federal funds through 
Ottawa County and $17,012.00 budgeted local match. 

This grant is $21,000 less than last year, and it should be made up with savings in our general fund 
operating budget due to unfilled positions. 

SUGGESTED MOTION (STATE EXACTLY AS IT SHOULD APPEAR IN THE MINUTES) 

So move to accept the grant from the Office of Drug Control Policy for WEMET for $34,024.00, 
$17,012.00 federal funds and $17,012.00 local funds for October 1, 2008 to September 30,2009. 

ADMINISTRATIVE ANALYSIS (AS APPLICABLE) 

HUMAN RESOURCES ANALYSIS: FINANCE & MANAGEMENT ANALYSIS: 

CORPORATE COUNSEL ANALYSIS: ADMINISTRATOR RECOMMENDATION: 

Concur 
TW 

BOARD DATE: c2h;:;.l/o'l IPAGE NO. 

J7
 



MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY HEALTH
 
OFFICE OF DRUG CONTROL POLICY
 

BYRNE JUSTICE ASSISTANCE GRANT PROGRAM
 
SUBCONTRACT
 

SUBGRANTEE: SUBGRANTEE PROJECT OFFICIAL: 

MUSKEGON COUNTY Dean Roesler 
990 Terrace Street Muskegon County Sheriff 
Muskegon, MI 49442 25 West Walton 

Muskegon, MI 49442 
Telephone: (231) 724-6351 
Fax: (231) 724-6683 - Telephone: (231) 724~6236 

ODCP PROJECT #70834 -1 ­ 09 - B Fax: (231) 724-6683 -

SUBCONTRACTOR FEDERAL ID# SUBGRANTEE FINANCIAL OFFICIAL: 
38-6004639 

PROJECT START DATE PROJECT END DATE James Elwell 
Muskegon County Interim Administrator 

October 1, 2008 September 30, 2009 
990 Terrace Street 
Muskegon, MI 49442 

BUDGET SUMMARY Telephone: (231) 724-6520 

CATEGORY AMOUNT 
Fax: ( 231) 724-6673 

Salaries &Wages $ 23,159 PROJECT TITLE: 
Fringe Benefits $10,865 WEMET MultiJurlsdlctlonal Drug and Gang Task Force 

Travel OCH Contract No.: 20091736 
Federal Grant Award No.:200B OJ BX 0013 

Supplies &Materials CFOA No.:16.73B 
EQuipment 
Other Expenses: 

BYRNE FUNDS $17,012 

TOTAL DIRECT $34,024 
MATCHING FUNDS $17,012

Indirect Costs 
TOTAL $ 34,024 TOTAL $ 34,024 

We hereby accept this subcontract in the amount and for the period shown above on the basis of the application, 
assurances and supporting documents submitted by the Grantee to the Office of Drug Control Policy. The subgrant 
becomes effective upon the return of the executed subcontract to the Grantee. This award does not assure or imply 
continuation in funding beyond the funding period of this subcontract. The subgrantee agrees to provide the Grantee with 
a copy of the Single Audit Report of the subgrantee's entity. 

FOR THE SUBGRANTEE: FOR THE GRANTEE: 

Cameron Hanke Date: 
Project Director 

GRANTEE: 
OTTAWA COUNTY 
12220 Fillmore Street 
West Olive, MI 49460 

James Derezinski 
SUbgrantee Authorizing Official 

Date: 

Dean Roesler 
Subgrantee Project Official 

Date: 

James Elwell 
Subarantee Financial Official 

Date: 

Rev. ] lIl3/08 



ATTACHMENT C
 

STANDARD ASSURANCES
 

The Applicant hereby assures and certifies compliance with all applicable Federal statutes, regulations, 
policies, guidelines, and requirements, including OMS Circulars A-21 , A-87, A-102, A-11 0, A-122, A-133; Ex. 
Order 12372 (intergovernmental review of federal programs); and 28 C.F.R. pts. 66 or 70 (administrative 
requirements for grants and cooperative agreements). The applicant also specifically assures and certifies 
that: 

1.	 It has the legal authority to apply for federal assistance and the institutional, managerial, and 
financial capability (including funds sufficient to pay any required non-federal share of project cost) to 
ensure proper planning, management, and completion of the project described in this application. 

2.	 It will establish safeguards to prohibit employees from using their positions for a purpose that 
constitutes or presents the appearance of personal or organizational conflict of interest, or personal 
gain. 

3.	 It will give the awarding agency or the General Accounting Office, through any authorized 
representative, access to and the right to examine all paper or electronic records related to the 
financial assistance. 

4.	 It will comply with all lawful requirements imposed by the awarding agency, specifically including any 
applicable regulations, such as 28 C.F.R. pts. 18, 22, 23, 30, 35, 38, 42, 61, and 63. 

5.	 It will assist the awarding agency (if necessary) in assuring compliance with section 106 of the 
National Historic Preservation Act of 1966 (16 U.S.C. § 470), Ex. Order 11593 (identification and 
protection of historic properties), the Archeological and Historical Preservation Act of 1974 (16 
U.S.C. § 469 a-1 et seg.), and the National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 (42 U.S.C. § 4321). 

6.	 It will comply (and will require any sUbgrantees or contractors to comply) with any applicable 
statutorily-imposed nondiscrimination requirements, which may include the Omnibus Crime Control 
and Safe Streets Act of 1968 (42 U.S.C. § 3789d); the Victims of Crime Act (42 U.S.C. § 10604(e»; 
The Juvenile Justice and Delinquency Prevention Act of 2002 (42 U.S.C. § 5672(b»; the Civil Rights 
Act of 1964 (42 U.S.C. § 2000d); the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 (29 U.S.C. §7 94); the Americans 
with Disabilities Act of 1990 (42 U.S.C. § 12131-34); the Education Amendments of 1972 (20 U.S.C. 
§§1681, 1683, 1685-86); and the Age Discrimination Act of 1975 (42 U.S.C. §§ 6101-07); see Ex. 
Order 13279 (equal protection of the laws for faith-based and community organizations). 

7.	 If a governmental entity-

a.	 It will comply with the requirements of the Uniform Relocation Assistance and Real Property 
AcqUisitions Act of 1970 (42 U.S.C. § 4601 et seq.), which govern the treatment of persons 
displaced as a result of federal and federally-assisted programs; and 

b.	 It will comply with requirements of 5 U.S.C. §§ 1501-08 and §§7324-28, which limit certain 
political activities of State or local government employees whose principal employment is in 
connection with an activity financed in whole or in part by federal assistance. 

Agency Name 

Signature of Authorized Official	 Date 

Rev. 11113/08 


