
MUSKEGON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

Courts & Public Safety Committee 
AGENDA 

via Zoom and in-person at: Michael E. Kobza Hall of Justice, 990 Terrace Street, Muskegon, MI 49442 

 

 

January 11, 2022 - 3:00 p.m. Malinda Pego, Chair 

 Marcia Hovey-Wright, Vice-Chair 

 

Connect to Zoom from your computer, tablet or smartphone at:  https://rb.gy/kqzmkf 

Phone: (312) 626-6799 

Meeting ID:  821 6495 5925 

Passcode:  264078 
 

View the meeting on Facebook at: 

https://www.facebook.com/MuskegonCountyMI 

 

1) Call to Order 

2) Roll Call 

3) Approval of the Agenda 

4) Approval of Minutes of December 7, 2021 

5) Public Comment (on an agenda item) 

6) Items for Consideration 

CPS22/01 – 01 (Sheriff Poulin) To amend the FY2022 Coronavirus Public Safety Fund 

(2110) budget, increasing revenues and expenditures by $14,650 from 

$6,957 to $21,607. 

CPS22/01 – 02 (Community Corrections/Scott Lamiman) To award Kelly Austin to provide 

cognitive behavioral services in the jail and authorize the Board Chair to 

sign the contract for services with the option to renew for two subsequent 

years depending on availability of grant funding and mutual agreement of 

both parties. 

CPS22/01 – 03 (Community Corrections/Scott Lamiman) To award Catholic Charities to 

provide cognitive behavioral services in the community and authorize the 

Board Chair to sign the contract for services with the option to renew for 

two subsequent years depending on availability of grant funding and 

mutual agreement of both parties. 
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CPS22/01 – 04 (Circuit Court/Sandra Vanderhyde) To add a fully grant funded hourly 

Specialty Court Enforcement Officer position, grade NO 2070, with a salary 

range of $22.848 to $28.755, to the Circuit Court for Recovery Court. 

CPS22/01 – 05 (Circuit Court/Sandra Vanderhyde) To approve the creation of a new hourly 

Juvenile Transition Center (JTC) Administrative Assistant position at pay 

table/grade QU-00173, $16.63/hr -$20.78/hr. 

CPS22/01 – 06 (Emergency Services/Richard Warner) Move to approve the Sole Source 

purchase of 10 mobile fingerprint scanners at a cost of $35,174.00. This is 

100% grant funded using Homeland Security funding with no cost to the 

County. 

7) Unfinished Business 

8) New Business 

 

MUSKEGON COUNTY RESOLUTION TO ENSURE ALL CONSTITUTIONAL RIGHTS OF INMATES  

AT THE MUSKEGON COUNTY JAIL 

9) Public Comment 

10) Final Board Comment 

11) Adjournment 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 

Courts & Public Safety Committee 
via Zoom and in-person at: Michael E. Kobza Hall of Justice, 990 Terrace Street, Muskegon, MI 49442 

 

December 7, 2021 – 3:00 p.m. Malinda Pego, Chair 

 Marcia Hovey-Wright, Vice-Chair 

 
MINUTES 

 

 

CALL TO ORDER 
 
The meeting was called to order by Commissioner Pego at 3:00 p.m. 
 
ROLL CALL 
 
Present: Kim Cyr, Doug Brown, Marcia Hovey-Wright, Susie Hughes (Attended from 

Muskegon Township via Zoom due to medical concerns), Zach Lahring, Charles 
Nash, Bob Scolnik, Malinda Pego 

Absent: Rillastine Wilkins 
Also Present: Mark Eisenbarth, County Administrator; Kathy Tharp, Administrative Coordinator 
 
APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
 
It was moved by Commissioner Brown, supported by Commissioner Nash, to approve the minutes of 
the November 2, 2021 meeting as written. [Voice Vote]     Motion carried. 
 
PUBLIC COMMENT 
 
None 
 
ITEMS FOR CONSIDERATION 
 
CPS21/12 - 60 It was moved by Commissioner Hovey-Wright, supported by Chairman Scolnik, 

to request permission to accept through the FY2021 Michigan State Police – 
Emergency Management & Homeland Security Division (EMPG American 
Rescue Plan Act) reimbursement for up to 17.13% of the Muskegon County 
Emergency Services Director’s salary and fringe benefits and adjust the budget 
accordingly. 

 
Roll Call: 
Yes:  Marcia Hovey-Wright, Susie Hughes, Zach Lahring, Charles Nash, Bob Scolnik, Kim Cyr, 

Doug Brown  
No: Malinda Pego         Motion carried. 

CPS21/12 - 61 It was moved by Commissioner Brown, supported by Commissioner Hovey-

Wright, to approve a one-year contract with Managed Assigned Counsel (MAC) 

services for $25,000 and authorize the Board Chair to sign the agreement. 

 

3



Courts & Public Safety Committee 

Minutes – December 7, 2021 

Page 2 

Roll Call: 
Yes:    Susie Hughes, Zach Lahring, Charles Nash, Bob Scolnik, Kim Cyr, Doug Brown,  

Marcia Hovey-Wright, Malinda Pego 
No: None           Motion carried. 

CPS21/12 - 62 It was moved by Commissioner Nash, supported by Commissioner Brown, to 

accept the FY2022 Off-Road Vehicle (ORV) Law Enforcement Grant in the 

amount of $16,500.00 from the Michigan Department of Natural Resources and 

to have the Sheriff sign the agreement. 

 
Roll Call: 
Yes:  Charles Nash, Robert Scolnik, Kim Cyr, Doug Brown, Marcia Hovey-Wright, Susie Hughes  
No: Zach Lahring, Malinda Pego       Motion carried. 
 
CPS21/12 - 63 It was moved by Commissioner Nash, supported by Commissioner Brown, to 

approve the funding increase in the amount of $105,465.00 with the county’s 
allocation for FY2022 is now $181,785.00 from the Office of Highway Safety 
Planning for the Secondary Road Patrol Program.  To adjust the budget 
accordingly. 

 
Roll Call: 
Yes:  Charles Nash, Robert Scolnik, Kim Cyr, Doug Brown, Marcia Hovey-Wright, Susie Hughes 
No: Zach Lahring, Malinda Pego       Motion carried. 
 
CPS21/12 - 64 It was moved by Commissioner Hovey-Wright, supported by Commissioner 

Nash, to approve a sole procurement not to exceed $110,000 to purchase a bi-
directional amplifier to improve law enforcement communication with Central 
Dispatch and adjust the budget accordingly. 

 
Roll Call: 
Yes:  Robert Scolnik, Kim Cyr, Doug Brown, Marcia Hovey-Wright, Susie Hughes, Charles Nash, 

Malinda Pego 
No: Zach Lahring          Motion carried. 
 
CPS21/12 - 65 It was moved by Commissioner Nash, supported by Commissioner Hughes, to 

accept the FY22 Community Corrections grant in the amount of $200,200 and 
authorize the Board Chairperson to sign the contract with the Michigan 
Department of Corrections. 

Roll Call: 
Yes:  Kim Cyr, Doug Brown, Marcia Hovey-Wright, Susie Hughes, Zach Lahring, Charles Nash, 

Robert Scolnik, Malinda Pego 
No: None           Motion carried. 
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UNFINISHED BUSINESS 
 
CPS21/12 – 66 It was moved by Commissioner Nash, supported by Commissioner Hovey-

Wright, to extend privileges to allow the sheriff to keep and not return the 
armored vehicles; International Max Pro and Humvee indefinitely. 

 
Roll Call: 
Yes:  Marcia Hovey-Wright, Susie Hughes, Charles Nash, Robert Scolnik 
No: Kim Cyr, Doug Brown, Zach Lahring, Malinda Pego    Motion failed. 
 
NEW BUSINESS 
 
None 
 
PUBLIC COMMENT 
 
None 
 
FINAL BOARD COMMENT 
 
Commissioner Doug Brown thanked the sheriff and all law enforcement for working with local schools 
regarding recent events. 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
 
There being no further business to come before the Ways & Means Committee, the meeting 
adjourned at 3:37 p.m. 

5



Muskegon County Courts & Public Safety Committee
Request for Board Approval

Requestor: Michael J. Poulin Committee Date: 2022-01-11

Requesting Department: Sheriff's Office Full Board Date: 2022-01-18

Budget: Partially Budgeted Agenda Number: CPS22/01 - 01

Suggested Motion: (State the following exactly as it should appear in the minutes.)

Move to amend the FY2022 Coronavirus Public Safety Fund (2110) budget, increasing revenues and
expenditures by $14,650 from $6,957 to $21,607.

Summary of Request: (General description of financing, other operational impact, possible alternatives.)

On May 12, 2020, the Board of Commissioners approved acceptance of the Bureau of Justice Assistance
(BJA) FY20 CoronaVirus Emergency Supplemental funding program grant in the amount of $58,008 (motion
#2020-191).  The grant period is January 20, 2020 to December 31, 2021.  For fiscal years 2020 and 2021, a
total of $36,401 has been expended and reimbursed on this grant, which leaves a current available balance
remaining on the grant of $21,607 for FY2022.  The current FY2022 budget for this grant is $6,957, therefore a
budget amendment is needed to increase the revenue and expenditure budget by $14,650 from $6,957 to
$21,607.

Kristen Wade, HR Director Analysis Required? No Finance Manager:

Michael Homier, Corporate Counsel Analysis Required? No Mark Eisenbarth, County Administrator Recommendation:
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Muskegon County Courts & Public Safety Committee
Request for Board Approval

Requestor: Scott Lamiman Committee Date: 2022-01-11

Requesting Department: Community
Corrections/Sheriff's Department

Full Board Date: 2022-01-18

Budget: Budgeted Agenda Number: CPS22/01 - 02

Suggested Motion: (State the following exactly as it should appear in the minutes.)

Move to award Kelly Austin to provide cognitive behavioral services in the jail and authorize the Board Chair to
sign the contract for services with the option to renew for two subsequent years depending on availability of
grant funding and mutual agreement of both parties.

Summary of Request: (General description of financing, other operational impact, possible alternatives.)

Community Corrections is seeking to renew the award instruction for cognitive behavioral services in the jail.
The program is called Thinking Matters and the recommendation of the award will be to Kelly Austin for a
maximum budgeted amount of $22,500. Funding for this program will be provided by the Office of Community
Corrections in Lansing.

Kristen Wade, HR Director Analysis Required? No Finance Manager:

Michael Homier, Corporate Counsel Analysis Required?
Yes

Mark Eisenbarth, County Administrator Recommendation:
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Commodity Numbers: 47549, 91838, 91865, 91867, 92416, 92435, 92440, 92441, 92442, 92486, 94876, 94886, 95220, 95221, 

95223, 95290, 95685 **Solicitation Statistics** Bonfire Bidnet

Department: Sheriff Department Viewed Documents: 16 12

Proposal:  RFP 22-2440 Release Date: 10/27/2021 Solicitation Received:  2 N/A

Product / Service:  Cognitive Behavioral Intervention Services Opening Date: 11/18/2021 No-Solicit Form Received:  0 N/A

Received Responsive

  

Catholic Charities West Michigan Yes Yes

40 Jefferson SE

Grand Rapids, MI 49503

  

Kelly Austin Yes Yes

302 N Emily

Ludington, MI 49431

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  Department Recommendation for Classes in the Community:  Catholic Charities of West Michigan Name of Buyer: Jamie Burmeister CPPB

  Department Recommendation for Classes in the Jail:  Kelly Austin

Finance Director's Name:  Angela Gasiewski Signature:

  Vendor Awarded: Board Approval Date: Board Motion Number:

100% 100% No Bid $225.00

100% 100% $185.00 No Bid

JailCommunity

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

Vendor Name & Address Comments

Phase I Phase II

Technical Score Combined Score Classes in the Classes in the

Page 1 of 18



Muskegon County Courts & Public Safety Committee
Request for Board Approval

Requestor: Scott Lamiman Committee Date: 2022-01-11

Requesting Department: Community
Corrections/Sheriff's Department

Full Board Date: 2022-01-18

Budget: Budgeted Agenda Number: CPS22/01 - 03

Suggested Motion: (State the following exactly as it should appear in the minutes.)

Move to award Catholic Charities to provide cognitive behavioral services in the community and authorize the
Board Chair to sign the contract for services with the option to renew for two subsequent years depending on
availability of grant funding and mutual agreement of both parties.

Summary of Request: (General description of financing, other operational impact, possible alternatives.)

Community Corrections is seeking to renew the award instruction for cognitive behavioral services in the
community. The program is called Thinking Matters and the recommendation of the award will be to Catholic
Charities for a maximum budgeted amount of $55,500. Funding for this program will be provided by the Office
of Community Corrections in Lansing.

Kristen Wade, HR Director Analysis Required? No Finance Manager:

Michael Homier, Corporate Counsel Analysis Required?
Yes

Mark Eisenbarth, County Administrator Recommendation:
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Commodity Numbers: 47549, 91838, 91865, 91867, 92416, 92435, 92440, 92441, 92442, 92486, 94876, 94886, 95220, 95221, 

95223, 95290, 95685 **Solicitation Statistics** Bonfire Bidnet

Department: Sheriff Department Viewed Documents: 16 12

Proposal:  RFP 22-2440 Release Date: 10/27/2021 Solicitation Received:  2 N/A

Product / Service:  Cognitive Behavioral Intervention Services Opening Date: 11/18/2021 No-Solicit Form Received:  0 N/A

Received Responsive

  

Catholic Charities West Michigan Yes Yes

40 Jefferson SE

Grand Rapids, MI 49503

  

Kelly Austin Yes Yes

302 N Emily

Ludington, MI 49431

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  Department Recommendation for Classes in the Community:  Catholic Charities of West Michigan Name of Buyer: Jamie Burmeister CPPB

  Department Recommendation for Classes in the Jail:  Kelly Austin

Finance Director's Name:  Angela Gasiewski Signature:

  Vendor Awarded: Board Approval Date: Board Motion Number:

100% 100% No Bid $225.00

100% 100% $185.00 No Bid

JailCommunity

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

Vendor Name & Address Comments

Phase I Phase II

Technical Score Combined Score Classes in the Classes in the
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Muskegon County Courts & Public Safety Committee
Request for Board Approval

Requestor: Sandra M. Vanderhyde, Circuit Court
Administrator

Committee Date: 2022-01-11

Requesting Department: Circuit Court Full Board Date: 2022-01-18

Budget: Budgeted Agenda Number: CPS22/01 - 04

Suggested Motion: (State the following exactly as it should appear in the minutes.)

Move to add a fully grant funded hourly Specialty Court Enforcement Officer position, grade NO 2070, with a
salary range of $22.848 to $28.755, to the Circuit Court for Recovery Court.

Summary of Request: (General description of financing, other operational impact, possible alternatives.)

The 14th Circuit Court has operated a Recovery Court since January 2019. It is fully funded by several state
and federal grants. Recovery Court is an intensive supervision probation
program focusing on felony, high risk offenders with drug and/or alcohol addictions.
The new Specialty Court Enforcement Officer (please see attached job description) position will be employed
by Circuit Court. The Specialty Court Enforcement Officer will ensure that the Recovery Court Muskegon
County Courts Specialty Program is operating in full compliance with the grant requirements. The Specialty
Court Enforcement Officer will conduct home visits, locate absconders from the program, provide necessary
transportation, drug test (as needed), process contacts, treatment information and data entry into the Michigan
Drug Court Case Management Information and System (DCCMIS), and will assist the Probation Agents/Case
Managers when sanctions occur.

The hourly Specialty Court Enforcement Officer is a grade NO 270, with a salary range of $22.848 to $28.755.
This is a grant funded position and will be eliminated if/when the grant funds are no longer available. There is
no local match required.

This request would have no impact on the County’s general fund or the Court’s budget as the new position is
fully sustainable with the current federal and state grant funds that Recovery Court receives.

Kristen Wade, HR Director Analysis Required? No Finance Manager:

Michael Homier, Corporate Counsel Analysis Required? No Mark Eisenbarth, County Administrator Recommendation:
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 REQUEST FOR CHIEF JUDGE AUTHORIZATION-COUNTY OF MUSKEGON  
COURT:    

14th Circuit Court 

 
BUDGETED       NON-BUDGETED     PARTIALLY BUDGETED 
    x 

 
REQUESTOR NAME:   

Sandra Vanderhyde 

 
DATE          

12/16/21 

 
REQUESTOR SIGNATURE 

 
 
SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 

 
SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL 
IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 
 
The 14th Circuit Court has operated a Recovery Court since January 2019. It is fully funded by 
several state and federal grants.  Recovery Court is an intensive supervision probation program 
focusing on felony, high risk offenders with drug and/or alcohol addictions.  
 
The new Specialty Court Enforcement Officer (please see attached job description) position will be 
employed by Circuit Court. The Specialty Court Enforcement Officer will ensure that the Recovery 
Court Muskegon County Courts Specialty Program is operating in full compliance with the grant 
requirements. The Specialty Court Enforcement Officer will conduct home visits, locate absconders 
from the program, provide necessary transportation, drug test (as needed), process contacts, 
treatment information and data entry into the Michigan Drug Court Case Management Information 
and System (DCCMIS), and will assist the Probation Agents/Case Managers when sanctions occur. 
The hourly Specialty Court Enforcement Officer is a grade NO 270, with a salary range of $22.848 
to $28.755. This is a grant funded position and will be eliminated if/when the grant funds are no longer 
available. There is no local match required.  
 
This request would have no impact on the County’s general fund or the Court’s budget as the new 
position is fully sustainable with the current federal and state grant funds that Recovery Court 
receives.        
 
 
 
EXECUTIVE ANALYSIS (AS APPLICABLE) 
 
COURT ADMINISTRATOR  RECOMMENDATION: 
           
 
Approved. SV  

 
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
COURT FINANCE & MANAGEMENT ANALYSIS: 
 
 
Approved. JO 
 

 

 
 
CHIEF JUDGE AUTHORIZATION 

Timothy G. Hicks  

 
DATE REVIEWED: 

12/16/2021 

 
COMMENTS: 
 
 
 
 

 
SIGNATURE: 

 
DATE APPROVED: 

12/16/2021 

 
Revised 3/11/19 
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 MUSKEGON COUNTY, MICHIGAN 

 

CLASS TITLE:   SPECIALTY COURT ENFORCEMENT OFFICER 
 
DISTINGUISHING FEATURES OF THE CLASS 

Under the general supervision of Circuit Court Administration, the grant funded Specialty Court Enforcement 
Officer will assist with monitoring and enforcing compliance of program participants. The Specialty Court 
Program Director will work with the Specialty Court Enforcement Officer to ensure that the Muskegon County 
Courts Specialty Program(s) is operating in full compliance with the grant requirements. The Specialty Court 
Enforcement Officer will conduct home visits, locate absconders from the program, provide necessary 
transportation, drug test (as needed), process contacts, treatment information and data entry into the Michigan 
Drug Court Case Management Information and System (DCCMIS), and will assist the Probation Agents/Case 
Managers when sanctions occur. 
 
SUPERVISION RECEIVED 

An employee in this class, under the general supervision of Circuit Court Administration, performs job duties on 
an independent basis and in compliance with established Specialty Court policies and procedures. 
 
SUPERVISION EXERCISED 

Generally none. 
 
TYPICAL EXAMPLES OF WORK PERFORMED 

(The following examples are intended to be descriptive, but not restrictive.) 
 
Locate and find absconders from the Specialty Court Program.  The Specialty Court Enforcement Officer will 

work with Probation Agents, Case Managers and area Law Enforcement to determine previous addresses of 
the offenders, and will utilize any locate information available to gather information on the offender’s 
whereabouts; 

Enter contacts that have been made with participants in DCCMIS (Drug Court Case Management Information 
System). Contacts may include office visits, home visits, or contacts made by phone;  

Enter inpatient and outpatient residential treatment program information into DCCMIS;  
Process Specialty Court Program paperwork, such as processing and relaying warrants from the probation office 

to the assigned Judge’s office for signature;  
Attend court hearings for case staffing hearings, arraignments, probation violation hearings, and sentencings, and 

providing reports and updates regarding participant compliance with programming;  
Locates and transports participants to/from necessary appointments/hearings, as required; 
Completes and maintains accurate documentation in the DCCMIS data system regarding all contacts, arrests, 

violations, and transports; 
Performs drug/alcohol screening on participants, if needed, and attends drug testing appointments at the local 

testing facility; 
Performs other job duties requiring skills, knowledge, and physical requirements as demanded by those duties 

described or less.  
 
EXPERIENCE, TRAINING, KNOWLEDGE AND ABILITIES 

A. Required Experience and Training 
1. Be a high school graduate or have successfully completed the General Educational Development (GED) 

test;  
2. Be certified or currently certifiable as a law enforcement officer following successful completion of the 

training requirements established by the Michigan Commission on Law Enforcement Standards 
(M.C.O.L.E.S.); 

3. Possess a valid Michigan driver’s license. 
 

 
B. Required Knowledge, Skills and Abilities 
 Substantive knowledge of effective law enforcement and arrest techniques; 
 Knowledge of Circuit Court System; 13



SSSPP Enforcement Officer  
Page 2 of 2 
 

 

 Ability to work cooperatively with fellow employees and court personnel 
 Ability to communicate effectively with people in potentially adverse conditions; 
 Ability to make decisions and exercise judgment in accordance with departmental policy; 
 Ability to deal with and defuse hostile clientele; 
 Ability to interpret departmental programs, procedures, and legal requirements; 
 Ability to give and receive written and oral instructions; 
 Ability to function in both solitary as well as team work environments. 
  
 
PHYSICAL ACTIVITIES 

An employee in this class must be in good physical condition, capable of withstanding confrontation with adults. 
The employee may be required to move or lift individuals weighing in excess of 100 pounds. 
 
ENVIRONMENTAL CONDITIONS 

An employee in this class will generally work in both a professional office environment, as well as in a variety of 
settings throughout Muskegon County. Routine travel within Muskegon County is required. 
 
CAREER OPPORTUNITIES 

With additional training and experience, a qualified employee of this class may be considered for promotion to a 
full-time position should a vacancy occur. 
 
 

Approved by _________________________________________                                                                                 
           Sandra Vanderhyde, Circuit Court Administrator  
 

Date _________________________________________                                                                                
 
 

Approved by _________________________________________                                                                                
Kristen Wade, Human Resources Director  

 
Date _________________________________________    
 
 
 
                                                                              

  

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12/21 
NO 270  
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Muskegon County Courts & Public Safety Committee
Request for Board Approval

Requestor: Sandra M. Vanderhyde, Circuit Court
Administrator

Committee Date: 2022-01-11

Requesting Department: Circuit Court Full Board Date: 2022-01-18

Budget: Budgeted Agenda Number: CPS22/01 - 05

Suggested Motion: (State the following exactly as it should appear in the minutes.)

Move to approve the creation of a new hourly Juvenile Transition Center (JTC) Administrative Assistant
position at pay table/grade QU-00173, $16.63/hr -$20.78/hr.

Summary of Request: (General description of financing, other operational impact, possible alternatives.)

The Circuit Court respectfully requests approval of an hourly Juvenile Transition Center (JTC) Administrative
Assistant position. Previously, one Court Services Specialist (CSS) position employee served in this role 20
hours per week, and worked at the Family Court 20 hours per week. After that employee recently resigned, it
was determined that these positions should be separated and changed from 1 FTE- CSS position to 1 CSS
position and an hourly JTC Administrative Assistant position. The funding of the CSS position was changed to
100% IV-D funding and will now fully work at the Family Court. The savings from that funding change, along
with Raise the Age funding, results in a budget neutral new hourly JTC Administrative Assistant position who
will work at the JTC approximately 20 hours per week.

The Juvenile Transition Center (JTC) Administrative Assistant under the general direction of the
Superintendent, performs a variety of secretarial and clerical support for the Superintendent and Juvenile
Transition Center.  An employee in this class will perform the following duties, including but not limited to:
responding to in-person, telephone, and/or electronic requests from public/family members/consumers,
prepares and maintains youth and personnel records, monitors and replenishes office supplies, assists in
licensing compliance, attends meetings and generates meeting minutes as assigned, assists in fiscal record
keeping and coordinates with Family Court Accounting, complies data/generates reports, and performs other
duties as assigned.

The new JTC Administrative Assistant position will be created at pay table/grade QU-00173, $16.63/hr -
$20.78/hr. This request would have no impact on the County’s general fund, as a result of its RTA funding, and
recent funding changes to the above referenced Court Services Specialist position, and increased RTA grant
funding for other positions. Please see details in the attached spreadsheet that shows an overall GF savings of
$28,042.61.

Kristen Wade, HR Director Analysis Required? Yes Finance Manager:

Michael Homier, Corporate Counsel Analysis Required? No Mark Eisenbarth, County Administrator Recommendation:
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 REQUEST FOR CHIEF JUDGE AUTHORIZATION-COUNTY OF MUSKEGON  
COURT:    

14th Circuit Court 

 
BUDGETED       NON-BUDGETED     PARTIALLY BUDGETED 
    x 

 
REQUESTOR NAME:   

Sandra M. Vanderhyde 

 
DATE          

12/20/21 

 

REQUESTOR SIGNATUREs 
Sandra M. Vanderhyde 

 
SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 

 
SUMMARY OF REQUEST (GENERAL DESCRIPTION, FINANCING, OTHER OPERATIONAL 
IMPACT, POSSIBLE ALTERNATIVES) 
 
The Circuit Court respectfully requests approval of an hourly Juvenile Transition Center (JTC) 
Administrative Assistant position. Previously, one Court Services Specialist (CSS) position employee 
served in this role 20 hrs. per week, and worked at the Family Court 20 hrs. per week. After that 
employee recently resigned, it was determined that these positions should be separated and 
changed from 1 FTE- CSS position to 1 CSS position and an hourly JTC Administrative Assistant 
position. The funding of the CSS position was changed to 100% IV-D funding and will now fully work 
at the Family Court. The savings from that funding change, along with Raise the Age funding, results 
in a budget neutral new hourly JTC Administrative Assistant position who will work at the JTC 
approximately 20 hours per week. 
 
The Juvenile Transition Center (JTC) Administrative Assistant under the general direction of the 
Superintendent, performs a variety of secretarial and clerical support for the Superintendent and 
Juvenile Transition Center.  An employee in this class will perform the following duties, including but 
not limited to:  responding to in-person, telephone, and/or electronic requests from public/family 
members/consumers, prepares and maintains youth and personnel records, monitors and 
replenishes office supplies, assists in licensing compliance, attends meetings and generates meeting 
minutes as assigned, assists in fiscal record keeping and coordinates with Family Court Accounting, 
complies data/generates reports, and performs other duties as assigned. 
 
The new JTC Administrative Assistant position will be a QU 173. The salary range is $16.63 to $20.78 
per hour. This request would have no impact on the County’s general fund, as a result of its RTA 
funding, and recent funding changes to the above referenced Court Services Specialist position, and 
increased RTA grant funding for other positions. Please see details in the attached spreadsheet that 
shows an overall GF savings of $28,042.61.     
 
 
 
EXECUTIVE ANALYSIS (AS APPLICABLE) 
 
COURT ADMINISTRATOR  RECOMMENDATION: 
           
 
Approved. SV  
 
 

 
COURT FINANCE & MANAGEMENT ANALYSIS: 
 
 
Approved. JO 
 

 

 
 
CHIEF JUDGE AUTHORIZATION 

Timothy G. Hicks  

 
DATE REVIEWED: 

12/20/2021 

 
COMMENTS: 
 
 
 
 

 
SIGNATURE: 

 
DATE APPROVED: 

12/20/2021 

 
Revised 12/20/21 

16



MUSKEGON COUNTY, MICHIGAN 
 

CLASS TITLE       ADMINISTRATIVE ASSISTANT- JUVENILE TRANSITION CENTER 

 

DISTINGUISHING FEATURES OF THE CLASS 

The Juvenile Transition Center (JTC) Administrative Assistant under the general direction of the Superintendent, 

performs a variety of secretarial and clerical support for the Superintendent and Juvenile Transition Center.  An 

employee in this class will perform the following duties, including but not limited to:  responding to in-person, 

telephone, and/or electronic requests from public/family members/consumers, prepares and maintains youth and 

personnel records, monitors and replenishes office supplies, assists in licensing compliance, attends meetings and 

generates meeting minutes as assigned, assists in fiscal record keeping and coordinates with Family Court 

Accounting, complies data/generates reports, and performs other duties as assigned. 

 

SUPERVISION RECEIVED 

An Administrative Assistant – Juvenile Transition Center, while under the general direction of the Superintendent 

or designee, performs job duties on an independent basis in compliance with established policies and procedures. 

 
TYPICAL EXAMPLES OF WORK PERFORMED 
(The following examples are intended to be descriptive but not restrictive.) 

 

Performs a variety of responsible and complex secretarial support activities for the Juvenile Transition  

   Center; 

General office support to the JTC such as greeting public, responding to requests via in person,  

   telephone or electronic communication; 

Maintaining facility calendars and assist in scheduling appointments; 

Acts as a liaison between the JTC and Family Court Accounting; 

Maintains youth files, personnel records, and other facility documentation for regulatory compliance;  

   assists in file maintenance and retention; 

Operates a variety of office equipment, including but not limited to, computers and related hardware  

   software (including Microsoft Outlook, Word, Excel, PowerPoint, OnBase, AS 400, BizStream) and  

   other related equipment; 

Compiles and abstracts data for special, monthly, and annual reports; 

Reviews and verifies documents, reports, and records for accuracy and conformance to departmental  

   rules, procedures, and regulatory processes; 

Maintains up to date files on correspondence, meeting materials, trainings, and other related reports  

   and records; 

Assists in preparation with regulatory compliance; 

Assists with general office organization, monitoring and ordering office supplies; 

Attends meetings and generates meeting minutes; 

Performs other related duties as assigned. 

 

EXPERIENCE, TRAINING, KNOWLEDGE, SKILLS AND ABILITIES 

A. Required Experience and Training 
1. Possess a Bachelor’s degree from an accredited college or university with a major in Business    
    Administration or closely related field; OR 

      Possess an Associate’s degree from an accredited college or university with a major in Business 
Administration or closely related field; AND  
Have a minimum of one (1) year full time increasingly responsible paid work experience in an account/record 
keeping capacity including direct client interaction and assistance; OR 

        Be a high school graduate or have successfully completed the General Education Development (GED) test; 
AND 
Have a minimum of three (3) years full time increasingly responsible paid work experience in an 
account/record keeping capacity including direct client interaction and assistance. 

 

B. Required Knowledge, Skills and Abilities 

Considerable knowledge of experience in performing a wide variety of confidential secretarial and   

   record keeping activities; 

Considerable knowledge of modern office practices and procedures; 17
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Ability to interpret and describe departmental programs, policies  

   and procedures to officials and the general public; 

Considerable ability to make routine decisions in accordance with departmental policies,  

   procedures, and legal requirements; 

Ability to assume and complete duties and responsibilities on an  

   independent basis; 

Ability to communicate effectively with distressed people under adverse    

   conditions;  

Ability to establish and maintain effective working relationships with supervisors, co-workers, the general 

public, and other state and local agencies; 

Ability to communicate effectively both orally and in writing; 

Ability to operate office equipment. 

 

PHYSICAL ACTIVITIES 

An employee in this class performs generally sedentary work activities requiring the occasional lifting of objects 

weighing thirty-five (35) pounds or less. 

 

ENVIRONMENTAL CONDITIONS 

An employee in this class works within the facility of the Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center as a 

Muskegon County Court employee. 

 

CAREER OPPORTUNITIES 

With sufficient experience and training, a qualified employee may be considered for promotion to a higher-level 

position within the Family Court, should a vacancy occur. 

 

 

     Approved by: 

________________________________________  

       Sandra Vanderhyde, Circuit Court Administrator 

 

Date:   ________________________________________ 

 

 

Approved by: 

       ____________________________________________ 

Kristen N. Wade, Human Resources Director 

 

Date:  ________________________________________ 

 

 

 

 

 

 

12/21 

QF 
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Raise the Age Grant & Adjustments

Salaries and Fringes

   IHC IHC-RTA JTC RTA JTC Res JTC Det LGP PEN DCC DD5 RE1 DIF_ER CombinedIV-D $ IV-D G/F CCF $ CCF G/F CCF RTA Circuit G/F

Total GF 

Impact

Previous GF 

Impact Change GF

ELIG NOT 2150 1010 1010 2920 2920 2920 2920 2920 2920 RTA - G SALARY FICA(FIO) MEDICAL LIFE PENSION RETIRE PEN EXPBEN. OPT.DENTAL RET. BEN. VISION DISABILITY LONG COLA UNEMP.W.C. Non-2150 2150 PASSChild Spt / 66.00% 34.00% 60.00% 40.00% 100.00% 100.00%

POSITION POSITION % FND % FND TOTAL % FND % FND % FND % FND % FND % FND % FND % FND % FND TOTAL 702.000 715.000 716.000 717.000 718.000 718.004 718.006718.010719.010 719.024 719.030 719.040 721.000 722.000 723.000 POSITION POSITION POSITIONPOSITIONIV-D ELIGIBLE

NUMBER INCUMBENT CLASSIFICATION 0142 0149 FUNDING 0131 0132 0152 0153 0659 0660 0662 1427 FUNDING (100%) (100%) (100%) (100%) (100%) (100%) (100%)(100%) (100%) (100%) (100%) (100%) (100%) (100%) TOTAL TOTAL TOTALTOTALBUDGET

Q27309 Green, Kimberly Court Officer FT 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 50.00% 50.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 100% 54,286.40 4,207.68 8,075.76   108.57 4,782.63 1,650.07 2,850.04 723.60   1,650.07 84.60     -         300.00   416.00   165.01   79,300.43   79,300.43 -            0.00 0.00 0.00 15,860.09 39,650.22 0.00 0.00 0.00 15,860.09

Q27308 Bishop, Lori A Court Officer FT 0.00% 80.00% 80.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 20.00% 100% 59,500.57 4,663.95 19,164.24 119.00 5,242.00 -         3,123.78 723.60   -         84.60     -         1,050.00 416.00   182.90   94,270.64   94,270.64 -            0.00 0.00 56,562.38 37,708.26 0.00 0.00 37,708.26 37,708.26 -18,854.13

Q27522 Coon, Angela D Court Services Specialist FT 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 90.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 10.00% 100% 42,323.76 3,334.61 8,075.76   84.65   3,728.72 -         2,222.00 723.60   -         -         -         850.00   416.00   130.77   61,889.87   -            -            0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 55,762.77 61,889.87 -6,188.99

Q27524 France, Danelle M Court Services Specialist FT 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 90.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 10.00% 100% 42,323.76 3,334.61 23,682.96 84.65   3,728.72 -         2,222.00 723.60   -         131.04   -         850.00   416.00   130.77   77,628.11   -            -            0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 77,628.11 69,942.93 69,942.93 -6,994.29

Q27529 Glavich White, Heather K Court Services Specialist FT 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 90.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 10.00% 100% 34,406.17 2,663.90 23,682.96 68.81   3,031.19 1,044.67 1,806.33 723.60   1,044.67 131.04   -         -         416.00   104.47   69,123.81   -            -            0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 69,123.81 62,280.55 62,280.55 -6,228.06

Q27513 Castelo, Cheryl B Court Services Specialist FT 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 75.00% 25.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 100% 42,323.76 3,323.15 23,682.96 84.65   3,728.72 -         2,222.00 723.60   -         131.04   -         700.00   416.00   130.32   77,466.20   77,466.20 -            0.00 0.00 34,859.79 23,239.86 19,366.55 77,466.20 23,239.86 23,239.86 0.00

X14701 ONeil, Jennifer A Circuit Court Finance Manager FT 65.00% 15.00% 80.00% 0.00% 10.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 10.00% 100% 80,993.62 6,315.81 8,075.76   161.99 7,135.53 -         4,252.16 723.60   -         47.04     161.99   1,150.00 416.00   247.68   109,681.18 10,968.12 98,713.06 46,735.70 51,977.36 0.00 0.00 0.00 10,968.12 62,945.48 62,945.45 -10,968.12

-33,373.50

 

  

Q27517 Kline, Sue (new funding) Court Services Specialist FT 100.00% 0.00% 100.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 100% 43,136.39  3,392.95  8,075.77   86.28   3,800.31  -          2,264.66  723.60    -          47.03      -          800.00    416.00    133.07    62,876.06   -             62,876.06  41,498.20  21,377.86  0 -           -           0 21,377.86  24,446.21  -3,068.35

NEW Vacant JTC Administrative Assistant HRLY 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 25.00% 25.00% 50.00% 0.00% 0.00% 100% 25,881.83  2,035.77  -             -       -           -          -           -          -          -          -          -          -          79.84      27,997.44   27,997.44  -             -             -             12598.8498 8,399.23  6,999.36  0 8,399.23    -             8,399.23

-28,042.61Total G/F Impact
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Muskegon County Courts & Public Safety Committee
Request for Board Approval

Requestor: Richard Warner Committee Date: 2022-01-11

Requesting Department: Emergency Services Full Board Date: 2022-01-18

Budget: Partially Budgeted Agenda Number: CPS22/01 - 06

Suggested Motion: (State the following exactly as it should appear in the minutes.)

Move to approve the Sole Source purchase of 10 mobile fingerprint scanners at a cost of $35,174.00. This is
100% grant funded using Homeland Security funding with no cost to the County.

Summary of Request: (General description of financing, other operational impact, possible alternatives.)

Muskegon County Emergency Services requests to waive the Procurement collected quote policy requirement
and requests approval to purchase 10 mobile fingerprint scanners at the cost of $35,174.00.  The FY2022
budget includes $32,400 for these devices. The equipment is 100% grant funded using Homeland Security
funding with no cost to the county. This is a sole source product and pricing is based on the Michigan State
Police contract.

Kristen Wade, HR Director Analysis Required? No Finance Manager:

Michael Homier, Corporate Counsel Analysis Required? No Mark Eisenbarth, County Administrator Recommendation:
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MUSKEGON COUNTY RESOLUTION TO ENSURE ALL CONSTITUTIONAL RIGHTS OF INMATES  

AT THE MUSKEGON COUNTY JAIL 
 
WHEREAS, under the current management and supervision of Muskegon County Sheriff Michael Poulin, several men and 
women have died while in custody; and 
 
WHEREAS, it is additionally costing the Property Owners millions of dollars in wrongful death case settlements, staff 
time and legal fees associated with the Sheriff’s Office in court; and 
 
WHEREAS, county commissioners have made requests for the Sheriff’s policies and operating procedures for jail 
operations and have been denied; and  
 
WHEREAS, the Muskegon County Board of Commissioners have a Sworn Oath to protect the Rights of all citizens; and 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Muskegon County Board of Commissioners reaffirms its commitment to 
the Constitution that guarantees that all people held in the jail are treated humanely, and that includes providing access 
to necessary medical care; and 
 
BE IT RESOLVED, that the Muskegon County Board of Commissioners request through corporate counsel a formal 
request for investigation and policy review by the Michigan Attorney General’s Office, The United States Attorney 
General's Office and the Civil Rights Division of the Department of Justice; and 
 
And further recommend placing the sheriff on administrative leave pending the outcome of the investigation; and 
 
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that a copy of this resolution be duly Subscribed, and transmitted to all locally elected Federal 
and State officials as evidence of this request. 
 

******* 
 
The Muskegon County Board of Commissioners, at its ___________, 2022 meeting recommended approval by 
Commissioner __________________, support by Commissioner __________________, the aforementioned resolution. 

 
Ayes:  
Nayes:  
 
I, Nancy A. Waters, Clerk of the Muskegon County Board of Commissioners and Clerk of the County of Muskegon, do 
hereby certify that the above Resolution was duly adopted by said  
Board on ______________________, 2022. 
 
 
 
           
Nancy A. Waters, Clerk    Date 

County of Muskegon 
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