MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics**
Commodity Numbers: 33500, 33504, 33530,33537,33541, 33560, 33566, 33572, 33575,33578,67500 Received Notice: i
Department: Resource Recovery Center Viewed Documents: 13
Bid: RFB 21-2417 Release Date: 03/05/2017 Solicitation Received: 6
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers Opening Date: 03/22/2021 No-Solicit Form Received: 0
*ALTERNATE*
Vendor Name & Address Received Responsive 750 gal. 750 gal. Comments
Roundup Bucaneer 5
Power Max
Ceres Solutions Cooperative Yes Yes $28.00/ gal. No Bid
4633 W Stoney Corners Rd $21,000.00
McBain MI 49657
Endeavor Ag & Energy Yes Yes $21.99 / gal. No Bid
4645 Washington St $16,492.50
Hamilton MI 49419
Gold Coast Sales LLC Yes Yes No Bid $19.50/ gal
1455 Black Hills South Dr $14,625.00
Kent City MI 49330
Helena Agri-Enterprises Yes Yes $18.67 / gal. No Bid
349 Wilson St $14,002.50
Conklin MI 49403
Nutrient Ag Solutions Yes Yes $19.00/ gal. No Bid
6288 S Greenville Rd $14,250.00
Greenville MI 48838
Wilbur Ellis Company Yes Yes $19.95/ gal. No Bid
277 S Maple Street $14,962.50
Grant MI 48327

Department Recommenda

tion: Ceres Solutions: 0-0-62

Helena Agri-Enterpriese: Roundup, Boundary,
Nutrient Ag Solutions: Mustang Maxx, Drexel AMS, ESN
Wilbur Ellis Company: Acuron, Alfalfa Foiliar, Soybean Foiliar, Corn Starter, 39-0-0-6S, 0-0-30

Vendor Awarded:

various (see list abave)

Board Approval Date: April 8, 2021

Name of Buyer: Jamie Burmeister

Director of Finance/Assistant Coufity Administrator's Name: Beth Dick
Signature: Rl Nep b

BPW21/04-52

Board Motion Number:
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Commodity Numbers: 33500, 33504, 33530,33537,33541, 33560, 33566, 33572, 33575,33578,67500 Received Notice: 77|
Department: Resource Recovery Center Viewed Documents: 13
Bid: RFB 21-2417 Release Date: 03/05/2017 Solicitation Received: 6|
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers Opening Date:  03/22/2021 No-Solicit Form Received: 0
*ALTERNATE* *ALTERNATE* *ALTERNATE* *ALTERNATE*
Vendor Name & Address 175 gal. 175 gal. 175 gal. 1,060 gal. 850 gal. 425 gal.
Boundary 6.5EC MetalliS MTZ Ledger Acuron Evinco Atranzine 4 L
*Assumes 1700 acres corn
Ceres Solutions Cooperative $73.33/ gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4633 W Stoney Corners Rd $12,832.75
McBain M| 49657
Endeavor Ag & Energy $60.53/ gal. No Bid No Bid $54.03/ gal. No Bid No Bid
4645 Washington St $10,592.75 $57,271.80
Hamilton MI 49419
Gold Coast Sales LLC No Bid $49.50/ gal. No Bid No Bid $26.50/ gal. $12.00/ gal.
1455 Black Falls S Dr $8,662.50 $22,525.00 $5,100.00
Kent City MI 49330
Helena Agri-Enterprises $53.10/ gal. No Bid No Bid $44.95/ gal. No Bid No Bid
349 Wilson St $9,292.50 $47,647.00
Conklin MI 49403
Nutrient Ag Solutions $55.00/ gal. No Bid No Bid $44.74 / gal. No Bid No Bid
6288 S Greenville Rd $9,625.00 $47,424.40
Greenville M| 48838
Wilbur Ellis Company No Bid No Bid $56.00/ gal. $44.35/ gal. No Bid No Bid
277 S Maple Street $9,800.00 $47,011.00
Grant MI 49327
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics**

Commodity Numbers: 33500, 33504, 33530,33537,33541, 33560, 33566, 33572, 33575,33578,67500 Received Notice: 77
Department: Resource Recovery Center Viewed Documents: 13|
Bid: RFB 21-2417 Release Date: 03/05/2017 Solicitation Received: 6
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers Opening Date: 03/22/2021 No-Solicit Form Received: 0
*ALTERNATE* *ALTERNATE* *ALTERNATE*
Vendor Name & Address 180 gal. 250 gal. 250 gal. 265 gal. 250 gal.
Mustang Maxx Bronc Max Jack Hammer Drexel AMS Xtra Gardian Plus

(Insecticide)

Ceres Solutions Cooperative $170.00/ gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4633 W Stoney Corners Rd $30,600.00
McBain MI 49657

Endeavor Ag & Energy $88.82/ gal. No Bid $31.76 / gal. No Bid No Bid
4645 Washington St $15,987.60 $7,940.00
Hamilton MI 49419

Gold Coast Sales LLC $101.50/ gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.44 / gal.
1455 Black Falls S Dr $18,270.00 $1,860.00
Kent City MI 49330

Helena Agri-Enterprises $88.67 / gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
349 Wilson St $15,960.60
Conklin MI 49403

Nutrient Ag Solutions $75.08/ gal. No Bid No Bid $7.00/ gal. No Bid
6288 S Greenville Rd $13,514.40 $1,855.00
Greenville MI 48838

Wilbur Ellis Company $97.10/ gal. $11.00/ gal. No Bid No Bid No Bid
277 S Maple Street $17,478.00 $2,750.00
Grant M| 49327
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics*™*

Commodity Numbers: 33500, 33504, 33530,33537,33541, 33560, 33566, 33572, 33575,33578,67500 Received Notice: 77
Department: Resource Recovery Center Viewed Documents: 13|
Bid: RFB 21-2417 Release Date: 03/05/2017 Solicitation Received: 6
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers Opening Date:  03/22/2021 No-Solicit Form Received: 0
*ALTERNATE* *ALTERNATE*
Vendor Name & Address 3,500 gal. 1,750 gal. 784 gal. 400 gal. 16,956 gal. 268 Tons
Alfalfa Foliar Cell Power Lucky 13 Soybean Foliar CoatTail by Omex Corn Starter 0-0-62
Fertilizer Fertilizer Fertilizer Fertilizer
Ceres Solutions Cooperative No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $335.00/tn
4633 W Stoney Corners Rd $89,780.00

McBain MI 49657

Endeavor Ag & Energy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $431.00/tn
4645 Washington St $115,508.00
Hamilton MI 49419

Gold Coast Sales LLC No Bid $24.27 / gal. No Bid $24.27 / gal. No Bid No Bid
1455 Black Falls S Dr $42,472.50 $9,708.00
Kent City MI 49330

Helena Agri-Enterprises No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $430.00/tn
349 Wilson St $115,240.00
Conklin Ml 49403

Nutrient Ag Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.48 / gal, $381.00/tn

6288 S Greenville Rd $42,050.88 $102,108.00
Greenville MI 48838

Wilbur Ellis Company $6.75/ gal No Bid $8.15/ gal. No Bid $2.19/ gal. $356.00 /tn

277 S Maple Street $23,625.00 $6,389.60 $37,133.64 $95,408.00
Grant MI 49327
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

*Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™*

Commodity Numbers: 33500, 33504, 33530,33537,33541, 33560, 33566, 33572, 33575,33578,67500 Received Notice: 77
Department: Resource Recovery Center Viewed Documents: 13
Bid: RFB 21-2417 Release Date: 03/05/2017 Solicitation Received: 6
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers Opening Date:  03/22/2021 No-Solicit Form Received: 0
*ALTERNATE* *ALTERNATE* *ALTERNATE* 116.5 Tons
Vendor Name & Address 88 Tons Urea Treated 113 Tons Urea, AMS with Urea & Ammonium 0-0-30
ESN with N-Edge 2 39-0-0-6S N-Edge 2 Sulfate treated w/ Alfalfa Starter
Fertilizer Fertilizer Nitrain Express 2.0 Fertilizer
Ceres Solutions Cooperative No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $310.00/tn
4633 W Stoney Corners Rd $36,115.00
McBain MI 49657
Endeavor Ag & Energy No Bid $635.82/tn No Bid $564.00 / tn No Bid $362.60/tn
4645 Washington St $55,952.16 $63,732.00 $42,242.90
Hamilton MI 49419
Gold Coast Sales LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1455 Black Falls S Dr
Kent City MI 49330
Helena Agri-Enterprises No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $305.50/ tn
349 Wilson St $35,590.75
Conklin MI 49403
Nutrient Ag Solutions $606.00/ tn No Bid No Bid No Bid $478.75 / tn $301.20/tn
6288 S Greenville Rd $53,328.00 $54,098.75 $35,089.80
Greenville MI 48838
Wilbur Ellis Company $634.00/tn No Bid $557.00/tn No Bid No Bid $293.00/tn
277 S Maple Street $55,792.00 $62,941.00 $34,134.50
Grant Ml 49327
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