MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Commodity Numbers: 22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 80318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984 Received Notice: 181
Department: Muskegon County Courts Viewed Documents: 51
Proposal: RFB 21-2397 Release Date: 03/02/2021 Solicitation Received: 4
Product / Service: Court Technology Solution Opening Date: 03/26/2021 No-Solicit Form Received: 3
Phase 1 Phase 2 Phase 3 Total Total Total Estimated
Vendor Name & Address Received |Responsive| Technical Pricing Demonstration Courtroom Technology | Optional Enhancements Annual Maintenance
Score Score Short List Scores Solution
Business Information Systems Yes Yes 79.0 90.0% 91.0% $868,534.01 $0.00 $63,720.29

1350 NE 56th St Ste 300 Fort
Lauderdale FL 33334

Buist Electric Yes Yes 12.0 26.8% N/A $882,772.00 No Bid $12,960.00
2-84th St
Byron Center M| 49315

Justice AV Solutions Inc Yes Yes 50.0 59.4% 60.4% $929,033.33 $1,013,462.49 $139,355.00
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223

Maylor & Company Inc Yes Yes 18.0 22.4% N/A No Bid $150,000.00 $150,000.00
667 Madiston Ave 5th F| [Incomplete] [Incomplete]
New York NY 10065

No Bids Received From:

Nomad Technologies Company schedule is unable to meet specifications. Insufficient time to respond.
Smart Offices Company Approach would not match the Statement of Work.
Tel Systems Unable to bid at this time.
Department Recommendation: Business Information System Name of Buyer: Jamie Burmeister

A /
Vendorawarded: B i nesS Tafopal o) System S Judge Approval Date: W’M/l—-
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Commodity Numbers: 22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 80318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984

Proposal: RFB 21-2397

Product / Service: Court Technology Solution

MUSKEGON COUNTY EID SUMMARY

Department: Muskegon County Courts

Release Date:
Opening Date:

03/02/2021
03/26/2021

~*Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Received Notice:

181

Viewed Documents:

51

Solicitation Received:

4

No-Solicit Form Received:

3

TOTAL COST FOR BASIC COURTROOM TECHNOLOGY SOLUTION, BY COURTROOM

Vendor Name & Address District Court District Court District Court District Court District Court District Court
Courtroom #1 Courtroom #2 Courtroom #3 Courtroom #4 Courtroom #5 Hearing Room 114

Business Information Systems $82,126.35 $82,126.35 $82,126.35 $85,287.60 $28,233.73 $17,783.92
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300
Fort Lauderdale FL 33334
Buist Electric $58,935.00 $58,935.00 $58,935.00 $58,935.00 $58,935.00 $58,230.00
2-84th St
Byron Center M| 49315
Justice AV Solutions Inc $75,707.07 $75,707.07 $75,707.07 $75,707.07 $33,610.28 $32,968.09
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223
Maylor & Company Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

667 Madiston Ave Sth Fl
New York NY 10065
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Commodity Numbers:

Proposal: RFB 21-2397

Product / Service: Court Technology Solution

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 80318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984

Department: Muskegon County Courts

Release Date:
Opening Date:

03/02/2021
03/26/2021

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Received Notice: 181
Viewed Documents: 51
Solicitation Received: 4
No-Solicit Form Received: 3

TOTAL COST FOR BASIC COURTROOM TECHNOLOGY SOLUTION, BY COURTROOM

Vendor Name & Address Circuit/Family Court Circuit/Family Court Circuit Court Circuit Court Circuit/Family Court Circuit Court
Large Hearing Room Small Hearing Room Courtroom A Courtroom B Courtroom C Courtroom D

Business Information Systems $17,082.65 $21,958.82 $82,824.35 $82,824.35 $82,824.35 $82,824.35
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300
Fort Lauderdale FL 33334
Buist Electric $58,230.00 $58,230.00 $58,935.00 $58,935.00 $58,935.00 $58,935.00
2-84th St
Byron Center MI 49315
Justice AV Solutions Inc $33,610.28 $32,325.90 $71,119.69 $89,169.70 $71,119.69 $71,119.69
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223
Maylor & Company Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

667 Madiston Ave Sth FI
New York NY 10065
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™
Received Notice: 181
Viewed Documents: 51

Commodity Numbers: 22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 30318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984
Department: Muskegon County Courts

Release Date:  03/02/2021 Solicitation Received:

Opening Date:  03/26/2021

Proposal: RFB 21-2397
Product / Service: Court Technology Solution

No-Solicit Form Received: 3

TOTAL COST FOR BASIC COURTROOM TECHNOLOGY SOLUTION, BY COURTROOM

Vendor Name & Address

Probate/Family Court

Probate/Family Court

Probate/Family Court

Presentation / Media

Hearing Room Courtroom 520 Courtroom 504 Cart
Business Information Systems $22,581.82 $34,947.72 $34,947.72 $28,033.58
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300
Fort Lauderdale FL 33334
Buist Electric $58,230.00 $58,935.00 $58,935.00 $1,567.00
2-84th St
Byron Center MI 49315
Justice AV Solutions Inc $32,325.90 $74,419.69 $74,419.69 $9,996.45
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223
Maylor & Company Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

667 Madiston Ave 5th FI
New York NY 10065
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Commodity Numbers: 22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 80318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984 Received Notice: 181
Department: Muskegon County Courts Viewed Documents: 51
Proposal: RFB 21-2397 Release Date:  03/02/2021 Solicitation Received: 4
Product / Service: Court Technology Solution Opening Date:  03/26/2021 No-Solicit Form Received: 3
TOTAL COST INCLUDING OPTIONAL ENHANCEMENTS, BY COURTROOM
Vendor Name & Address District Court District Court District Court District Court District Court District Court
Courtroom #1 Courtroom #2 Courtroom #3 Courtroom #4 Courtroom #5 Hearing Room 114
Business Information Systems $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300 Included Included Included Included Included Included

Fort Lauderdale FL 33334

Buist Electric No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-84th St
Byron Center MI 49315

Justice AV Solutions Inc $78,598.62 $78,598.62 $78,598.62 $78,598.62 $34,086.47 $33,444.28
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223

Maylor & Company Inc $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
667 Madiston Ave 5th Fl
New York NY 10065
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

“*Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Commodity Numbers: 22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 0318, 83892, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984 Received Notice: 181
Department: Muskegon County Courts Viewed Documents: 51
Proposal: RFB 21-2397 . Release Date:  03/02/2021 Solicitation Received: 4
Product / Service: Court Technology Solution Opening Date:  03/26/2021 No-Solicit Form.Received: 3
TOTAL COST INCLUDING OPTIONAL ENHANCEMENTS, BY COURTROOM
Vendor Name & Address Circuit/Family Court Circuit/Family Court Circuit Court Circuit Court Circuit/Family Court Circuit Court
Large Hearing Room Small Hearing Room Courtroom A Courtroom B Courtroom C Courtroom D
Business Information Systems $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300 Included Included Included Included Included Included

Fort Lauderdale FL 33334

Buist Electric No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-84th St
Byron Center M149315

Justice AV Solutions Inc $34,086.47 $32,802.09 $79,113.41 $119,683.11 $79,113.41 $79,113.41
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223

Maylor & Company Inc $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
667 Madiston Ave Sth FI
New York NY 10065
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Commodity Numbers: 22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 80318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984 Received Notice: 181
Department: Muskegon County Courts Viewed Documents: 51
Proposal: RFB 21-2397 Release Date:  03/02/2021 Solicitation Received: 4
Product / Service: Court Technology Solution Opening Date: 03/26/2021 No-Solicit Form Received: 3
TOTAL COST INCLUDING OPTIONAL ENHANCEMENTS, BY COURTROOM
Vendor Name & Address Probate/Family Court Probate/Family Court Probate/Family Court Presentation / Media
Hearing Room Courtroom 520 Courtroom 504 Cart
Business Information Systems $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300 Included Included Included Included

Fort Lauderdale FL 33334

Buist Electric No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-84th St
Byron Center MI 49315

Justice AV Solutions Inc $32,802.09 $82,413.41 $82,413.41 $9,996.45
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223

Maylor & Company Inc $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 [Not Provided]
667 Madiston Ave 5Sth Fl
New York NY 10065
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Commodity Numbers: 22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 30318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984

Proposal: RFB 21-2397

Product / Service: Court Technology Solution

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

Department: Muskegon County Courts

Release Date:
Opening Date:

03/02/2021
03/26/2021

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Received Notice: 181
Viewed Documents: 51
Solicitation Received: 4
No-Solicit Form Received: 3

TOTAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL MAINTENANCE COST, BY COURTROOM

Vendor Name & Address District Court District Court District Court District Court District Court District Court
Courtroom #1 Courtroom #2 Courtroom #3 Courtroom #4 Courtroom #5 Hearing Room 114

Business Information Systems $5,623.05 $5,623.05 $5,623.05 $5,893.05 $2,366.14 $1,705.93
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300
Fort Lauderdale FL 33334
Buist Electric $810.00 $810.00 $810.00 $810.00 $810.00 $810.00
2-84th St
Byron Center MI 49315
Justice AV Solutions Inc $11,356.00 $11,356.00 $11,356.00 $11,356.00 $5,042.00 $4,845.00
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223
Maylor & Company Inc $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

667 Madiston Ave 5th Fl
New York NY 10065
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Commodity Numbers:

Proposal: RFB 21-2397

Product / Service: Court Technology Solution

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, 80318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984

Department: Muskegon County Courts

Release Date:
Opening Date:

03/02/2021
03/26/2021

~Bid Net Solicitation Statistics*™

Received Notice: 181
Viewed Documents: 51
Solicitation Received: 4
No-Solicit Form Received: 3

TOTAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL MAINTENANCE COST, BY COURTROOM

Vendor Name & Address Circuit/Family Court Circuit/Family Court Circuit Court Circuit Court Circuit/Family Court Circuit Court
Large Hearing Room Small Hearing Room Courtroom A Courtroom B Courtroom C Courtroom D

Business Information Systems $1,666.31 $1,893.01 $5,856.38 $5,856.38 $5,856.38 $5,856.38
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300
Fort Lauderdale FL 33334
Buist Electric $810.00 $810.00 $810.00 $810.00 $810.00 $810.00
2-84th St
Byron Center M| 49315
Justice AV Solutions Inc $5,042.00 $4,849.00 $10,668.00 $11,275.00 $10,668.00 $10,668.00
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223
Maylor & Company Inc $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

667 Madiston Ave Sth Fl
New York NY 10065
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MUSKEGON COUNTY EID SUMMARY

Commodity Numbers: 22061, 60049, 71560, 73090, 80300, £0318, 83992, 84014, 84055, 84056, 84067, 9397, 93984

Department: Muskegon County Courts
Release Date:  03/02/2021
Opening Date:  03/26/2021

Proposal: RFB 21-2397
Product / Service: Court Technology Solution

**Bid Net Solicitation Statistics™

Received Notice: 181
Viewed Documents: 51
Solicitation Received: 4
No-Solicit Form Received: 3

TOTAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL MAINTENANCE COST, BY COURTROOM

Vendor Name & Address

Probate/Family Court

Probate/Family Court

Probate/Family Court

Presentation / Media

Hearing Room Courtroom 520 Courtroom 504 Cart
Business Information Systems $1,893.01 $2,877.95 $2,877.95 $2,252.27
1350 NE 56th St Ste 300
Fort Lauderdale FL 33334
Buist Electric $810.00 $810.00 $810.00 $810.00
2-84th St
Byron Center M| 49315
Justice AV Solutions Inc $4,849.00 $11,163.00 $11,163.00 $3,599.00
13020 Middletown Industrial Blvd
Lousiville KY 40223
Maylor & Company Inc $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 [Not Provided]

667 Madiston Ave 5th FI
New York NY 10065
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