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Commodity Numbers: 206-£1;600-82;840-10;-27;-58;-60 Vendors Received Notico: 170 

Department: Sheriff Department • Jail Vendors Accossod Att3dlmonts: 41 

Bid: RFB 15-2174 Release Date: 02120/15 Bids Received: 6 

Product I Seivice: Electronic Equipment Opening Date: 03/09/15 No-Bld Fonn Rocoivod: 2 

21.S" LED Monitor Desktop Computer Paper Sh redder 32" Flat Panel LED Tv. TV Mo unting Bracket 

Vendor Name & Address B lack Comparable to Black Comparable to 14 Sheet M icro.Cut Bk Black Comparable to Full Sw ing Wall Mount Bk Comments 

ACER Model# B226HQL (31) DELL Optiplcx 9020 Series (6) Comp. to FELLOWS Modcl#225Mi (1) LG Model#32LNS03B (8) Comp. to GABOR Moclcl#FSM-1737 (8) 

B & H Fote & Electronics Corp 

420 Ninth Ave 

New York. NY 10001 Withdrawn Withdrawn Withdrawn Withdrawn Withdrawn 

Howard Technology Solutions $183.00 $983.00 

P.O. Box 1590 Equivalent Equivalent 
L:aurel. MS 39441 $5,673.00 SS.898.00 $ 1,109.00 No Bid No Bid 

Micro Wise Inc. $155.00 $805.00 $290.00 $44.00 

21421 Hilltop Unit #4 Equivalent Equivalent Equivalent Equivalent 

Southfield, Ml 48033 $4,805.00 $4,830.00 $1,026.00 S2.320.00 $352.00 

Tel Systems $184.00 $951 .00 $351.00 $78.00 

7235 Jackson Rd Equivalent Equivalent Equivalent Equivalent 

Ann Amor, Ml 48103 $5,704.00 $5,706.00 $918.00 $2,808.00 $624.00 

Alternate Brand-SAMSUNG Alternate Brand-SAMSUNG Alternate B rand-SAMSUNG 

Trivalent Group $195.48 $741.04 $503.76 $1 10.67 

3145 Prairie St SW Equivalent Equivalent Equivalent Equivalent 

Grandville, Ml 49418 $6,059.88 $4.446.24 $887.73 $4,030.08 $885.36 

Troxell Communications $141.00 $719.00 $315.00 $44.00 

51194 Romeo Plank #632 Equivalent Equivalent Equivalent Equivalent 

Macomb, Ml 48042 $4,371 .00 $4.314.00 $978.00 $2520.00" $352.00 

Estimated Cost: $38,169.00 

Advertisement in Muskegon Chroniele 

TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS Accounting Manager: Dwight Avery Signature: tJ~~A 
Department Recommendation: Name of Buyer: Lori Hayes 

PU 
Vendo r Awarded : Board Approval Date: Purchase Order Number: 
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Commodity Numbers: 206-61;600-82;840-10;-27;-58;-60 

Department: Sheriff Department - Jail 

Bld: RFB 15-2174 Release Date: 02/20/15 

Product I Service: Electronic Equipment Opening Date: 03109/15 

50" Flat Panel LEDnv TV Mounting Blaket 

Vendor Name & Address Black Comparable to Full Swing Wall Mount Bk Grand Total Comments 

LG Model#49L85550 (31) Comp. to GABOR Model#FSM-3760 (31) 

B & H Fote & Electronics Corp 

420 Ninth Ave Cannot Install TV's and TV Mounts 

New York, NY 10001 Withdrawn Withdrawn WITHDRAWN 

Howard Technology Solutions Acticipated Delivery Date: 10-14 ARO 

P.O. Box 1590 Terms: Net 30 

Laurel, MS 39441 No Bid No Bid $12,680.00 NO INSTALLATION ADDENDUM 

Micro Wise Inc. $490.00 $68.00 Acticipated Delivery Date: 2 weeks ARO 

21421 Hilltop Unit #4 Equivalent Equivalent Terms: Net 30 

Southfield, Ml 48033 $15,190.00 $2,108.00 $30,631.00 INST ALLA TJON NOT INCLUDED !N QUOTE 

Te! Systems $1,276.00 $236.00 Acticipated Delivery Date: None 

7235 Jackson Rd Equivalent Equivalent Terms: None 

Ann Arbor, Ml 48103 $39,556.00 $7,316.00 $62,632.00 NO INSTALLATION ADDENDUM 

Alternate Brand-SAMSUNG Alternate Brand-SAMSUNG 

Trivalent Group $763.82 $67.19 Acticipated Delivery Date: 7-10 ARO 

3145 Prairie St SW Equivalent Equivalent Terms: Net 30 

Grandville, Ml 49418 $23,678.42 $2,082.89 $42,070.60 INSTALLATION NOT INCLUDED !N QUOTE 
. 

Troxel! Communications $536.00 $68.00 Acticipated Delivery Date: 3/20-4f7/15 

51194 Romeo Plank #632 Equivalent Equivalent Terms: Net 30 

Macomb, Ml 48042 $16,616.00 $2,108.00 $31,259.00 •Pricing Includes $69.00 Install Charge 


