
Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Proposal Received 

Yes 

Yes 

Yes 

Yes 

Department Recommendation: Enterprise Fleet Management 

MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Department: Administration Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

**MITN Solicitation Statistics** 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Scoring Pricing Total for one of each Vehicle Type listed in RFP 

Vehicle Cost Monthly Lease Monthly Maintenance Monthly Payment 

54.0% $669,689.00 $10,095.00 $840.00 $10,935.00 

73.0% $456,250.00 $8,660.94 $880.74 $9,541.68 

57.3% $518,033.85 $8,914.66 $954.48 $9,869.14 

40.3% $653,37 4.00 $9,590.00 $1,300.00 $10,890.00 

Name of Buyer: Jamie Burmeister 

Director of Finance/Assistant County Administrato~s Name: Beth Dick Signature: l{p9;t;-J.:J~L 

Vendor Awarded: Board Approval Date: Board Motion Number 

122 

20 

4 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 4831 0 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

$27,281.00 

$29,194.00 

No Bid 

Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Ford F-350 

No Bid No Bid 

$517.90 $50.09 

$502.34 $47.16 

No Bid No Bid 

1 Ton Pickup Ext. 4x4 

Monthly I Vehicle 

Payment Cost 

No Bid $37,739.00 

$567.991No Bid 

$549.501No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

GMC Sierra 3500 

$565.00 $40.00 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

""MITN Solicitation Statistics"" 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product 1 Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights M148310 

Vehicle 

Cost 

$34,001.00 

$24,535.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

I Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Maint. 

Ram 3500 

$510.00 $40.00 

$467.63 $50.09 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

Moothly 

Payment 

Vehicle 

Cost 

$550.001No Bid 

$517.721No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid $41,340.00 

1 Ton Pickup Reg. 4x4 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet Silverado 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

$624.00 I $65.oo 

Release Date: 12101/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$26,983.00 

$689.001No Bid 

"'*MITN Solicitation Statistics** 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. I 
Monthly 

Payment 

Ford F-350 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$464.29 $47.16 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

12 

20 

4 
( 
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Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasinq & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address Vehicle 

I 
Monthly 

I Cost Lease 

MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Department: Administration 

Monthly 

I 
Monthly 

Maint. Payment 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

OpeningDate: 12/20/2016 

Monthly Vehicle 

Payment Cost 

Ram Promaster 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 031 06 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml48310 

No Bid 

$21,034.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

I No Bid I No Bid 

$405.54 $46.17 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

I No Bid INo Bid No Bid $35,463.00 

$451.711No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid $25,791.92 $443.80 $48.12 $491.921No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

I 
Monthly 

Lease 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

I 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Monthly 

Maint. 

$40.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

122 

20 

4' 

c 

' 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

1 Ton Cargo Van 

Vehicle 

I 
Monthly 

I 
Monthly 

Cost Lease Maint. 

Ram 3500 

No Bid I No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid No Bid 

$33,720.001 $497.00 $65.00 

I Mom'• I Vehicle 

Payment Cost 

I No Bid INo Bid 

No Bid $18,178.00 

No Bid No Bid 

$562.001No Bid 

I 
Monthly 

I 
Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Dodge Ram 1500 

I No Bid 

$347.30 $39.67 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

I 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

1/2 Ton Pickup Reg. 4x2 

Monthly Vehicle 

Payment Cost 

No Bid $26,696.00 

$386.971No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid $34,454.00 

I 
Monthly 

I Lease 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$509.00 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Monthly 

Maint. 

$40.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$65.00 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

122 

20 

4 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$20,232.00 

No Bid 

1/2 Ton Pickup Reg 4x2 

I Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Maint. 

Ford F-150 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

$348.13 $47.16 

No Bid No Bid 

Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$395.291No Bid 

No Bid $29,336.00 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet Silverado 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

$424.00 I $65.00 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

1/2 Ton Pickup Ext. 4x2 

I Monthly I Vehicle I 
Payment Cost 

No Bid $32,496.00 

No Bid $20,145.00 

No Bid No Bid 

$489.00INo Bid 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. I 
Monthly 

Payment 

Ram 1500 

$490.00 $40.00 

$386.07 $39.67 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

12 

20 

4 

0 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

St Louis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Vehicle 

Cost 

1/2 Ton Pickup Ext. 4x2 

I Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Main!. 

Ford F-150 

Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid I No Bid I No Bid INo Bid 

No Bid INc Bid INc Bid INc Bid 

$24,743.001 $425.751 $47.161 $472.91 

No Bid INc Bid I No Bid INc Bid 

Vehicle 

Cost I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Main!. 

Ford F-150 

$32,433.001 $485.001 $40.00 

No Bid INc Bid INc Bid 

$24,820.001 $427.551 $47.16 

$28,426.001 $409.001 $65.00 

Release Date: 12101/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

1/2 Ton Pickup Ext. 4x4 

I Monthly I Vehicle I 
Payment Cost 

$525.001No Bid 

No Bid $21,877.00 

$474.711No Bid 

$474.001No Bid 

,.,.MITN Solicitation Statistics"'"' 

Vendors Received Notice: 122 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 20 

Proposals Received: 41 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Main!. I 
Monthly 

Payment 

Ram 1500 -
No Bid No Bid No Bid I I, 

$420.22 $42.62 ~"t 
No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasinq & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Vehicle 

Cost 

$28,192.00 

$19,251.00 

No Bid 

$33,060.00 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Ram 1500 

$42o.oo I $40.oo 

$371.471 $42.62 

No Bid INc Bid 

$486.00 I $65.00 

1/2 Ton Pickup Reg 4x4 

I Monthly I Vehicle I 
Payment Cost 

$460.001No Bid 

$414.091No Bid 

No Bid $22,211.00 

$551.001No Bid 

Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Ford F-150 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

$382.191 $47.16 

No Bid INc Bid 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$429.35 

No Bid 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

$25,850.00 

$27,884.00 

$41,871.00 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

3/4 Ton Pickup Ext. 4x4 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Ford F-250 

No Bid I No Bid 

$492.041 $43.59 

$479.801 $47.16 

$633.00 I $65.00 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

122 

20 

4 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

"'MITN Solicitation Statistics"' 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Vehicle 

Cost 

$34,805.00 

No Bid 

3/4 Ton Pickup Ext. 4x4 

I Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Maint. 

Ram 2500 

$520.00 $40.00 

No Bid No Bid 

Monthly 

Payment 

Vehicle 

Cost 

$560.001No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Ford F-250 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

~enin~t_ Date: 12/20/2016 

3/4 Ton Pickup Reg. 4x4 

I Monthly I Vehicle I 
Payment Cost 

No Bid $32,148.00 

No Bid $22.684.00 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. I Monthly 

Payment 

Ram 2500 

$480.00 $40.00 

$434.35 $43.59 

p Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,673.00 $441.76 $47.16 $488.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $441.76 $47.16 $488.921No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No No Bid $25.673.00 No Bid No Bid 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

I Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services INc Bid !No Bid !No Bid !No Bid INo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

12 

2C 

~ 

c 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 031 06 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml48310 

3/4 Ton Pikcup Reg 4x4 

Vehicle I Monthly I Monthly I 
Cost Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet CK25903 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$32,815.00 $482.00 $65.00 

Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$29,269.00 

$547.001No Bid 

I Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Ford F-250 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

$503.621 $47.16 

No Bid I No Bid 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

3/4 Ton 4-Door 4x4 

I 
Monthly I Vehicle 

Payment Cost 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

$550.781No Bid 

No Bid $34,582.00 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

I 
Monthly I Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. Payment 

Chevrolet Silverado 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$511.00 $65.00 

122 

20 

4 

0 

I 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leas in 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Department: Administration 

& Management Program 

3/4 Ton 4-Door 4x4 

Vehicle I Monthly I Monthly I 
Cost Lease Maint. 

Dodge Ram 2500 

$34,805.00 $520.00 $40.00 

$26,462.00 $508.45 $43.59 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Monthly 

Payment 

Vehicle 

Cost 

$560.001 $32,509.00 

$552.041 $20,765.00 

No Bid $22,201.00 

No Bid $30,640.00 

1/2 Ton Cargo Van 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Ford Transit 150 

$490.00 $40.00 

$397.53 $39.67 

$382.01 $48.12 

$446.00 $65.00 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

Vehicle 

Cost 

$530.001 $30,585.00 

$437.201No Bid 

$430.131No Bid 

$511.001No Bid 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Fonm Received: 

Compact Pickup Ext. 4x4 

I Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Maint. 

Nissan Frontier 

$465.00 $40.00 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

122 

20 

4 

c 

I 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Vehicle 

Cost 

Bid 

$27 

Department: Administration 

Compact Pickup Ext. 4x4 

I 
Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet Colorado 

No Bid Bid 

$461.25 $41.08 

$469.33 $47.16 

$522.00 $65.00 

Monthly 

Payment 

Vehicle 

Cost 

Bid 

:i>t>U;<.;;;;INO Bid 

Bid 

Compact Pickup Reg 4x2 

I 
Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet 12M53 Colorado 

No Bid No Bid 

Bid 

Bid 

$65.00 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Date: 12/20/2016 

Monthly 

Payment 

Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$511 

Vehicle 

Cost 

$30.451.00 

Compact Pickup Ext. 4x2 

I 
Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet Colorado 

$465.00 

$38.33 

$47.16 

$65.00 

Page 12 of 20 



Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 031 06 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Compact 

Pickup 

Reg 

4x4 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

$12,809.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

I 

MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Department: Administration 

Compact Sedan 

Monthly 

I 
Monthly I Monthly I Vehicle 

Lease Maint. Payment Cost 

No Bid 

$238.98 $38.33 $277.311No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,125.00 

Monthly 

Lease 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

Monthly 

Maint. 

Monthly 

Payment 

Chevrolet Cruze 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$370.00 $65.00 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 
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Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 031 06 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Vehicle 

I 
Monthly 

Cost Lease 

$20,915.001 $320.00 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

I 

MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Department: Administration 

Compact Sedan 

Monthly 

I 
Monthly Vehicle 

I Maint. Payment Cost 

$360.00 No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid $17,133.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Monthly 

I 
Monthly 

I Lease Maint. 

No Bid No Bid 

$294.81 $36.00 

No Bid No Bid 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

Monthly Vehicle 

Payment Cost 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid $16,201.00 

$330.811No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

I 

**MITN Solicitation Statistics"''" 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Compact SUV 4x4 

Monthly 

I 
Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Jeep Patriot 

No Bid I No Bid 

$305.48 $41.08 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

12 

20 

4 

c 
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Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address Vehicle 

Cost I 
Monthly 

Lease 

MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Department: Administration 

I 
Monthly I 
Maint. 

Compact SUV 4x4 

Monthly 

Payment 

Vehicle 

Cost 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

Vehicle 

Cost 

Ford Escape 
I 

Monthly I Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. Payment 

Chevrolet Equinox 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

$29,503.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$30,670.00 

$450.00 $40.00 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

$446.00 $65.00 

$490.001No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid $22,930.57 $394.57 $34.32 $428.891 $39,991.00 

$511.001No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

**MITN Sol"lcitation Statistics** 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Full Size SUV 4x4 

I 
Monthly I Monthly I 
Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet Tahoe -Alternate 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

$688.13 $47.16 

No Bid No Bid 

Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$735.291, 

No Bid 

12 

20 

4 
( 
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Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address Vehicle 

I 
Monthly 

I Cost Lease 

MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Department: Administration 

Full-8ize SUV 4x4 

Monthly 

I 
Monthly Vehicle 

I Maint. Payment Cost 

Monthly 

I 
Monthly 

I Lease Maint. 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12120/2016 

Monthly Vehicle 

Payment Cost I 
Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

$43,527.001 $655.00 $695.00 No Bid No Bid $26,848.001 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

No Bid !No Bid !No Bid 

$33,476.001 $576.021 $47.16 

No Bid !No Bid !No Bid 

No Bid $31,024.00 $584.07 $42.62 $626.691 $20,469.00 

$623.181No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20,674.00 

No Bid $36,900.001 $ 550.00 I $ 65.00 I $ 615.00 INo Bid 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Full-Size Sedan 

Monthly 

I 
Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Ford Taurus 

$405.001 $40.00 

$386.49 $38.33 

$356.13 $37.32 

No Bid No Bid 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

122 

20 

4! 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12120/2016 Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 4831 0 

Full Size Sedan 

Vehicle I Monthly I Monthly I 
Cost Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet Impala 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$28, 189.ool $ 405.oo I $ 65.oo I $ 47o.oo 

Full-5ize Van-Passenger 

Vehicle I Monthly I Monthly 

Cost Lease Maint. I Monthly I Vehicle I 
Payment Cost 

Chevrolet Express 2500 Series 

No Bid I No Bid No Bid No Bid $39,786.00 

$23,410.001 $443.88 $40.52 $484.40INo Bid 

No Bid I No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$32,039.001 $469.00 $65.00 $534.001No Bid 

"'MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 12 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 20 

Proposals Received: 4 

No-Proposal Form Received: c 

Monthly I Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. Payment 

Ford Transit 350 

$600.00 $40.00 $640.001 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 1: 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product/ Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Full-Size Van-Passenger 

Vehicle I Monthly I Monthly I 
Cost Lease Maint. 

Monthly 

Payment 

Vehicle 

Cost 

Chevrolet Express 3500 Series 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 031 06 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml48310 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

$26,902.22 $462.91 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid $32,083.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$48.12 $511.031No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Nissan Pathfinder 

$485.001 $40.00 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

Release Dale: 12/01/2016 

Qpening Date: 12/20/2016 

Mid-Size SUV 4x4 

I Monthly I Vehicle I 
Payment Cost 

$525.00INo Bid 

No Bid $21,572.00 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 122 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 20 

Proposals Received: 4 

No-Proposal Form Received: c 

Monthly I Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. Payment 

Dodge Journey 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

$405.91 $41.08 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodtiy Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 Department: Administration 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 03106 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$27,543.00 

No Bid 

I 
Monthly 

Lease I Monthly I 
Maint. 

Ford Explorer 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

$473.931 $47.16 

No Bid I No Bid 

Mid Size SUV 4x4 

Monthly I Vehicle 

Payment Cost 

No Bid INc Bid 

No Bid INc Bid 

$521.091No Bid 

No Bid $35,182.00 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

I 
Monthly I Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. Payment 

Ford KBB Explorer 

No Bid I No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid I No Bid 

$521.001 $65.001 $586.00 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$27,552.00 

"'*MITN Solicitation Statistics"* 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Mid-Size Sedan 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Chevrolet Malibu 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

No Bid I No Bid 

$394.001 $65.00 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

12 

20 

4 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY 

Commodity Number: 92847, 92867, 97514, 97544, 97588 

Proposal: RFP 17-2243 

Product I Service: Vehicle Fleet Leasing & Management Program 

Vendor Name & Address Vehicle 

Cost I 
Monthly 

Lease 

Department: Administration 

I Monthly I 
Maint. 

Mid-Size Sedan 

Monthly 

Payment 

Vehicle 

Cost 

Nissan Altima 

Acme Auto Leasing LLC 

440 Washington Ave 

North Haven CT 06473 

Enterprise Fleet Management 

600 Corporate Park Dr 

StLouis MO 63105 

Merchants Automotive Group Inc 

1278 Hooksett Rd 

Hooksett NH 031 06 

Pro Leasing Services 

35235 Mound Rd 

Sterline Heights Ml 48310 

$23,459.00 $355.00 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

$40.00 $395.001No Bid 

No Bid No Bid $17,741.00 

No Bid No Bid $17,896.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Release Date: 12/01/2016 

Opening Date: 12/20/2016 

I 
Monthly I Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. Payment 

Ford Fusion 

Vehicle 

Cost 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $31,245.00 

$334.18 $38.33 $372.511 $19,820.00 

$307.93 $37.32 $345.251 $21,915.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

.. MITN Solicitation Statistics .. 

Vendors Received Notice: 

Vendors Viewed Documents: 

Proposals Received: 

No-Proposal Form Received: 

Minivan -Passenger 

I 
Monthly I Monthly 

Lease Maint. 

Dodge Grand Caravan 

$480.00 $40.00 

$372.75 $39.67 

$377.09 $52.08 

No Bid No Bid 

I 
Monthly 

Payment 

Step 

van 

$520.00INo Bid 

$412.411No Bid 

$429.171No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

12 

20 

4 

c 
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