MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY

Page 1 of 5 “*MITN Solicitation Statistics™
Commodity Number: 94611, 94631, 94648, 94677 Vendors Received Notice: 158
Vendors Viewed Documents: 34
Proposal: RFP 17- 2247 Department: Finance and Management Services Release Date: 12/12/2016 Proposals Received: 5
Product/ Service: Professional Services for a Five Year Financial Forecast Opening Date: 01/06/2016 No-Proposal Form Received: 1
Vendor Name & Address Proposal Received Scoring Pricing Comments
Conway MacKenzie Yes 55.8% $340,000.00
401 S Old Woodward Ave Ste 340
Birmingham MI 48009
Ernst & Young LLP Yes 51.3% $300,000.00
777 Woodward Ave
Detroit Ml 48226
Munetrix Municipal Metrics Yes 75.0% $40,860.00 First Year Price: $40, 860
3297 Five Points Dr Second Year Price add: $12,500.00
Auburn Hills Ml 48326 Third Year Price add: $12,500.00
Municipal Analytics Yes 98.0% $26,300.00
1550 Westfield Ave
Ann Arbor M1 48103
Plante Moran Yes 79.8% $14,875.00
27400 Northwestern Highway
Southfield MI 48037
Department Recommendation: Municipal Analytics Name of Buyer: Jamie Burmeister
X g i
Director of Finance/Assistant County Administrator's Name: Beth Dick Signature;

Vendor Awarded:

Municipal Analytics

Board Approval Date:

01/31/2017

Board Motion Number




MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY
Page 2 of 5 **MITN Solicitation Statistics*

Commodity Number: 94611, 94631, 94648, 94677 Vendors Received Notice: 158
Vendors Viewed Documents: 34

Proposal: RFP 17- 2247 Department: Finance and Management Services Release Date: 12/12/2016 Proposals Received: 8

Product / Service: Professional Services for a Five Year Financial Forecast Opening Date: 01/06/2016 No-Proposal Form Received:

Rates by Supervisory and Staff Level Times Hours Anticipated for Each
Vendor Name & Address Officer Director Managing Consultant
Hrly Rate [Est. Hrs Total Hrly Rate Est. Hrs Total Hrly Rate |Est. Hrs Total
Conway MacKenzie $487.50 0 $0.00 $431.50 195 $84,142.50 $337.50 500 $168,750.00

401 S Old Woodward Ave Ste 340
Birmingham M! 48009

Ernst & Young LLP No Bid No Bid No Bid
777 Woodward Ave
Detroit Ml 48226

Munetrix Municipal Metrics $195.00 80 $15,600.00 $195.00 40 $7,800.00 $165.00 20 $3,300.00
3297 Five Points Dr
Auburn Hills M| 48326

Municipal Analytics No Bid No Bid $125.00 160 $20,000.00
1550 Westfield Ave
Ann Arbor MI 48103

Plante Moran $260.00 15 $3,800.00 No Bid $175.00 25 $4,375.00
27400 Northwestemn Highway
Southfield Ml 48037
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Commodity Number: 94611, 94631, 94648, 94677 Vendors Recelved Notice: 158]
Vendors Viewed Documents: 34
Proposal: RFP 17- 2247 Department: Finance and Management Services Release Date: 12/12/2016 Proposals Received: 5
Product / Service: Professional Services for a Five Year Financial Forecast Opening Date: 01/06/2016 No-Proposal Form Received:
Rates by Supervisory and Staff Level Times Hours Anticipated for Each
Vendor Name & Address Senior Consultant Consultant Technical Specialist/Support
Hrly Rate |Est. Hrs Total Hrly Rate Est. Hrs Total Hrly Rate |Est. Hrs Total
Conway MacKenzie $176.25 500 $88,125.00 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00 $95.00 1] $0.00

401 S Old Woodward Ave Ste 340
Birmingham M| 48009

Ernst & Young LLP $650.00 120 $78,000.00 No Bid $485.00 100 $48,500.00
777 Woodward Ave
Detroit Ml 48226

Munetrix Municipal Metrics $195.00 0 $0.00 $125.00 $0.00 $0.00 $75.00 120 $9,000.00
3297 Five Points Dr
Auburn Hills Ml 48326

Municipal Analytics $110.00 40 $4,400.00 No Bid No Bid
1550 Westfield Ave
Ann Arbor MI 48103

Plante Moran No Bid $110.00 $60.00 $6,600.00 No Bid
27400 Northwestern Highway
Southfield MI 48037
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Commodity Number: 94611, 94631, 94648, 94677 Vendors Received Notice: 158
Vendors Viewed Documents: 34
Proposal: RFP 17- 2247 Department: Finance and Management Services Release Date: 12/12/2016 Proposals Received: 5
Product / Service: Professional Services for a Five Year Financial Forecast Opening Date: 01/06/2016 No-Proposal Form Received:
Rates by Supervisory and Staff Level Times Hours Anticipated for Each
Vendor Name & Address Partner Manager Senior Staff
Hrly Rate |Est. Hrs Total Hrly Rate Est. Hrs Total Hrly Rate |[Est. Hrs Total
Conway MacKenzie No Bid No Bid No Bid

401 S Old Woodward Ave Ste 340
Birmingham Ml 48009

Ernst & Young LLP $800.00 20 $16,000.00 $485.00 320 $155,200.00 $200.00 480 $96,000.00
777 Woodward Ave
Detroit M| 48226

Munetrix Municipal Metrics No Bid No Bid No Bid
3297 Five Points Dr
Auburn Hills M! 48326

Municipal Analytics No Bid No Bid No Bid
1550 Westfield Ave
Ann Arbor MI 48103

Plante Moran No Bid No Bid No Bid
27400 Northwestern Highway
Southfield M| 48037




MUSKEGON COUNTY PROPOSAL SUMMARY
Page 5 of 5 “*MITN Solicitation Statistics™
Commodity Number: 94611, 94631, 94648, 94677 Vendors Received Notice: 158
Vendors Viewed Documents: 34
Proposal: RFP 17- 2247 Department: Finance and Management Services Release Date: 12/12/2016 Proposals Received: 5
Product / Service: Professional Services for a Five Year Financial Forecast Opening Date: 01/06/2016 No-Proposal Form Received:
Travel Adjustment
Vendor Name & Address Lodging Mileage Meals General to Cap Fees Facilitator
Conway MacKenzie No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ($1,017.50) No Bid
401 S Old Woodward Ave Ste 340
Birmingham M| 48009
Ernst & Young LLP $6,000.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 No Bid ($103,700.00) No Bid
777 Woodward Ave
Detroit M| 48226
Munetrix Municipa!l Metrics No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,160.00 No Bid $3,000.00
3297 Five Points Dr
Auburn Hills MI 48326
Municipal Analytics No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,900.00 No Bid No Bid
1550 Westfield Ave
Ann Arbor Ml 48103
Plante Moran No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27400 Northwestern Highway
Southfield Ml 48037









