MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 20

COMMODITY #: 070-00 _x__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 04-1320 No. of Bids Received 12
No. of No-Bids Received 0

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: CMH OPENING DATE: 11/25/03 No. of Non-Response 8

Vendor Name One Ton Van Sedan Comments Vendor Name One Ton Van Sedan

COMMENTS
Discovery Ford Ford Ford $1000 dep. per vehicle | Kool Chevrolet Chevy Chevy Net 30 days
3001 Colby Street E350 XLT Taurus Se  [when ordering 3770 Plainfield NE Express Malibu
Whitehall, Ml 49461 $22,435.76 $14,937.90 GR, Ml 49525 $20,750.00 $14,295.00
Fremont Ford Ford Ford Payment due at deliv. |Don Rypma Chevy Chevy
7148 W. 48th Street E350 XL Taurus LX 8130 Whitehall Road Express Malibu
Fremont, Ml 49412 $21,289.76 $14,996.90 Whitehall, Ml 49461 $20,359.00 $14,064.00
Tony Betten & Son Ford Ford Ford Lakeshore Chrysler, Jeep| No Bid Dodge Payment due at del.
3839 Plainfield NE E350 Taurus LX 4235 Fruitvale Road Stratus SE
GR, Ml 49525 $21,161.76 $14,417.90 Montague, MI 49437 $15,495.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford Family Auto Center No Bid Dodge Payment due at del.
2469 Apple Avenue E350 Taurus 3146 Henry Street Stratus SXT
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $20,866.76 $14,434.90 Muskegon, Ml 49441 $16,901.00
Duthler Ford Ford Ford Lemmen Grand Chevy Chevy Payment due at del.
3560-28th Street SE E350 Taurus 930 O'Malley Drive CG33706 Malibu
GR, Ml 49512 $22,074.76 $15,198.00 Coopersville, Ml 49404 $20,469.00 $14,403.00
Signature Ford Ford Ford Net 10 days
PO Box 242 Club Wagon Taurus
Central Lake, MI 49622 $20,711.00 $12,531.00
Jorgensen Ford Ford Ford Net 10 days
8333 Michigan Club Wagon Taurus
Detroit, Ml 48210 $21,050.00 $14,063.00
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 20

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __x__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 04-1320 No. of Bids Received 12
No. of No-Bids Received 0
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 11/25/03 No. of Non-Response 8
1/2 Ton, 5.7L |1.2 Ton, 4.3L 1/2 Ton, 5.7L |1.2 Ton, 4.3L
Vendor Name V8, 4x4 V6, 4x4 Comments Vendor Name V8, 4x4 V6, 4x4
Pickup Truck | Pickup Truck Pickup Truck | Pickup Truck COMMENTS
Discovery Ford Ford Ford $1000 dep. per vehicle | Kool Chevrolet Chevy Chevy Net 30 days
3001 Colby Street F150 F150 when ordering 3770 Plainfield NE Silverado Silverado
Whitehall, Ml 49461 $22,103.76 $21,342.76 GR, Ml 49525 $18,471.00 $16,335.00
Fremont Ford Ford Ford Payent due at deliv. Don Rypma Chevy Chevy
7148 W. 48th Street F150 F150 8130 Whitehall Road Silverado Silverado
Fremont, Ml 49412 $21,273.76 $20,539.76 Whitehall, Ml 49461 $17,887.00 $15,934.00
Tony Betten & Son Ford Ford Ford Lakeshore Chrysler, Jeep| Dodge Dodge Payment due at del.
3839 Plainfield NE F150 F150 4235 Fruitvale Road Ram 1500 ST | Ram 1500 ST
GR, Ml 49525 $21,135.76 $19,901.76 Montague, MI 49437 $18,695.00 $17,995.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford Family Auto Center Dodge Dodge Payment due at del.
2469 Apple Avenue F150 F150 3146 Henry Street Ram 1500 ST | Ram 1500 ST
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $21,374.76 $20,640.76 Muskegon, Ml 49441 $21,902.00 $21,313.00
Duthler Ford Ford Ford Lemmen Grand Chevy Chevy Payment due at del.
3560-28th Street SE F150 F150 930 O'Malley Drive Silverado Silverado
GR, Ml 49512 $22,698.00 $19,743.00 Coopersville, Ml 49404 $18,227.00 $16,062.00
Signature Ford Ford Ford Net 10 days
PO Box 242 F150 F150 5.7L truck specs
Central Lake, MI 49622 $17,663.03 $16,662.03 not met
Jorgensen Ford No Bid No Bid
8333 Michigan
Detroit, Ml 48210
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




Page 1 - Health

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 20

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __x__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 04-1320 No. of Bids Received 12
No. of No-Bids Received 0

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Health OPENING DATE: 11/25/03 No. of Non-Response 8

Vendor Name Sedan Minivan Comments Vendor Name Sedan Minivan

COMMENTS
Discovery Ford Ford Ford $1000 dep. per vehicle |Kool Chevrolet No Bid Chevy Net 30 days
3001 Colby Street Taurus Se Freestar S when ordering 3770 Plainfield NE Venture LS
Whitehall, Ml 49461 $14,937.90 $20,384.82 GR, Ml 49525 $19,985.00
Fremont Ford Ford Ford Payent due at deliv. Don Rypma Chevy Chevy
7148 W. 48th Street Taurus Lx Freestar S 8130 Whitehall Road Impala Venture
Fremont, Ml 49412 $14,996.90 $19,704.82 Whitehall, Ml 49461 $16,409.00 $16,776.00
Tony Betten & Son Ford Ford Ford Lakeshore Chrysler, Jeep| Dodge Dodge Payment due at del.
3839 Plainfield NE Taurus Lx Freestar S 4235 Fruitvale Road Stratus SE Caravan SE
GR, Ml 49525 $14,417.90 $19,444.82 Montague, MI 49437 $15,495.00 $18,995.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford Family Auto Center Dodge Dodge Payment due at del.
2469 Apple Avenue Taurus Freestar 3146 Henry Street Stratus SXT Caravan SE
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $14,524.90 $23,175.82 Muskegon, Ml 49441 $16,801.00 $21,341.00
Duthler Ford Ford Ford Lemmen Grand Chevy Chevy Payment due at del.
3560-28th Street SE Taurus Freestar 930 O'Malley Drive Impala Venture
GR, Ml 49512 $15,198.00 $20,993.18 Coopersville, Ml 49404 $16,689.00 $19,955.00
Signature Ford Ford Ford Net 10 days
PO Box 242 Taurus Freestar Alt minivan $18264
Central Lake, M| 49622 $12,531.00 $18,031.00 8-passanger
Jorgensen Ford Ford Ford Net 10 days
8333 Michigan Taurus Freestar
Detroit, Ml 48210 $14,063.00 $19,370.00
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




Page 2 - Health

COMMODITY #: 070-00

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFB 04-1320

No. of Bids Mailed 20

No. of Bids Received 12

No. of No-Bids Received 0

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Health OPENING DATE: 11/25/03 No. of Non-Response 8
1/2 Ton, 4x2 1/2 Ton, 4x2
Vendor Name Pickup Truck Comments Vendor Name Pickup Truck
COMMENTS
Discovery Ford Ford Kool Chevrolet Chevy
3001 Colby Street F150 3770 Plainfield NE Silverado
Whitehall, Ml 49461 $15,653.70 GR, M| 49525 $14,025.00
Fremont Ford Ford Don Rypma Chevy
7148 W. 48th Street F150 8130 Whitehall Road Silverado
Fremont, Ml 49412 $20,848.44 Whitehall, Ml 49461 $13,466.00
Tony Betten & Son Ford Ford Lakeshore Chrysler, Jeep) Dodge
3839 Plainfield NE F150 4235 Fruitvale Road Ram 1500 ST
GR, M| 49525 $17,218.77 Montague, MI 49437 $15,995.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford Family Auto Center Dodge
2469 Apple Avenue F150 3146 Henry Street Ram 1500 ST
Muskegon, M| 49442 $17,183.76 Muskegon, Ml 49441 $17,380.00
Duthler Ford Ford Lemmen Grand Chevy
3560-28th Street SE F150 930 O'Malley Drive Silverado
GR, M| 49512 $18,872.20 Coopersville, Ml 49404 $13,984.00
Signature Ford Ford
PO Box 242 F150
Central Lake, MI 49622 $12,827.00
Jorgensen Ford No Bid
8333 Michigan
Detroit, Ml 48210
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 20

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __x__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 04-1320 No. of Bids Received 12
No. of No-Bids Received 0
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Sheriff OPENING DATE: 11/25/03 No. of Non-Response 8
4-Door, 4x4 4-Door, 4x4
Vendor Name Sport Utility Comments Vendor Name Sport Utility
Vehicle Vehicle COMMENTS

Discovery Ford Ford Kool Chevrolet No Bid
3001 Colby Street Explorer XLT 3770 Plainfield NE
Whitehall, Ml 49461 $27,459.57 GR, M| 49525
Fremont Ford Ford $26,853.57 if traction |Don Rypma Chevy
7148 W. 48th Street Explorer control is desired 8130 Whitehall Road Tahoe
Fremont, Ml 49412 $26,759.57 Whitehall, Ml 49461 $28,221.00
Tony Betten & Son Ford| Bid received Lakeshore Chrysler, Jeep) Dodge
3839 Plainfield NE late 4235 Fruitvale Road Durango SLT
GR, M| 49525 Montague, MI 49437 $25,950.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford Family Auto Center Dodge
2469 Apple Avenue Explorer 3146 Henry Street Durango SLT
Muskegon, M| 49442 $25,985.57 Muskegon, Ml 49441 $30,720.00
Duthler Ford Ford Lemmen Grand Chevy
3560-28th Street SE Explorer 930 O'Malley Drive Trailblazer
GR, M| 49512 $29,499.18 Coopersville, Ml 49404 $27,491.00
Signature Ford Ford
PO Box 242 Explorer
Central Lake, MI 49622 $26,509.57
Jorgensen Ford No Bid
8333 Michigan
Detroit, Ml 48210

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name:

WITNESS Name:

Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Christian Toebe

Signature:

Signature:







