COMMODITY #: 345-80

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Air Purifying Respirators

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Sherifff Emergency Services

RFB 04-1326

OPENING DATE: 12/12/03

No. of Bids Mailed 10

No. of Bids Received 5

No. of No-Bids Received 1

No. of Non-Response 3

No. of Web Bids Received 1

Scott Mask Total for 250 |3M Breathe Total for 44 ea.|Training for
Vendor Name price per each |of each Easy Breathe easy, (250 people on COMMENTS
mask, canister, |price per each [filters, battery |Scott masks
adaptor cover
Abatix Corporation No Bid No Bid $616.82 $32,832.36 No Bid
3011 East Broadway #300
Phoenix, AZ 85040
West Shore Fire $159.00 $51,375.00 $757.00 $44,583.36 $9,000.00
6620 Lake Michigan Drive
Allendale, M1 49401-0188
O'Mara Products No Bid No Bid $671.32 $44,481.00 No Bid
3025 Sangra Avenue, SW
Grandville, Ml 49418
Global Protection 3M 6000DIN $550.00 $25,328.60 3M masks 3M mask is not compatable
5 Stow Road, Unit H $98.23 $31,425.00 $6,250.00 with all local fire rescue units.
Marlton, NJ 08053-4801 This mask is not approved by
the State of MI.
Safety Services, Inc. $152.43 $46,822.50 $591.14 $27,141.44 $3,000.00
5286 Wynn Road
Kalamazoo, MI 49003-3539
Engineering Dimensions $192.95 $67,850.00 $686.29 $43,623.36 $5,000.00
975 W. Broadway Avenue
Muskegon, Ml 49441
ATD - American No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

Scott masks and training - Safety Services
3M 6000 Not approved by the State of Ml
3M Breathe Easy - Global Protection.

Purchasing - Concur

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




