MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 9

No. of Bids Received 6

COMMODITY #: 675-45 ____BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 3/1/04 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 3

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 3/2/04 No. of Web Bids Received 0

Dual Il Cinch Roundup Interactive Poast Plus Eptam

Vendor Name Magnum Original COMMENTS

Helena Chemical Company $86.50 $89.50 $19.95 $29.50 $58.00 $29.50
349 Wilson Road $27,247.50 $28,192.50 $24,937.50 $12,095.00 $1,305.00 $2,802.50
Conklin, M1 49403
Daylight Enterprises $77.00 $30.50 $24.60 $46.66 $30.66 |Bid Roundup Original MAX
280 S. Ringle Road $24,255.00 No Bid $26,230.00 $10,086.00 $1,049.85 $2,912.70 |860 gallons equal to 1,250 gal.
Fairgrove, MI 48733
Wilbur - Ellis $85.40 $84.20 $17.50 $15.00 $38.11 $24.69 |Buccaneer bid as alternate
4160 Ten Mile Road $26,901.00 $26,523.00 $21,875.00 $6,150.00 $857.48 $2,345.55
Sparta, Ml 49345 Buccaneer
Troyer Growers Supply $82.85 $35.50 $3.80 Bid Roundup Original MAX
205 Industrial Parkway $26,097.75 No Bid $44,375.00 $1,558.00 No Bid No Bid
Waterloo, IN 46793
Royster Clark Inc. $78.11 $20.85 $5.10 $39.56 $31.59 |Amaze Gold bid as alternate
11471 Lake Michigan Drive $24,604.65 No Bid $26,062.50 $2,091.00 $890.10 $3,001.05 |to Interactive
West Olive, Ml 49460
Farmers Coop Elevator $93.10 $36.00 Bid Roundup Original MAX
2327 - 64th Avenue $29,326.50 No Bid $30,960.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid|860 gallons equal to 1,250 gal.
Zeeland, MI 49464
Troyer Growers Supply Meoolachlor Il Clearout 41
ALTERNATE $61.50 $13.25

$19,372.50 $16,562.50
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
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Pursuit Buctril Beacon Permit Callisto Diethoate
Vendor Name COMMENTS
Helena Chemical Company $8.60 $53.50 $23.25 $13.95 $3.71 $31.80
349 Wilson Road $14,241.60 $8,560.00 $8,835.00 $8,370.00 $2,782.00
Conklin, M1 49403
Daylight Enterprises $8.84 $47.00 $22.45 $12.25 $3.46 $31.00
280 S. Ringle Road $14,639.04 $7,520.00 $8,531.00 $7,350.00 $2,657.28 $7,130.00
Fairgrove, MI 48733
Wilbur - Ellis $8.42 $47.16 $21.40 $11.65 $418.30 $32.18 |Callisto is bid by 6 gallon qgty.
4160 Ten Mile Road $13,943.52 $7,545.60 $8,132.00 $6,990.00 $2,509.80 $7,401.40
Sparta, Ml 49345 DFE coPak
Troyer Growers Supply $8.95 $48.50 $24.75 $13.20 $435.00 $33.20
205 Industrial Parkway $15,465.60 $7,760.00 $9,405.00 $7,923.96 $2,610.00 $7,636.00
Waterloo, IN 46793
Royster Clark Inc. $9.11 $50.74 $23.43 $12.57 $3.40 $32.50 |Surfactant use w/Roundup
11471 Lake Michigan Drive $15,086.16 $8,118.40 $8,903.40 $7,542.00 $2,550.00 $7,475.00 |$8.90 per gal. = $312.00
West Olive, Ml 49460
Farmers Coop Elevator
2327 - 64th Avenue No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zeeland, MI 49464
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
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No. of Non-Response 3
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 3/2/04 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Potash
Vendor Name COMMENTS
Helena Chemical Company $149.00
349 Wilson Road $20,115.00
Conklin, M1 49403
Daylight Enterprises
280 S. Ringle Road No Bid
Fairgrove, MI 48733
Wilbur - Ellis $156.00
4160 Ten Mile Road $21,060.00
Sparta, Ml 49345
Troyer Growers Supply
205 Industrial Parkway No Bid
Waterloo, IN 46793
Royster Clark Inc. $154.75
11471 Lake Michigan Drive $20,891.25
West Olive, Ml 49460
Farmers Coop Elevator
2327 - 64th Avenue No Bid
Zeeland, MI 49464

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




