MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received 7
COMMODITY #: 968-73 _X_BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 04-1340 No. of No-Bids Received 2
No. of Non-Response 6
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Whitehall Drying Bed Sludge Removal DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 03/26/04 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Pumped, Pumped, Pumped, Pumped, Pumped, Pumped,
Vendor Name Excavated & Excavated, Excavated & Excavated, Excavated & Excavated, Cost to Power Cost to Total COMMENTS
Hauled to Hauled & Disposed Hauled to Hauled & Disposed Hauled to Hauled & Disposed Wash Storage Level Each Cost
Autumn Hills of at Autumn Hills Ottawa County of at Ottawa Co. Central Landfill of at Central Landfill Lagoon Liner Bed
'Young's Environmental
4990 West River Dr, N.E. $23.80 No Bid $21.00 $32.85 No Bid No Bid $16,500.00 $400.00 | *$402,100.00
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 **$412,300.00
Natural Systems, Inc.
18688 17th No Bid No Bid $10.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 $350.00 | *$278,000.00
Spring Lake, Ml 49456 **No Bid
Terra Contracting
2612 Miller Road $11.87 $24.53 $10.27 $22.10 $10.90 $22.33 $70,000.00 $700.00 | *$328,040.00
Kalamazoo, MI 49001 **$338,000.00
White Lake Excavating
2571 Holton Whitehall Road $16.37 No Bid $12.12 No Bid $16.37 No Bid $12,000.00 $400.00 | *$291,040.00
Whitehall, Ml 49461 **No Bid
Rusche's Trucking Inc.
4457 Alpine Avenue No Bid $32.95 No Bid $30.44 No Bid $32.19 $24,950.00 $300.00 *No Bid
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 **$391,430.00
McCormick Sand Inc.
995 S. 102nd Avenue $26.30 $37.01 $24.30 $35.25 $26.30 $36.00 $10,000.00 $400.00 | *$423,600.00
Shelby, MI 49455 **$423,000.00
Custom Biosolids Handling No Bid
Double L Enterprises No Bid

Bids tabulated by using 12,000 tons of sludge to be removed, also assumed that 4 sludge drying beds to be reused and leveled, lump sum charge for powerwashing lagoon liner and disposal
cost submitted by Ottawa Landfill of $11.00/ton will be used for calculating the cost for disposal.

*Cost with County paying for disposal. **Cost with Vendor paying for disposal.
BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Lynn Zatalokin

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:




