COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

__x__BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Health Department

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

RFB 04-1346

OPENING DATE: 04/20/04

No. of Bids Mailed 20

No. of Bids Received 4

No. of No-Bids Received 2

No. of Non-Response 14

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Light Duty Total two Option:
Vendor Name Pick Up Truck Trucks 4 x 4 Truck COMMENTS
Signature Ford Ford Cut off date to order is
PO Box 242 Ranger $15,823.00 06/01/04
Central Lake, Ml 49622 $12,265.00 $24,530.00 each
Great Lakes Ford Ford
2469 Apple Avenue Ranger No Bid
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $11,608.76 $23,217.52
Betten Chevrolet Chevy Cloth split bench seats.
2475 Henry Street Silverado $17,713.10 No floor mats
Muskegon, MI 49441 $14,892.60 $29,785.20 Full size truck.
Lakeshore C.J.D. Dodge Past vehicle build date. Prices
4235 Fruitvale Road Dakota SXT Plus $3,000 based on dealer trades. No
Montague, Ml 49437 $13,989.00 $27,639.00 on total each power Window & Door lock.
price
Lemmen Grand No Bid
Don Rypma No Bid
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name:  Christian Toebe Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

__x__BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFB 04-1346

DEPT: Sheriff/Emergency Services OPENING DATE: 04/20/04

No. of Bids Mailed 20

No. of Bids Received 4

No. of No-Bids Received 2

No. of Non-Response 14

No. of Web Bids Received 0

4 x 4 Ext. Cab V10 Code lll Bed Liner Camper
Vendor Name Pick Up Truck Engine Package Shell COMMENTS

Signature Ford Ford $749.00 Cut off date to order is
PO Box 242 F250 $600.00 $3,702.94 $550.00 Cab height 06/01/04
Central Lake, MI 49622 $19,620.00 $799.00

5" taller than cab
Great Lakes Ford Ford
2469 Apple Avenue F250 $558.00 No Bid $350.00 $1,040.00
Muskegon, M| 49442 $21,291.24
Betten Chevrolet Chevy Option prices included in total
2475 Henry Street Silverado No Bid $3,702.94 $400.00 $800.00 price for truck.
Muskegon, M| 49441 $28,933.72
Lakeshore C.J.D. Dodge To be ordered or dealer trade.
4235 Fruitvale Road Ram 2500 No Bid No Bid $395.00 No Bid
Montague, Ml 49437 $23,795.00
Lemmen Grand No Bid
Don Rypma No Bid
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




