MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Malled

No. of Bids Received

(COMMODITY #: 070-00 __X__BID QUOTATION ___ PROPOSAL RFB 05-1371 No. of No-Bids Received 1
No. of Non-Response 10
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT:  Community Mental Health OPENING DATE: 10/26/04 No. of Web Bids Received 2
Mobility Great Lakes Varsity Ford Fremont Ford Bob Maxey Signature Ford | Lemmen Grand DonRypma  |Tony Betten & Sons|  New England Clock Gresham
Vendor Name Transportation Serv. Ford 3480 Jackson Rd. Ford 1960 E. Main St. Chevrolet Chevrolet Wheels Inc. Conversions Driving Aids
42000 Koppernick, Ste. A3| 2469 Apple Ave. PO Box 2507 7148 W. 48th St. | 1833 E. Jefferson PO Box 242 930 OMalley Dr | 8130 Whitehall Rd (3839 Plainfield, N.E.| 3 Dunham Road 6700 Clay Ave. PO Box 930334
Canton, MI 48187 MI 49442 Ann Arbor, MI 48106 | Fremont, MI 49412 | Detroit, MI 48207 | Geniral Lake, M1 49622 | Goopersville, Mi 49404 _| Whitehall, MI 49461| Grand Rapids. Wi 49525 | Billerica, MA 01821 | _ Grand Rapids Mi 49548 | Wixom, M1 48393
15 Passenger One Ton Van
Cost for three (3) Vans $52,302.00 $53,823.00 $56,298.00 $58,923.48 $61,500.00 $62,133.00 $64,422.00 $65,169.00 $80,214.90 $94,986.00 No Bid No Bid
Make of Van Ford S31 Ford E350 Ford E350 Ford E350 | Ford Econoline |  Ford E350 Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford E350 Ford E350
XLT Express Express
(Conversions of 15 Passenger Vans
Raised Roof Make/Model WPJ Style, Aerodynamic Exectutop Millenuim High Top Sport Tog Fundy Executive | Millennium Sport  |Millennuim Exec TV
Lift Make/Model CL917IB or L917IB Braun 9171B Braun 917IB  |Braun L917/Ada| Braun L919IB Braun L917/Ada | Braun L917IB
Cost for three (3) Conversions | $24,906.00 No Bid $20,250.00 No Bid $25,500.00 $38,737.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid Included w/Vans $38,737.50 $20,250.00
Passenger Sedan
Cost for eight (8) Sedan No Bid $116,208.00 $103,816.00 $112,570.00 $119,960.00 $101,760.00 $109,584.00 $108,920.00 $137,216.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make of Sedan Ford Taurus Ford Taurus Ford Taurus Ford Taurus Ford Taurus Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Taurus
Malibu Malibu
12 Passenger One Ton Van
Cost for one (1) Van No Bid $17,079.00 $18,265.00 $18,409.16 $19,999.00 $20,136.00 $20,862.00 $21,045.00 $23,538.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Make of Van Ford E350 Ford E350 Ford E350 | Ford Econoline |  Ford E350 Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford E350
XLT Express Express
ALTERNATE BID
15 Passenger One Ton Van
Cost for three (3) Vans $58,500.00
Make of Van Ford Econoline XL
ALTERNATE BID
Passenger Sedan
Cost for eight (8) Sedan $119,960.00
Make of Sedan Ford 500
ALTERNATE BID
12 Passenger Sedan
Cost for one (1) Van $18,500.00
[Make of Van Ford Econoline XL
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine R. Johnson Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY o, of siss waies 2
No. of Bids Received s
(COMMODITY #: 070-00 _X__ BID QUOTATION ___ PROPOSAL RFB 05-1371 No. of No-Bids Received 1
No. of Non-Response 14
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Sheriff OPENING DATE: 10/26/04 No. of Web Bids Received 2
Vendor Name Cost for Vehicle Alternate bid Alternate COMMENTS
one (1) Sedan Make for one (1) Vehicle Make
Sedan
Signature Ford
1960 E. main $12,641.00 Ford Taurus
IOwosso, MI_ 48867
Varsity Ford
PO Box 2507 $12,977.00 Ford Taurus
Ann Arbor, MI 48106
Don Rypma Chevrolet
8130 Whitehall Road $13,615.00 Chevy Malibu
\Whitehall, Ml 49461
Fremont Ford
7148 W. 48th $14,071.25 Ford Taurus
Fremont, MI 49412
Great Lakes Ford
2469 Apple Avenue $14,546.00 Ford Taurus
Muskegon, Ml 49442
Bob Maxey Ford
1833 East Jefferson Avenue $14,995.00 Ford Taurus $20,500.00 Ford 500
Detroit, MI 48207
Lemmen Grand Chevrolet
930 O’'Malley Drive $15,957.00 Chevy Impala
Coopersville, MI 49404
Tony Betten & Sons
38398 Plainfield, N.E. $17,178.25 Ford Taurus
Grand Rapids, MI 49525
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PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Christine R. Johnson

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




