MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 21
No. of Bids Received 10
COMMODITY #: 910-39 X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 05-1386 No. of No-Bids Received 5
No. of Non-Response 6
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitoral Service DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: January 28, 2005 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Total Annual
Vendor Name Annual Cost | Annual Cost | Annual Cost | Annual Cost Annual Cost Annual Cost Annual Cost | Annual Cost | Annual Cost | Annual Cost | Annual Cost Annual Cost Annual Cost Annual Cost Cost Additional Cost | Additional Cost | Additional Cost COMMENTS
CMH/Brinks CMH/Wesley | CMH/Peck St. | CMH/Southern [ CMH/Halmond | Hall of Justice Solid Waste Library Training Starks Hall Health Dept. Whitehall MSU Oak Avenue Carpet Tile Upholster
Center Center Adult Activity Extension D.E.T. % Di: Cleanin Refinishing Cleaning

Progressive Building Service
440 36th Street SE $40,353.00 | $33,408.00 | $34,584.00 | $35,748.00 | $38,568.00 | $131,513.28 | $14,052.00 | $25,194.00 | $35,354.04 | $42,062.04 | $57,876.00 $17,730.00 $21,806.40 $33,696.00 $561,944.76 $0.06 $0.35 $1.75
Wyoming, MI 49548 1% per Sq Ft per Sq Ft
Reliable Management System
838 Boston Street, SE $24,840.00 | $18,240.00 | $23,928.00 | $22,800.00 | $33,600.00 | $142,740.00 | $5,280.00 | $26,700.00 | $48,000.00 | $28,800.00 | $37,200.00 $8,760.00 $10,380.00 $13,200.00 $444,468.00 $0.12 $0.14 $2.00 - vinyl
Grand Rapids, MI 49507 5% per Sq Ft per Sq Ft $4.00 - cloth

2% pay early per chair
Reliant Cleaning
216 North Seventh Street $31,500.00 | $23,196.00 | $17,124.00 | $11,928.00 | $19,164.00 | $114,108.00 | $8,484.00 | $25,836.00 | $24,096.00 | $21,504.00 | $24,024.00 $13,644.00 $8,256.00 $16,344.00 $359,208.00 $0.075 $0.15 $2.50
Grand Haven, Ml 49417 3% per Sq Ft per Sq Ft per chair
Pioneer Resources
1145 E. Wesley Avenue $14,360.28 $23,070.36 $0.14 $0.37 see bid
Muskegon, Ml 49442 1% early pay per Sq Ft per Sq Ft
Goodwill Industries
271 East Apple Avenue $28,536.00 | $20,652.00 | $16,248.00 | $7,860.00 | $15,864.00 | $111,696.00 | $8,340.00 | $24,576.00 | $21,204.00 | $27,672.00 | $22,416.00 $12,360.00 $8,208.00 $14,700.00 $340,332.00 $0.15 $0.25 $35.00
Muskegon, Ml 49442 7% per Sq Ft per Sq Ft per hour
Clean-Tech Services
1615 Monroe Ave, NW $39,754.08 | $20,781.12 | $28,337.88 | $11,335.20 | $18,891.96 | $147,356.88 | $9,445.92 | $22,670.28 | $22,670.28 | $26,448.72 | $26,448.72 $13,224.36 $13,224.36 $15,113.52 $415,703.28 $0.16 $0.30 $0.20
Grand Rapids, MI 49505 15% per Sq Ft per Sq Ft per chair
Edwards Janitorial
661 Scenic No Bid $17,112.00 | $18,804.00 | $18,408.00 | $22,980.00 | $117,060.00 | $8,232.00 | $17,028.00 | $19,068.00 | $21,864.00 | $26,172.00 $11,256.00 $9,828.00 $14,904.00 $322,716.00 $0.10 $0.20 $1.00 - vinyl
Muskegon, MI 49445 1.5% per Sq Ft per Sq Ft $2.00 - cloth
Reliable Cleaning Service
PO Box 0026 $39,502.68 | $19,615.08 | $31,087.08 | $30,903.96 | $47,578.08 | $221,610.00 | $9,575.26 | $32,083.68 | $27,240.72 | $33,267.48 | $34,228.20 $18,968.40 $18,921.84 $25,528.32 $590,110.80 $0.13 $0.13 $0.50 - vinyl
Muskegon, MI 49443 1.5% per Sq Ft per Sq Ft $0.75 - cloth
CSM Services
3400 Highland Drive $25,471.92 | $14,640.24 | $16,484.16 | $13,269.12 | $18,826.56 | $90,075.60 | $4,068.36 | $17,659.20 | $17,158.32 | $19,692.84 | $18,786.00 $8,821.92 $6,597.12 $9,473.88 $281,025.24 $0.06 $0.20 $2.50
Hudsonville, MI49426 4% per Sq Ft per Sq Ft per chair
Scott’s Janitorial No Bid Service Mstr |No Bid
Grand Rapids Bldg Serv No Bid
MOKA No Bid
Harambee Enterprises No Bid
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




