Page 1 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 6
No. of Bids Received 5
COMMODITY #: 675-45 _X__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 05-1389 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 1
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 1/21/05 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Dual Il Roundup Request Prowel Eptam Pursuit DG
Vendor Name Magnum Original 3.3EC (Bulk) COMMENTS
(Bulk) Max
Wilbur Ellis $89.17 $28.72 $14.45 $18.41 No Bid $9.35
4160 10 Mile Road $17,834.00 $25,848.00 $3,612.50 $2,945.60 $15,483.00
Sparta, Ml 49345
Daylight Enterprises $74.90 $23.25 $15.21 $17.25 $30.00 $8.82
280 S. Ringle Road $14,980.00 $20,925.00 $3,802.50 $2,760.00 $4,500.00 $14,605.92
Fairgrove, MI 48733
Royster Clark, Inc. $95.72 $25.25 $4.10 $15.50 $35.38 No Bid
11471 Lake Michigan Drive $19,144.00 $22,725.00 $1,025.00 $2,480.00 $5,307.00
West Olive, Ml 49460 Amaze Gold Pendimax
Helena Chemical Co. $86.50 $23.38 $13.00 $17.25 $31.95 $8.60
349 Wilson Road $17,300.00 $21,042.00 $3,250.00 $2,760.00 $4,792.50 $14,241.60
Conklin, MI 49403
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. $77.00 $23.23 No Bid $18.90 No Bid No Bid
2327 - 64th $15,400.00 $20,907.00 $3,024.00
Zeeland, Ml 49464
Troyer Growers Supply $61.50 $12.50 No Bid $16.60 $35.75 $9.85
16496 124th Street $12,300.00 $11,250.00 $2,656.00 $5,362.50 $16,311.60
Nunica, Ml 49448 Metoolachlor| Helossate Plus Eptech

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
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COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X__BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater

RFB 05-1389

OPENING DATE: 1/21/05

No. of Bids Mailed 6

No. of Bids Received 5

No. of No-Bids Received 0

No. of Non-Response 1

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Buctril Beacon Permit Surfactant Dimethoate 0-0-61
Vendor Name 90:10 Potash COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis $53.64 $23.15 $15.37 $15.95 $32.00 $245.65
$6,168.60 $3,518.80 $6,148.00 $797.50 $1,600.00 $56,499.50
Daylight Enterprises $47.90 $22.99 $13.45 $8.50 $33.00 No Bid
$5,508.50 $3,494.48 $5,386.72 $425.00 $1,650.00
Royster Clark, Inc. $55.10 $24.31 $14.50 $16.61 $32.54 $202.50
$6,336.50 $3,695.12 $5,800.00 $830.50 $1,627.00 $46,575.00
15-Feb-05
Availability
Helena Chemical Co. $48.50 $21.25 $12.50 $18.50 $32.50 $192.00
$5,577.50 $3,230.00 $5,000.00 $925.00 $1,625.00 $44,160.00
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Troyer Growers Supply $50.35 $26.52 $14.68 $7.96 No Bid No Bid
$5,790.25 $4,031.04 $5,872.00 $398.00
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:




THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
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MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 6
No. of Bids Received 5
COMMODITY #: 675-45 _X__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 05-1389 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 1
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 1/21/05 No. of Web Bids Received 0
ESN
Vendor Name COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis No Bid
Daylight Enterprises No Bid
Royster Clark, Inc. No Bid
Helena Chemical Co. $415.00
$41,500.00
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. No Bid
Troyer Growers Supply No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe




WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




