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COMMODITY #: 345-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Personal Protective Equipement

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY
x___BID QUOTATION ____ PROPOSAL

RFB 05-1421

DEPT: Sheriff/Emergency Services OPENING DATE:

No. of Bids Mailed 15

No. of Bids Received 12

No. of No-Bids Received 2

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name

Fit Test
System

Annual
Cleaning

MSA Ultra
View/Ultra

Ultra View
Qtr. Turn

Scott-O-Vista

Ultra Elite

COMMENTS

[Moses Fire Equipment
PO Box 690
Lawrence, Ml 49064

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Lab Safety Supply
PO Box 1368
Janesville, WI 53547-1368

No Bid

No Bid

$117.12

No Bid

$98.50

No Bid

O’Mara Products
3025Sangra Avenue, SW
Grandville, Ml 49418

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Aramsco
165 Imperial Way
Thorofare, NJ 08086

$22,086.96

$1,532.60

$369.56

$521.74

$260.86

$500.00

Safety Services, Inc.
5286 Wynn Road
Kalamazoo, M| 49048

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Hagemeyer North America
3300 W. Montague, Ste 400B
North Charleston, SC 29418

$21,595.74

$1,159.60

$340.40

$489.40

$234.00

$468.10

5 Alarm Fire and Safety Equip
704 Oak Street
Fort Atkinson, W1 53538

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

CMP
6539 Westland Way, Ste 22
Lansing, MI 48917

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Grainger
2285 Roberts Street
Muskegon, Ml 49444

$30,044.00

$2,057.20

$473.60

$680.80

$325.60

$651.20

Industrial Tool Sales
2865 Whitehall Road
Muskegon, MI 49445

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Fisher Safety
7657 Tobemory Court
Ada, MI 49301

$21,460.00

$1,476.00

$370.00

$526.00

$258.00

$500.00

Global Protection
5 Stow Road, Suite H

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




”Marlton, NJ 08053

DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Tina Nash Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
Page 2 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 15
No. of Bids Received 12
COMMODITY #: 345-00 __Xx__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 05-1421 No. of No-Bids Received 2
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Personal Protective Equipement DEPT: Sheriff/Emergency Services OPENING DATE: No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name Ultra-Elite Advantage/ Spiromatic/ Interspiro CBRN CBRN COMMENTS
Qtr Turn Millenium Spirolite Spiromatic "'S" Gas Mask Cannisters
[Moses Fire Equipment
PO Box 690 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lawrence, Ml 49064
Lab Safety Supply
PO Box 1368 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45,681.60 $9,158.00
Janesville, WI 53547-1368
O’Mara Products
3025Sangra Avenue, SW No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32,294.25 $6,158.00
Grandville, Ml 49418
Aramsco
165 Imperial Way $673.92 $293.48 $1,000.00 $956.52 $27,569.85 $5,520.00
Thorofare, NJ 08086
Safety Services, Inc.
5286 Wynn Road No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34,673.50 $5,598.00
Kalamazoo, Ml 49048
Hagemeyer North America
3300 W. Montague, Ste 400B $638.30 $266.00 $957.40 $914.90 $23,095.00 $4,010.00
North Charleston, SC 29418
5 Alarm Fire and Safety Equip
704 Oak Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31,627.75 $6,030.00
Fort Atkinson, WI 53538
CMP
6539 Westland Way, Ste 22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,180.00 $5,600.00
Lansing, M| 48917
Grainger
2285 Roberts Street $888.00 $370.00 $1,332.00 $1,272.80 $29,043.90 $5,978.00

Muskegon, MI 49444




Industrial Tool Sales

2865 Whitehall Road No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35,398.90 $6,750.00
Muskegon, MI 49445
Fisher Safety
7657 Tobemory Court $680.00 $292.00 $1,014.00 $970.00 $26,195.00 $5,200.00
Ada, MI 49301
Global Protection
5 Stow Road, Suite H No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,103.80 $5,652.00
Marlton, NJ 08053
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Tina Nash Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
Page 3 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 15
No. of Bids Received 12
COMMODITY #: 345-00 _x__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 05-1421 No. of No-Bids Received 2
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Personal Protective Equipement DEPT: Sheriff/Emergency Services OPENING DATE: No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name Facepiece LANX Nitrile Latex Boot Duffle Bag Chemical COMMENTS
T-Adapters Overgarment Gloves Covers Tape
[Moses Fire Equipment
PO Box 690 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13,713.90 No Bid |Alternate duffle bag same
Lawrence, MI 49064 bag just smaller $10,801.80
Lab Safety Supply
PO Box 1368 No Bid No Bid $871.92 $2,351.10 $7,981.50 $1,889.68
Janesville, WI 53547-1368
O’Mara Products
3025Sangra Avenue, SW No Bid No Bid $472.50 $999.60 No Bid $1,258.56
Grandville, Ml 49418
Aramsco
165 Imperial Way No Bid $10,888.80 $306.18 $984.30 $3,952.50 $322.00 |Boots and gloves are an
Thorofare, NJ 08086 alternate
Safety Services, Inc.
5286 Wynn Road No Bid No Bid $515.76 $1,142.40 No Bid $1,313.76
Kalamazoo, MI 49048
Hagemeyer North America
3300 W. Montague, Ste 400B $1,277.00 $12,340.00 $362.88 $948.60 $3,570.00 $411.24
North Charleston, SC 29418
5 Alarm Fire and Safety Equip
704 Oak Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Fort Atkinson, W1 53538

CMP

6539 Westland Way, Ste 22

Lansing, M| 48917

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Grainger
2285 Roberts Street
Muskegon, Ml 49444

No Bid

$16,280.00

$488.88

$1,147.50

$6,579.00

$1,702.00

Industrial Tool Sales
2865 Whitehall Road
Muskegon, MI 49445

No Bid

No Bid

$667.80

$1,601.40

No Bid

$1,762.72

Fisher Safety
7657 Tobemory Court
Ada, MI 49301

No Bid

$5,400.00
navy color

$420.00

$1,071.00

$10,174.50

$1,265.00

LANX Overgarments
$8,500 olive color

Global Protection
5 Stow Road, Suite H
Marlton, NJ 08053

No Bid

$10,888.80

$385.14

$892.50

$5,610.00

$1,327.56

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Tina Nash

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




