COMMODITY #: 204-14 & 625-13

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Digital Cameras and Binoculars

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Emergency Services

RFB 05-1422

OPENING DATE: May 17, 2005

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name

Penn Camera Exchange
7040 Virginia Manor Road
Beltsville, MD 20705

The Camera Shop
2634 Henry Street
Muskegon, Ml 49441

W B Hunt
100 Main Street
Melrose, MA 02176

Radium Photo LLC
835 Terrace Street

Muskegon, Ml 49440

Adorama Camera
42 W. 18th Street
New York, NY 10011

Zones

1102 15th Street, S.W.

Auburn, WA 98001

Precision Data

5036 Falcon View, S.E.
Grand Rapids, Ml 49518

SDF Computers
813 Evans Street

Greenville, NC 27834

B & H Photo

420 Ninth Avenue
New York, NY 10001

ENTRE Computer Services
540 W. Hovey Avenue
Muskegon, Ml 49444

Price for 117 Binoculars $16,614.00 $17,433.00 $17,485.65 $18,135.00 $18,018.00 $18,146.70 $18,474.30 $21,712.86 NO BID NO BID
Shipping for Binoculars $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $190.00 $117.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Price for Binoculars $16,614.00 $17,433.00 $17,485.65 $18,135.00 $18,208.00 $18,263.70 $18,474.30 $21,712.86 NO BID NO BID
Price for 24 Digital Cameras $5,643.84 $5,256.00 $5,038.80 $5,040.00 $4,908.00 $5,104.80 $5,028.00 $5,016.00 $4,797.60 $5,394.00
Shipping for Digital Cameras $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $52.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Price for Cameras $5,643.84 $5,256.00 $5,038.80 $5,040.00 $4,960.00 $5,104.80 $5,028.00 $5,016.00 $4,797.60 $5,394.00

COMMENTS Price includes shipping
to one location
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




