Page 1

COMMODITY #: 475-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medical Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

__X_BID QUOTATION PROPOSAI

DEPT: Emergency Services

RFB 05-1432

OPENING DATE: 7/20/05

No. of Bids Mailed 23

No. of Bids Received 13

No. of No-Bids Received 6

No. of Non-Response 4

No. of Web Bids Received 6

Vendor Name All Purpose Polyester Oxygen Mask | Concentration Adult Peds Adult Peds
Utility Blanket with Safety Mask Cannulas Cannulas Manual Manual
Scissors 72" x 90" Vent Resuscitator | Resuscitator

Supreme Medical

Mobile, AL 36685 $3.18 No Bid $1.13 $1.60 $0.40 $1.70 Ea/50 $14.73 Ea/6 $21.95 Ea/6
-Alternate- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.33 $0.31 Ea/50 No Bid No Bid
Tech + Med Industries

Indianapolis, IN $6.03 No Bid $1.33 $2.30 $0.48 $1.80 $17.76 $23.47
Lab Safety Supply, Inc.

Janesville, W1 53547 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Krasity’s Medical

Dearborn, M1 48124 $8.50 $6.96 $64.96/50 $113.57/50 $46.00/50 $89.00/50 $21.00 $138.00/6
Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY 11236 $5.99 No Bid $1.05 $1.05 $0.36 $0.45 $9.45 $11.98
Laerdal Medical

Wappingers Falls, NY 12590 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.55 $12.55
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH 43017 $2.52 $5.73 $0.94 $1.02 $0.34 $1.63 $9.00 $11.36
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

Sylmar, CA $0.95 $5.63 $0.81 $1.09 $0.40 $1.02 $7.62 $10.06
Safety Services, Inc.

Kalamazoo, Ml 49048 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Moore Medical, LLC

New Britain, CT 06050 $1.75 $4.49 $1.00 $1.50 $0.36 $1.65 $12.59 $18.65
Watkins Surgical Supply

Muskegon, Ml 49444 $1.88 $6.38 $71.56/50 $77.50/50 $0.55 $1.31 $127.50/12 $161.63/6
Fisher Scientific Safety

Ada, MI 49301 $2.27 $6.07 $1.24 $1.95 $0.50 $2.03 $16.36 $24.25
Benson Drug Sav-Mor

Muskegon, M1 49442 $7.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




Page 1 (continued)

COMMODITY #:

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medical Supplies

___X_BID QUOTATION PROPOSAI

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Emergency Services

RFB 05-1432

OPENING DATE: 7/20/05

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received
No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Back Board Head Back Board | Medium 12" | Medium 18" Triangler Nubulizers Burn Sheets
Immobilizer Straps Splints Splints Bandage

Supreme Medical

Mobile, AL No Bid No Bid $4.54 $0.67 $0.84 No Bid No Bid $2.08
-Alternate- No Bid $4.58 Ea/24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.12 $0.86 Ea/50 No Bid
Tech + Med Industries

Indianapolis, IN $107.69 $5.14 $3.04 $0.71 $0.91 $3.15 $1.15 $4.30
Lab Safety Supply, Inc.

Janesville, WI 53547 No Bid No Bid $13.60 $1.40 $1.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Krasity’s Medical

Dearborn, Ml 48124 $134.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.88 $59.96/50 $5.98
Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY 11236 No Bid No Bid $4.18 $1.45 $1.90 $2.76 $1.36 $2.99
Laerdal Medical

Wappingers Falls, NY 12590 $161.10 $157.14/30 $10.35 $178.88/25 $223.88/25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH 43017 $111.22 $4.17 $6.93 $0.60 $0.75 $0.48 $1.25 $3.26
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

Sylmar, CA $94.15 $4.11 $3.98 $0.87 $0.96 $2.76 $0.70 $3.12
Safety Services, Inc.

Kalamazoo, Ml 49048 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Moore Medical, LLC

New Britain, CT 06050 $99.00 $3.75 $3.65 $1.35 $1.39 $2.65 $1.00 $4.19
Watkins Surgical Supply

Muskegon, Ml 49444 $158.71 $305.33/50 $6.88 $45.75/50 $56.75/50 $0.30 $65.63/50 $4.88
Fisher Scientific Safety

Ada, MI 49301 $136.20 $4.85 $5.60 $1.70 $1.78 $4.30 $1.23 $4.88
Benson Drug Sav-Mor

Muskegon, MI 49442 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson

WITNESS Name:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




Page 1 (continued)

COMMODITY #:

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medical Supplies

__X_BID QUOTATION PROPOSAI

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Emergency Services

RFB 05-1432

OPENING DATE: 7/20/05

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Dressing |Burn Dressing| Dressing Dressing Bandage 4" | Ace Bandage Gloves Gloves
30" x 12" 4" x 4" 5" x 9" 4" x 4" 4" Small Medium

Supreme Medical

Mobile, AL $1.29 Ea/24 No Bid $2.43 Ea/400 $4.33 No Bid $4.95 No Bid No Bid
-Alternate- $0.97 No Bid $2.07 No Bid $3.12 No Bid $5.86 $5.86
Tech + Med Industries

Indianapolis, IN $59.29/50 $7.01 $2.48 No Bid $6.45 $5.30 $8.32 $8.32
Lab Safety Supply, Inc.

Janesville, WI 53547 No Bid $4.50 No Bid No Bid $9.54 $13.14 $10.17 $10.17
Krasity’s Medical

Dearborn, M| 48124 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.50 $7.88 $7.88
Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY 11236 $0.76 $30.75 $2.18 $4.49 $3.34 $3.78 $5.68 $5.68
Laerdal Medical

Wappingers Falls, NY 12590 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH 43017 $1.15 $2.41 $2.77/TR $4.43/BX $3.43/BG $0.55 $7.45/BX $7.45/BX
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

Sylmar, CA $0.93 $39.94 $2.67/25 $4.26 $3.35 $5.10 $6.58 $6.58
Safety Services, Inc.

Kalamazoo, Ml 49048 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.47 $7.47
Moore Medical, LLC

New Britain, CT 06050 $1.14 $32.69 $2.19 $4.89 $4.09 $19.50 $7.40 $7.40
Watkins Surgical Supply

Muskegon, Ml 49444 $38.56/25 No Bid $35.64/144 $4.64 $6.15 $6.81 $6.13 $6.13
Fisher Scientific Safety

Ada, MI 49301 $1.45 $2.90 $3.25 $6.40 $5.15 $28.10 $4.65 $4.65
Benson Drug Sav-Mor

Muskegon, MI 49442 No Bid No Bid No Bid $111.49 $11.03 $5.37 $9.38 $9.38

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson




Page 1 (continued)

COMMODITY #:

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medical Supplies

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAI

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Emergency Services

RFB 05-1432

OPENING DATE: 7/20/05

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Gloves Gloves Utility Gloves | Utility Gloves | Utility Gloves | Utility Gloves OB Kit Respirator
Large X-Large Small Medium Large X-Large Regular
Supreme Medical
Mobile, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.96 $18.29/120
-Alternate- $5.86 $5.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tech + Med Industries
Indianapolis, IN $8.32 $8.32 $12.48 $12.48 $12.48 $12.48 $5.59 $19.00
Lab Safety Supply, Inc.
Janesville, W1 53547 $10.17 $10.17 $11.43 $11.43 $11.43 $11.43 $9.63 $19.17
Krasity’s Medical
Dearborn, Ml 48124 $7.88 $7.88 $105.00/Bx12 | $105.00/Bx12 | $105.00/Bx12 | $105.00/Bx12 No Bid $18.60
Ever Ready First Aid
Brooklyn, NY 11236 $5.68 $5.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.38 $8.36
Laerdal Medical
Wappingers Falls, NY 12590 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical, LLC
Dublin, OH 43017 $7.45/BX $7.45/BX No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.32/BX $18.71/BX
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.
Sylmar, CA $6.58 $6.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.60 $9.76 1 Size
Safety Services, Inc.
Kalamazoo, MI 49048 $7.47 $7.47 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.15
Moore Medical, LLC
New Britain, CT 06050 $7.40 $7.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.89 No Bid
Watkins Surgical Supply
Muskegon, MI 49444 $6.13 $6.13 $19.66 $19.66 $19.66 $19.66 $59.19/10 $18.75
Fisher Scientific Safety
Ada, MI 49301 $4.65 $4.65 $3.35 $3.35 $3.35 $3.35 $6.55 $10.15
Benson Drug Sav-Mor
Muskegon, M| 49442 $9.38 $9.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson

WITNESS Name:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




Page 1 (continued)

COMMODITY #:

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medical Supplies

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAI

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Emergency Services

RFB 05-1432

OPENING DATE: 7/20/05

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Respirator Gowns Safety Face Shield Coverall Coverall Coverall Coverall
Small Glasses Medium Large X-Large XX-Large

Supreme Medical

Mobile, AL $18.29/120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
-Alternate- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tech + Med Industries

Indianapolis, IN $19.00 No Bid No Bid $102.98/100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lab Safety Supply, Inc.

Janesville, WI 53547 $19.17 No Bid $3.02 $41.13 $146.70 $146.70 $146.70 $153.90
Krasity’s Medical

Dearborn, Ml 48124 $18.60 No Bid No Bid $99.98/100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY 11236 $8.36 No Bid $1.29 $25.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Laerdal Medical

Wappingers Falls, NY 12590 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH 43017 $18.71/BX $1.03 $4.35 $2.85 $101.36/CS $101.36/CS $101.36/CS $107.43/CS
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

Sylmar, CA $9.76 1 Size $17.65 $3.31 $21.96 $101.25 $101.25 $101.25 $106.50
Safety Services, Inc.

Kalamazoo, Ml 49048 $11.83 No Bid $2.16 No Bid $91.95 $91.95 $91.95 $96.57
Moore Medical, LLC

New Britain, CT 06050 No Bid $9.50 $2.25 $13.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Watkins Surgical Supply

Muskegon, Ml 49444 $18.75 $79.06/50 $3.74 $16.10 $162.31 $162.31 $162.31 $171.00
Fisher Scientific Safety

Ada, MI 49301 $11.15 $14.95 $2.15 $16.35 $87.50 $87.50 $87.50 $92.75
Benson Drug Sav-Mor

Muskegon, MI 49442 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson

WITNESS Name:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




Page 1 (continued)

COMMODITY #:

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medical Supplies

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAI

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Emergency Services

RFB 05-1432

OPENING DATE: 7/20/05

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Coverall Duct Tape Cloth Tape Disaster Sterile Sani-Cloth Tank Holder Oxygen
XXX-Large Pouch Water 6" x 6-3/4" Tubing

Supreme Medical

Mobile, AL No Bid No Bid $10.22 No Bid No Bid $5.23 Ea/12 No Bid $0.34 Ea/50
-Alternate- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.28 Ea/50
Tech + Med Industries

Indianapolis, IN No Bid No Bid $10.32 No Bid $1.09 $5.41 $153.22 $0.38
Lab Safety Supply, Inc.

Janesville, WI 53547 $162.00 No Bid No Bid $11.25 $3.15 $8.73 No Bid No Bid
Krasity’s Medical

Dearborn, M1 48124 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.76 No Bid $24.50/50
Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY 11236 No Bid No Bid $9.72 $43.54 $1.79 $5.89 No Bid $0.38
Laerdal Medical

Wappingers Falls, NY 12590 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH 43017 $113.86/CS $4.12/RL $10.60/BX $6.38 $1.33 $7.71 No Bid $0.29
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

Sylmar, CA $113.00 $3.74 $7.50 $8.65 $1.01 $5.96 $149.81 $0.24
Safety Services, Inc.

Kalamazoo, M| 49048 $101.39 $4.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Moore Medical, LLC

New Britain, CT 06050 No Bid $4.19 $10.00 $6.99 $1.09 $4.95 $175.00 $0.35
Watkins Surgical Supply

Muskegon, Ml 49444 No Bid No Bid $12.49 $2.39 $1.46 $5.59 $239.38 $0.41
Fisher Scientific Safety

Ada, MI 49301 $98.35 $4.05 $12.60 $9.20 $1.88 $6.15 $172.00 $0.42
Benson Drug Sav-Mor

Muskegon, MI 49442 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson




Page 1 (continued)

COMMODITY #:

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medical Supplies

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAI

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Emergency Services

RFB 05-1432

OPENING DATE: 7/20/05

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Waste Bags Collar Collar Bite Sticks | Stethoscope Blood Blood Blood
Peds Stifneck Pressure Pressure Pressure
Child Adult Large Adult

Supreme Medical

Mobile, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.33 $8.66 $8.00 $8.00 $11.33
-Alternate- No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tech + Med Industries

Indianapolis, IN $50.60/50 $5.14 $7.50 $3.15 $10.15 $16.81 $16.81 $21.31
Lab Safety Supply, Inc.

Janesville, W1 53547 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Krasity’s Medical

Dearborn, M| 48124 $58.00/250 No Bid No Bid $2.98 $9.76 $30.95 $30.95 $34.95
Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY 11236 No Bid No Bid $6.75 $0.28 $10.18 $10.00 $8.80 $9.00
Laerdal Medical

Wappingers Falls, NY 12590 No Bid $13.80 $13.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH 43017 $0.21 $5.55 $5.55 $0.33 $6.82 $11.48 $11.48 $11.48
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

Sylmar, CA No Bid $5.00 $5.58 $0.31 $5.82 $6.76 $6.50 $6.76
Safety Services, Inc.

Kalamazoo, M| 49048 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Moore Medical, LLC

New Britain, CT 06050 $7.49 $5.99 $5.99 $0.25 $5.75 $9.99 $9.99 $12.35
Watkins Surgical Supply

Muskegon, Ml 49444 No Bid $4.93 $443.18/50 $3.25/10 $9.99 $17.78 $11.43 $21.99
Fisher Scientific Safety

Ada, MI 49301 $9.30 $8.15 $7.40 $0.30 $8.50 $11.75 $11.95 $15.50
Benson Drug Sav-Mor

Muskegon, Ml 49442 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson




Page 1 (continued) MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

COMMODITY #: ~X__ BID QUOTATION ___ PROPOSAI RFB 05-1432 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medical Supplies DEPT: Emergency Services OPENING DATE: 7/20/05 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name Bandaids Blanket Triage Tags | Mobile Tool Notes
58" x 90" Cabinet

Supreme Medical

Mobile, AL $1.62 No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid
-Alternate- No Bid $2.55 No Bid No Bid See Bid
Tech + Med Industries

Indianapolis, IN $1.62 $3.71 $41.14 No Bid See Bid
Lab Safety Supply, Inc.

Janesville, WI 53547 $6.12 $7.11 $47.34 No Bid See Bid
Krasity’s Medical

Dearborn, M1 48124 $2.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid
Ever Ready First Aid

Brooklyn, NY 11236 $1.79 $4.88 No Bid No Bid See Bid
Laerdal Medical

Wappingers Falls, NY 12590 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid
Bound Tree Medical, LLC

Dublin, OH 43017 $3.06/BX $3.56 $42.40/PK No Bid See Bid
Tri-anim Health Services, Inc.

Sylmar, CA $2.30 $3.45 $45.88 No Bid See Bid
Safety Services, Inc.

Kalamazoo, M| 49048 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid
Moore Medical, LLC

New Britain, CT 06050 $2.25 $2.79 $37.59 No Bid See Bid
Watkins Surgical Supply

Muskegon, Ml 49444 $2.48/25 $73.69/18 $52.19 No Bid See Bid
Fisher Scientific Safety

Ada, MI 49301 $3.15 $4.30 $46.35 $216.00 See Bid
Benson Drug Sav-Mor

Muskegon, Ml 49442 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Bid
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:





