MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 13
COMMODITY #: 968-73 X BID QUOTATION __ PROPOSAL RFB 05-1435 No. of Bids Received 2
No. of No-Bids Received 0
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Sludge Removal - Lagoon Three DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 07/29/05 No. of Non-Response 0
* Base Bid - See attached for item description
Comments
Vendor Name Item ltem ltem Item Item Item Item Item Item
One Two Three Four Five Six Seven Eight Nine
Synagro Midwest, Inc.
2850 Noble Road $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,100.00 $29,680.00 $116,600.00 $189,960.00 Bid Bond - Yes
Williamston, Ml 48895
McCormick Sand Inc.
5430 Russell Road $0.00 $0.00 $368,000.00 $464,000.00 $464,000.00 $6,900.00 $35,840.00 $148,500.00 See Alt. Bid Bond - Yes
Twin Lake, Ml 49457 Ck #632104593
** Total Cost Bid -See attached for item description
Item ltem ltem Item Item Item Item Item Item
One Two Three Four Five Six Seven Eight Nine
Synagro Midwest, Inc.
2850 Noble Road $0.00 $0.00 $818,880.00 $818,880.00 $818,880.00 $6,100.00 $29,680.00 $116,600.00 $189,960.00 Bid Bond - Yes
Williamston, Ml 48895
McCormick Sand Inc.
5430 Russell Road No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Bid Bond - Yes
Twin Lake, Ml 49457 Ck #632104593
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Lynn Zatalokin
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: Purchasing Manager: Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




*Base Bid -

ltem Description
1. General Conditions, Bonds
2. Mobilization/Demobilization
3. Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to Ottawa County Farms Landfill
4, Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to Autumn Hills Recycling
5. Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to Central Landfill
6. Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to Muskegon County Landfill
7. Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to three sludge drying beds located just
west of Septic Hauler weigh station
8. Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to eight sludge drying beds located
west of field 27
9. Dewatering, Loading, Transport &

Land Application of sludge on about
600 acres as test plots for MDEQ -
Contractor to make arrangements for
lining up acreage for offsite land
application.

**Total Cost Bid -

ltem Description
1. General Conditions, Bonds
2. Mobilization/Demobilization
3. Sludge Dewatering,

Dewatering, Loading, Transport,
& Disposal at Ottawa County
Farms Landfill

4, Sludge Dewatering,
Dewatering, Loading, Transport,
& Disposal at Autumn Hills Recycling

5. Sludge Dewatering,
Dewatering, Loading, Transport,
& Disposal at Central Landfill

6. Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to Muskegon County Landfill

7. Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to three sludge drying beds located just
west of Septic Hauler weigh station

8. Dewatering, Loading, & Transport
to eight sludge drying beds located
west of field 27

9 Dewatering, Loading, Transport &
Land Application of sludge on about
600 acres as test plots for MDEQ.
Contractor to make arrangements for
lining up acreage for offsite land
application.




