MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 30
No. of Bids Received 11
COMMODITY #: 070-00 _x__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 19
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Health OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Light Duty Optional:
Vendor Name Pickup Truck Make Model Total Cost 4x4 COMMENTS
Red Holman Pontiac
35300 Gord Road No Bid
\Westland, M| 48185
Great Lakes Ford
2469 Apple Avenue Ford Ranger $12,819.00 $15,800.00
Muskegon, MI 49442
Garber Chevrolet
1700 N. Saginaw Road No Bid
Midland, MI 48640
Betten Chevrolet Cadillac Locking differential
2474 Henry Street Chevrolet Silverado $17,377.38 $20,807.64
Muskegon, Ml 49441
\arsity Ford
3480 Jackson Road Ford Ranger $12,634.00 $15,617.00 Carpet interior
Ann Arbor, Ml 48106
Family Auto
3146 Henry Street Dodge Dakota $19,260.00 $22,070.00 Cloth interior
Muskegon, Ml 49441
Tony Betten & Sons
3839 Plainfield, NE Ford F150 $14,361.00 $18,738.00
Grand Rapids, MI 49525 V8 engine

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

COMMODITY #: 070-00 _x__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Health OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Light Duty Optional:
Vendor Name Pickup Truck Make Model Total Cost 4x4 COMMENTS
Good GMC
4800 Clyde Park SW GMC Canyon $13,893.53
Wyoming, Ml 49509
Don Rypma Chevrolet
8130 Whitehall Road Chevrolet Silverado $11,947.00 $15,432.00
Whitehall, Ml 49461
Fremont Ford
7148 W. 48th Ford F150 $14,334.60 $18,681.60 No power windows
Fremont, Ml 49412
Signature Ford
1960 E. Main Street Ford Ranger $13,006.00 $15,900.00 Locking differential

Owosso, MI 48867

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 30

No. of Bids Received 11

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __x___ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 19
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Equalization OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name Mid-Size Make Model Total Cost COMMENTS
Sedan

Red Holman Pontiac
35300 Gord Road No Bid
\Westland, M| 48185

Great Lakes Ford
2469 Apple Avenue Ford Taurus $11,820.00
Muskegon, MI 49442

Garber Chevrolet
1700 N. Saginaw Road Chevrolet Impala $16,231.00
Midland, MI 48640

Betten Chevrolet Cadillac
2474 Henry Street Chevrolet Malibu $17,743.49
Muskegon, MI 49441

\arsity Ford
3480 Jackson Road Ford Fusion SE $18,795.00
Ann Arbor, MI 48106

Family Auto
3146 Henry Street Chrysler Sebring $18,503.00
Muskegon, MI 49441

Tony Betten & Sons
3839 Plainfield, NE Ford Taurus $11,867.00
Grand Rapids, MI 49525

DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:



COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFB 06-1459

DEPT: Equalization OPENING DATE: 1/19/06

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name

Mid-Size
Sedan

Make Model Total Cost

COMMENTS

Good GMC
4800 Clyde Park SW
Wyoming, Ml 49509

No Bid

Don Rypma Chevrolet
8130 Whitehall Road
Whitehall, MI 49461

Chevrolet Malibu $14,287.00

Fremont Ford
7148 W. 48th
Fremont, Ml 49412

Ford Taurus $11,877.60

Signature Ford
1960 E. Main Street
Owosso, Ml 48867

Ford Taurus $12,478.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 30

No. of Bids Received 11

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __Xx__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 19
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Family Court OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name Full-Size Make Model Total COMMENTS
Sedan Cost
Red Holman Pontiac
35300 Gord Road No Bid
\Westland, M| 48185
Great Lakes Ford
2469 Apple Avenue Ford Taurus $12,420.00
Muskegon, MI 49442
Garber Chevrolet
1700 N. Saginaw Road Chevrolet Impala $16,429.00
Midland, Ml 48640
Betten Chevrolet Cadillac
2474 Henry Street Chevrolet Impala $16,584.35 Did not respond to shield
Muskegon, MI 49441
\arsity Ford
3480 Jackson Road Ford Taurus $12,178.00
Ann Arbor, MI 48106
Family Auto
3146 Henry Street No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tony Betten & Sons
3839 Plainfield, NE Ford Taurus $11,867.00 No security Shield

Grand Rapids, MI 49525

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received
COMMODITY #: 070-00 __Xx__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Family Court OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Full-Size Make Model Total COMMENTS
Sedan Cost

Good GMC
4800 Clyde Park SW No Bid
Wyoming, Ml 49509
Don Rypma Chevrolet
8130 Whitehall Road Chevrolet Impala| $15,393.00
\Whitehall, Ml 49461
Fremont Ford
7148 W. 48th Ford Taurus| $12,377.60
Fremont, Ml 49412
Signature Ford
1960 E. Main Street Ford Taurus| $12,870.50 See bid alternates
Owosso, Ml 48867

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:



MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 30

No. of Bids Received 11

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __Xx__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 19
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Prosecutor OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name Full-Size Make Model Total Cost COMMENTS
Sedan

Red Holman Pontiac
35300 Gord Road No Bid
\Westland, M| 48185

Great Lakes Ford
2469 Apple Avenue Ford Taurus $12,123.00 No bid rear wheel drive
Muskegon, MI 49442

Garber Chevrolet
1700 N. Saginaw Road Chevrolet Impala $17,186.00 No bid rear wheel drive
Midland, MI 48640

Betten Chevrolet Cadillac
2474 Henry Street Chevrolet Impala $16,294.35 No bid rear wheel drive
Muskegon, MI 49441

\arsity Ford
3480 Jackson Road Ford Taurus $12,183.00 No bid rear wheel drive
Ann Arbor, MI 48106

Family Auto
3146 Henry Street No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441

Tony Betten & Sons
3839 Plainfield, NE Ford Taurus $12,132.00 No full size spare
Grand Rapids, MI 49525

DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:



COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Prosecutor

RFB 06-1459

OPENING DATE: 1/19/06

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Full-Size Make Model Total Cost COMMENTS
Sedan
Good GMC
4800 Clyde Park SW No Bid
Wyoming, Ml 49509
Don Rypma Chevrolet
8130 Whitehall Road Chevrolet Impala $14,924.00 No bid rear wheel drive
Whitehall, Ml 49461 No full size spare
Fremont Ford
7148 W. 48th Ford Taurus $12,073.60
Fremont, Ml 49412 Crown Vic. $19,698.60
Signature Ford
1960 E. Main Street Ford Taurus $12,831.00
Owosso, M| 48867 Five Hundred $18,958 fwd $20,571 rwd
Crown Vic. $19,768.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 30

No. of Bids Received 11

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __Xx__ BID QUOTATION __ PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 19
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: CMH OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name 15 Passenger Van Mid-Size 12 Passenger COMMENTS
Van Conversion Sedan Van
Red Holman Pontiac GMC GMC
35300 Gord Road Savana No Bid No Bid Savana Wheel well distance 50.5 inch
\Westland, M| 48185 $21,314.00 ea $19,715.00 on 15 passenger
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford Ford No power mirrors on 15 pass.
2469 Apple Avenue E350 No Bid Taurus E350
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $21,662.00 $11,770.00 $20,651.00
each
Garber Chevrolet Chevrolet| Millenium roof Chevrolet Chevrolet
1700 N. Saginaw Road Express Braun lift Malibu Express
Midland, MI 48640 $21,633.00 ea $9,960.00 $13,782.00 $21,799.00
each
Betten Chevrolet Cadillac Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet After market running boards
2474 Henry Street Express No Bid Malibu Express 50.5 inch wheel well distance
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $22,732.90 ea $17,795.97 $22,447.90
each
\arsity Ford Ford| Millenium roof Ford Ford Not power mirrors
3480 Jackson Road E350 Braun lift Fusion SE E350
Ann Arbor, Ml 48106 $20,713.00 ea $8,795 ea $18,822.00 $19,702.00
each
Family Auto Chrysler
3146 Henry Street No Bid No Bid Sebring No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441 $18,890.00
each
Tony Betten & Sons Ford Ford Ford
3839 Plainfield, NE E350 No Bid Taurus E350
Grand Rapids, Ml 49525 $21,612.00 ea $11,867.00 $19,921.00
each

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:




COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: CMH

RFB 06-1459

OPENING DATE: 1/19/06

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name 15 Passenger Van Mid-Size 12 Passenger COMMENTS
Van Conversion Sedan Van
Good GMC GMC GMC No running boards
4800 Clyde Park SW Savana No Bid No Bid Savana
\Wyoming, MI 49509 $21,799.59 ea $21,702.74
Don Rypma Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet
8130 Whitehall Road Express No Bid Malibu Express
Whitehall, Ml 49461 $21,128.00 ea $14,297.00 $20,996.00
each
Fremont Ford Ford Ford Ford
7148 W. 48th E350 No Bid Taurus E350
Fremont, Ml 49412 $21,765.72 ea $11,947.60 $21,655.72
each
Signature Ford Ford Ford Ford
1960 E. Main Street E350 No Bid Taurus E350
Owosso, M| 48867 $21,629.00 ea $12,640.00 $19,957.00
each

Gresham Driving Aids
PO Box 930334
Wixom, MI 48393

Millenium roof
Braun lift
$8,795.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 30

No. of Bids Received 11

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __Xx__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 19
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Sheriff OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name Make Model Cost per COMMENTS
Vehicle
Red Holman Pontiac
35300 Gord Road No Bid
\Westland, M| 48185
Great Lakes Ford
2469 Apple Avenue Ford Taurus $11,708.00
Muskegon, MI 49442
Garber Chevrolet
1700 N. Saginaw Road Chevrolet Impala $15,945.00
Midland, Ml 48640
Betten Chevrolet Cadillac
2474 Henry Street Chevrolet Impala $16,294.35
Muskegon, MI 49441
\arsity Ford
3480 Jackson Road Ford Taurus $11,767.00
Ann Arbor, MI 48106
Family Auto
3146 Henry Street No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tony Betten & Sons
3839 Plainfield, NE Ford Taurus $11,867.00
Grand Rapids, MI 49525

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __Xx__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Sheriff OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name Make Model Cost per COMMENTS
Vehicle
Good GMC
4800 Clyde Park SW No Bid
Wyoming, Ml 49509
Don Rypma Chevrolet
8130 Whitehall Road Chevrolet Impala $14,924.00 No full size spare
Whitehall, Ml 49461
Fremont Ford
7148 W. 48th Ford Taurus $12,353.60
Fremont, Ml 49412
Signature Ford Taurus $12,561.00
1960 E. Main Street Ford| Five Hundred $18,958.00
Owosso, Ml 48867 Crown Vic. $19,768.00

DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 30

No. of Bids Received 11

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __Xx__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 19
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name One-Ton 3/4 Ton 3/4 Ton Short Box COMMENTS

Cab & Chassis| Pickup Truck | Pickup Truck [ Pickup Truck
Red Holman Pontiac GMC GMC GMC GMC Short box - all season tires
35300 Gord Road Sierra Sierra Sierra Canyon
Westland, Ml 48185 $35,351.00 $17,935.00 $18,005.00 $16,768.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford N/A skid plates
2469 Apple Avenue F350 F250 F250 F150
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $49,034.00 $22,248.00 $22,148.00 $20,939.00
Garber Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet
1700 N. Saginaw Road Silverado Silverado Silverado Colorado
Midland, MI 48640 $36,890.00 $18,378.00 $18,378.00 $17,186.00
Betten Chevrolet Cadillac Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet
2474 Henry Street Silverado Silverado Silverado Silverado
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $34,778.42 $19,021.62 $19,067.27 $20,344.60
\arsity Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford Short box - see hub exception
3480 Jackson Road F350 F250 F250 F150
Ann Arbor, Ml 48106 $41,561.00 $23,526.00 $23,825.00 $19,196.00
Family Auto Dodge Dodge Dodge
3146 Henry Street No Bid Ram 2500 Ram 2500 Dakota ST
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $25,340.00 $25,060.00 $21,160.00
Tony Betten & Sons Ford Ford Ford Short box - no auto lock hubs
3839 Plainfield, NE No Bid F250 F250 F150 No spot light, no skid plates
Grand Rapids, Ml 49525 $24,399.00 $24,554.00 $20,270.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Lynn Zatalokin

Signature:

Signature:




COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

X

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater

BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFB 06-1459

OPENING DATE: 1/19/06

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name One-Ton 3/4 Ton 3/4 Ton Short Box COMMENTS
Cab & Chassis| Pickup Truck | Pickup Truck | Pickup Truck
Good GMC GMC GMC GMC GMC See bid for alternates on cab &
4800 Clyde Park SW Sierra Sierra Sierra Canyon chassis. No floor mats 3/4 ton
\Wyoming, MI 49509 $34,541.73 $18,601.00 $18,645.00 $16,522.23 and cab chassis. No spot
light
Don Rypma Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet
8130 Whitehall Road Silverado Silverado Silverado Silverado
Whitehall, Ml 49461 $34,939.00 $16,498.00 $16,549.00 $17,593.00
Fremont Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford
7148 W. 48th F350 F250 F250 F150
Fremont, Ml 49412 $41,735.67 $20,161.67 $20,156.67 $20,511.71
Signature Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford No skid plates
1960 E. Main Street F350 F250 F250 F150
Owosso, M| 48867 $38,367.00 $19,371.00 $19,371.00 $19,233.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

Signature:

Signature:




COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Transit

No. of Bids Mailed 30

No. of Bids Received 11

RFB 06-1459 No. of No-Bids Received 0

No. of Non-Response 19

OPENING DATE: 1/19/06 No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Compact Compact Pickup COMMENTS
Sedan Hatchback w/ Plow
Red Holman Pontiac GMC 600 cca battery
35300 Gord Road No Bid Sierra Seats 40/20/40 split
Westland, M| 48185 $19,725.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford Ford
2469 Apple Avenue Focus Focus F150
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $12,241.00 $12,864.00 $24,372.00
Garber Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet
1700 N. Saginaw Road Cobalt Silverado
Midland, MI 48640 $11,821.00 $20,325.00
Betten Chevrolet Cadillac Chevrolet Chevrolet
2474 Henry Street Cobalt Silverado
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $12,430.64 $21,837.34
\arsity Ford Ford Ford Ford 650 cca battery
3480 Jackson Road Focus Focus F150
Ann Arbor, Ml 48106 $11,739.00 $12,462.00 $23,193.00
Family Auto Chrysler Chrysler Dodge
3146 Henry Street PT Cruiser PT Cruiser Ram
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $15,594.00 $15,594.00 $26,210.00
Tony Betten & Sons Ford
3839 Plainfield, NE Focus No Bid
Grand Rapids, Ml 49525 $12,141.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Transit

RFB 06-1459

OPENING DATE: 1/19/06

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Compact Compact Pickup COMMENTS
Sedan Hatchback w/ Plow

Good GMC GMC 770 cca battery

4800 Clyde Park SW No Bid Sierra

Wyoming, Ml 49509 $21,813.62

Don Rypma Chevrolet Chevrolet Chevrolet No floor mats

8130 Whitehall Road Cobalt Silverado

Whitehall, Ml 49461 $10,888.00 $18,267.00

Fremont Ford Ford Ford Ford

7148 W. 48th Focus Focus F150

Fremont, Ml 49412 $11,702.36 $14,018.36 $22,602.60

Signature Ford Ford Ford Ford Focus sedan price does not

1960 E. Main Street Focus Focus F150 include power windows & lock

Owosso, M| 48867 $12,196.00 $12,859.00 $23,671.00 See bid Alternate for truck
540 cca battery

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:



