Page 1 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 8
No. of Bids Received 7
COMMODITY #: 675-45 _X__BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 06-1475 No. of No-Bids Received 1
No. of Non-Response 0
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 2/22/06 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Dual Il Roundup Request Prowel Eptam Pursuit DG
Vendor Name Magnum Max 3.3EC (Bulk) COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis $91.82 $23.50 Brone Acumen No Bid $8.23
4160 10 Mile Road $12,395.70 $16,450.00 Max $18.10 $14,221.44
Sparta, Ml 49345 $10.43 $4,706.00
Daylight Enterprises $78.75 $21.54 $19.00 $16.58 $23.50 $8.58
280 S. Ringle Road $10,631.25 $15,078.00 $4,750.00 $4,310.80 $5,170.00 $14,826.25
Fairgrove, MI 48733
Royster Clark, Inc. $84.60 $25.12 Amaze Gold $17.72 No Bid $9.60
11471 Lake Michigan Drive $11,421.00 $17,584.00 $3.86 $4,607.20 $16,588.80
West Olive, M| 49460 $2,547.00
Helena Chemical Co. $86.50 $22.50 $19.00 $17.25 $22.50 $8.60 |May not have Pursuit in DG
349 Wilson Road $11,677.50 $15,750.00 $4,750.00 $4,485.00 $4,950.00 $14,860.80
Conklin, MI 49403
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. $76.84 $21.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2327 - 64th $10,373.40 $15,288.00
Zeeland, M| 49464
Troyer Growers Supply Parallel $23.92 Synurgize $15.67 Eptech Pursuit
16496 124th Street $40.20 $16,744.00 $8.45 $4,074.20 $20.11 $394.83
Nunica, MI 49448 $5,427.00 $2,788.50 $4,424.20 $14,806.12
UAP Distribution Inc. $82.00 $23.00 Choice $16.50 $22.00 $445.00
9755 W. Grand Ledge Hwy $11,070.00 $16,100.00 $13.00 $4,290.00 $4,840.00 $16,910.00
Sunfield, Ml 48890 $3,250.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:
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COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X__BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater

RFB 06-1475

OPENING DATE: 2/22/06

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Buctril Beacon Permit Surfactant Baythroid R-56
Vendor Name COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis $56.33 $23.59 $15.22 R-11 $300.00 $18.44
$5,351.35 $1,792.84 $5,282.86 $13.69 $2,400.00 $1,383.00
$410.70
Daylight Enterprises $47.90 $23.82 $16.34 $9.75 $278.00 $26.00
$4,550.50 $1,882.73 $5,671.61 $292.50 $2,224.00 $1,950.00
Royster Clark, Inc. $56.36 $24.90 $17.12 $10.34 $253.80 $28.60
$5,354.20 $1,879.95 $5,969.06 $310.20 $2,030.40 $2,145.00
Helena Chemical Co. $52.50 $21.25 $14.50 | Adspray 90 $275.00 $34.35
$4,987.50 $1,677.90 $5,055.72 $14.90 $2,200.00 $2,576.25
$447.00
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Troyer Growers Supply $49.46 $24.43 $14.28 $10.09 $256.44 No Bid
$4,698.70 $2,042.34 $4,952.87 $302.70 $2,051.52
UAP Distribution Inc. $52.50 $23.50 $15.25 | Spreador 90 $325.00 | Activator 90
$4,987.50 $1,856.50 $5,322.25 $10.00 $2,600.00 $14.50
$300.00 $1,087.50
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




Page 3

COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Wastewater

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY
RFB 06-1475

OPENING DATE: 2/22/06

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Bayfolan 0-0-6 ESN
Vendor Name Plus Potash COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis Alfalfa Gold $230.00 Availability
$0.70 $40,250.00 uncertain
per pound per mfg.
Daylight Enterprises $15.50 No Bid No Bid| Mee-too-Ichor Acuman
$11,625.00 $50.00 $15.25
$6,750.00 $3,965.00
Royster Clark, Inc. Folian $236.00 $465.00
$8.60 $41,300.00 $79,050.00
$6,450.00
Helena Chemical Co. $15.50 $228.00 $485.00
$11,625.00 $39,900.00 $82,450.00
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Troyer Growers Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid
UAP Distribution Inc. Quick Boost No Bid No Bid
$10.00
$7,500.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name:

Christian Toebe

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




