COMMODITY #: 998-05

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Alfalfa Sale

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

__X_BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Wastewater/Farm

RFB 07-1534

OPENING DATE: 2-15-07

No. of Bids Mailed 8

No. of Bids Received 3

No. of No-Bids Received 0

No. of Non-Response 5

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Vendor Name Field 3 Field 13 Field 4A Field 5 Field 16 Field 17 COMMENTS
Den Dulk Dairy
Coopersville, Ml 49404 $17.50/Ton $17.75/Ton No Bid No Bid $23.00/Ton $24.50/Ton
Beaver Creek Farms
Coopersville, Ml 49404 $18.00/Ton $18.00/Ton No Bid No Bid $24.00/Ton $24.00/Ton
Brian Ryzebol
Bailey, MI 49303 No Bid No Bid $24.00/Ton $24.00/Ton No Bid No Bid
Vendor Name Field 37 Field 39 Field 40 Field 45 Field 48 COMMENTS
Den Dulk Dairy No Bid $19.00/Ton No Bid $24.00/Ton $19.00/Ton
Beaver Creek Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brian Ryzebol $24.00/Ton No Bid $19.00/Ton No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson




