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COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater

BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFB 07-1536

OPENING DATE: 2/22/06

No. of Bids Mailed 7

No. of Bids Received 6

No. of No-Bids Received 0

No. of Non-Response 1

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Roundup Request Prowl H20 Eptam Pursuit Postman
Vendor Name Original COMMENTS
Max
Wilbur Ellis $20.63 $0.85 $22.20 $26.51 $37.72 $5.90
4160 10 Mile Road $20,630.00 perlb.| $11,877.00 $8,615.75 $1,697.40 $3,894.00
Sparta, Ml 49345 Cut Rate Plus EC
Daylight Enterprises $22.50 $17.50 $19.00 $26.00 $427.00 $5.85
280 S. Ringle Road $22,500.00 $5,250.00 $10,165.00 $8,450.00 $19,215.00 $3,861.00
Fairgrove, MI 48733
Crop Production Services $23.50 $24.50 $26.00 $470.00 $20.00
11471 Lake Michigan Drive $2,350.00 No Bid $13,107.50 $8,450.00 $21,150.00 $13,200.00
West Olive, M| 49460
Helena Chemical Co. $23.05 $17.50 $24.30 $22.50 $405.08 $21.76
349 Wilson Road $23,050.00 $5,250.00 $13,000.50 $7,312.50 $18,228.60 $14,361.60
Conklin, MI 49403 Pholex
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. $20.98 $47.86
2327 - 64th $20,980.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,153.70 $0.00
Zeeland, Ml 49464
Tri State Growers Supply $20.99 $7.50 $22.30 $399.00 $5.75
16496 124th Street $20,990.00 $2,250.00 $11,930.50 $0.00 $17,955.00 $3,795.00
Nunica, M| 49448 Synurgize

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name:

Christian Toebe

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




Page 2 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed
No. of Bids Received
COMMODITY #: 675-45 _X__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 07-1536 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 2/22/06 No. of Web Bids Received
Baythroid R-56 ENC Potash ESN Alternates
Vendor Name COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis $251.00 $18.00 .70 /1b $231.00
$25,100.00 $3,150.00 $32,340.00 No Bid
Alfalfa Gold
Daylight Enterprises $255.56 $19.00 $15.45 $10.80
$25,556.00 $3,325.00 $20,703.00 No Bid No Bid $2,205.00 [$3,240.00
Adspray 90 [HMO-650
Crop Production Services $320.00 $20.00 $14.50 $231.00 $465.00
$32,000.00 $3,500.00 $19,430.00 $32,340.00 $104,625.00
Helena Chemical Co. $262.00 $12.60 $15.50 $231.00 $485.00 $10.80
$26,200.00 $2,205.00 $20,770.00 $32,340.00 $109,125.00 $3,240.00
AdSpray 90 HM0650 AMS
Farmers Coop Elevator Co.
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Tri State Growers Supply $5.25
$0.00 $918.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Jette 80/20

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

Christian Toebe

Signature:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:






