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COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Various

RFB 08-1569

OPENING DATE: 11/13/07

No. of Bids Mailed 33

No. of Bids Received 10

No. of No-Bids Received 1

No. of Non-Response 22

No. of Web Bids Received 0

CMH CMH w/w w/w wW/w w/w SW 1 SW 2
Vendor Name 15-Passenger | Conversion 1/2 ton Suv Cab & Chassis Body 1/2 ton Truck | 1/2 ton Truck COMMENTS
Van Truck Maintainer 4x4 ext cab 4x4 ext cab
4x4

Signature Ford Ford E350 Ford Ford Ford Ford

1960 E. Main Street $20,627.00 No Bid F150| Expedition XLT No Bid No Bid [F150 Super cab F150 Super Cab

Owosso, MI 48867 $41,254.00 $18,154.00 $28,984.00 $21,522.00 $21,412.00

Don Rypma Chevy Express Chevy Chevy Chevy Chevy

8130 Whitehall Road $23,618.00 No Bid Silverado Tahoe No Bid No Bid Silverado Silverado

Whitehall, MI 49461 $47,236.00 $19,396.00 $32,119.00 Extended Cab| Extended Cab
$23,390.00 $23,329.00

Great Lakes Ford Ford E350 Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford

2469 Apple Avenue $19,377.00 No Bid F150| Explorer XLT F450 No Bid [F150 Super cab Ford

Muskegon, MI 49442 $38,754.00 $17,402.00 $23,590.00 $32,253.00 $19,814.00 $19,714.00

Varsity Ford Ford E350 Sampson

3480 Jackson Road $19,381.74 $8,795.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ann Arbor, M| 48106 $58,763.48 $17,590.00

Good GMC GMC Savana Millennium GMC GMC GMC Allied GMC GMC

4800 Clyde Park $23,328.67 $14,475.00 Sierra 1500 Yukon 1500 Topkick 4500 ATS 103 Sierra 1500 Sierra 1500

Wyoming, Ml 49509 $46,657.34 $28,950.00 $20,148.90 $29,907.15 $39,693.72 $55,854.00 $23,428.95 $25,451.25

Fremont Ford Ford E350 Millennium Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford

7148 W. 48th $20,669.00 $15,461.00 F150 Explorer F450 F150 Super cab F150 Super Cab

Fremont, M| 49412 $41,338.00 $30,922.00 $17,460.00 $23,561.00 $31,861.00 $57,854.00 $20,689.00 $20,689.00

Family Auto Center Dodge Dodge Dodge Dodge

3146 Henry Street No Bid No Bid Ram 1500| Durango SXT No Bid No Bid Ram 1500 Ram 1500

Muskegon, MI 49441 $22,255.00 $27,805.00 $27,151.00 $27,330.00

DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
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COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Various

RFB 08-1569

OPENING DATE: 11/13/07

No. of Bids Mailed 33

No. of Bids Received 10

No. of No-Bids Received 1

No. of Non-Response 22

No. of Web Bids Received 0

CMH CMH w/w w/w w/w w/w SW 1 Sw 2
Vendor Name 15-Passenger | Conversion 1/2 ton Suv Cab & Chassis Body 1/2 ton Truck | 1/2 ton Truck COMMENTS
Van Truck Maintainer 4x4 ext cab 4x4 ext cab
4x4
Red Holman Pontiac GMC Savana GMC GMC GMC GMC GMC
35300 Ford Road $22,880.00 No Bid Sierra Yukon C4500 Sierra Sierra
Westland, M| 48185 $45,760.00 $18,738.00 $30,512.00 $38,621.00 $55,854.00 $22,236.00 $22,439.00
Clock Conversions Millennium
6700 Clay Avenue, SW No Bid $14,461.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, MI 49548 $28,922.00
Mobility Transportation Ford E350 Millennium
42000 Kuppernick #A3 $18,977.00 $8,725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Canton, Ml 48187 $37,954.00 $17,450.00




