Page 1 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 7
No. of Bids Received 5
COMMODITY #: 675-45 _X__BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 08-1579 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 2
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 2/4/08 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Roundup Headline Quadris Quilt Prowl 3.3EC Pursuit
Vendor Name Power Fungicide Fungicide Fungicide or Equivalent COMMENTS
Max
Wilbur Ellis $38.00 $210.00 $254.85 No Bid $19.78 No Bid
4160 10 Mile Road, NW $42,370.00 $10,500.00 | $12,742.50 $7,813.10
Sparta, Ml 49345 Acumen
Daylight Enterprises $36.90 $206.00 $202.00 $104.66 $20.25 $482.62 |RoundUp - Alternate
280 S. Ringle Road $41,143.00 $10,300.00 $10,100.00 $11,512.60 $7,998.75 $2,413.10 |Touchdown $32.50
Fairgrove, Ml 48733 $39,520.00
Troyer Grower Supply No Bid $208.00 $209.00 $101.00 $16.95 $412.00
16496 124th Street $10,400.00 $10,450.00 $11,110.00 $6,695.25 $2,060.00
Nunica, M| 49448
Helena Chemical Co. $37.60 $202.00 $228.22 $111.40 $18.59 $453.60
349 Wilson Road $41,924.00 $10,100.00 $11,411.00 $12,254.00 $7,343.05 $2,268.00
Conklin, MI 49403
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. $36.90 $245.00 $252.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3300 Prospect Street $41,143.50 $12,250.00 $12,600.00

Hudsonville, Ml 49426

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Low Bid that meets Specs

for each item

Concur

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
WITNESS Name:

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

Christine Johnson

Signature:

Signature:

Low Bid that meets Specs, DPW Board Approved 02/14/08 - PO#




Page 2 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed
No. of Bids Received
COMMODITY #: 675-45 _X__BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 08-1579 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 2/4/08 No. of Web Bids Received
Postman Baythroid R-56 ENC Bronc Max Alternates
Vendor Name COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis No Bid $278.76 $18.83 No Bid $12.00
$15,053.04 $2,353.75 $2,160.00
XL AMS Cut Rate
Daylight Enterprises $6.70 $208.92 $22.92 $15.00 $17.50 Postman -
$13,400.00 $11,281.68 $2,865.00 $46,500.00 $3,150.00 Tracite | Alternate does not meet
$11,000.00 |specifications
Troyer Grower Supply $6.10 $206.25 $7.45 $4.85 $5.97
$12,200.00 $11,137.50 $931.25 $15,035.00 $2,686.50 R-56 alternate does not meet
Surfac 820|12-4-6 Micros | AMS Supreme specifications
Helena Chemical Co. No Bid $190.00 $15.50 $15.35 $14.50
$10,260.00 $1,937.50 $47,585.00 $2,610.00 R-56 alternate does not meet
Adspray specifications
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Page 3

COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater

RFB 08-1579

OPENING DATE: 2/4/08

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

0-0-61 ESN
Vendor Name Potash COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis $450.00 No Bid
$76,500.00
0-0-52
Daylight Enterprises No Bid No Bid
Troyer Grower Supply No Bid No Bid
Helena Chemical Co. $488.00 No Bid
$82,960.00
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. No Bid No Bid




