MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 11
No. of Bids Received 7
COMMODITY #: 968-72 _X__ BID QUOTATION __ PROPOSAL RFB 08-1617 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 4
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Snow Plowing / Snow Removal DEPT: DET/Facilities Mgmt OPENING DATE: 10/9/08 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Hall of Gov’t DET CVB Animal Sheriff Total Volume Comments
Vendor Name Justice Complex Shelter Garage Bid Discount
Free Lance Enterprise $17,000.00 | $13,750.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 | $39,750.00 | $39,000.00
1385 East Keating
Muskegon, MI 49442 $350.00 $350.00 $175.00 $175.00 $100.00 $175.00
Frey’s Landcare & Snow Plow| $22,700.00 | $23,500.00 $6,700.00 $4,150.00 $3,700.00 $6,500.00 | $67,250.00 | $64,963.00
37 N. Main
Casnovia, M1 49318 $600.00 $625.00 $180.00 $110.00 $110.00 $175.00
Bill Tysman Snowplowing $18,246.38 | $14,608.13 $1,706.88 $1,837.50 $606.38 $1,500.00 | $38,505.27 | $38,505.27
17114 Robbins Road
Grand Haven, M1 49417 No Charge| No Charge| No Charge| No Charge| No Charge|[ No Charge
Acme Tree No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| $2,150.00 $1,850.00
4074 Apple Avenue
Muskegon, MI 49442 $100.00 $90.00
Borgman Tree Service $22,000.00 | $18,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 No Bid| $45,500.00 | $45,500.00 |Sheriff maint.
1596 S. Hilton Park garage not
Muskegon, MI 49442 $1,000.00 $900.00 $100.00 $100.00 $75.00 included
Franklin Contractors, Inc. $17,500.00 | $22,500.00 $4,992.00 $2,492.00 $2,499.00 $1,500.00 | $51,483.00 | $47,483.00
3500 South Getty Street
Muskegon, Ml 49444 $875.00 $1,125.00 $249.00 $125.00 $125.00 $75.00
Lakeshore Supply $26,000.00 | $20,000.00 $3,300.00 $3,150.00 $1,350.00 $1,200.00 | $55,000.00 | $53,000.00
2621 S. Getty
Muskegon, MI 49442 $250.00 $250.00 $85.00 $70.00 $55.00 $55.00
* Bids are based on 2008/2009 season.
* Top dollar amount is total per lot per season. Bottom dollar amount is time per plow for 2nd plow if needed in a day
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Joseph Siendenstrang Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:



