COMMODITY #: 070-00
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** Vehicle prices are per vehicle price * *

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

DEPT: Various

x___BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

RFB 09-1625

OPENING DATE: 1/2/09

CMH
Vendor Name 15 - Passengen 15-Passenger|15-Passenger Van Mid-Size Sedan Sedan 12-Passenger
Van Alternative Used Conversion Sedan Alternative Used Van
Fuel Fuel
Red Holman Pontiac GMC Pontiac Pontiac GMC
35300 Ford Road Savana 3500 |N/A No Bid No Bid G6 G6 No Bid Savana 3500
Westland, Mi 48185 $23,945.00 $16,356.00 |add $23,537.00
$1,492.00
Family Auto Center Dodge
3146 Henry Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Avenger SXT |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441 $18,174.00
Don Rypma Chevy Chevy Chevy
8130 Whitehall Road Express No Bid No Bid No Bid Malibu N/A No Bid Express
Whitehall, MI 49461 $26,634.00 $18,998.00 $25,847.00
Signature Ford Ford No Charge Ford
1960 E. Main Street E350 E85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid E350
Owosso, MI 48867 $23,148.00 $20,963.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford No Charge Ford 2007 Fusion |[Ford
2469 Apple Avenue E350 E85 No Bid No Bid Fusion N/A 21,000 miles [E350
Muskegon, MI 49442 $21,042.00 $17,346.00 $12,850.00 [$19,670.00
Don Seelye Ford Ford No Charge
3820 Stadium Drive E350 E85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kalamazoo, MI 49008 $30,577.00
Varsity Ford Ford No Charge Millenium
3480 Jackson Road E350 E85 No Bid Braun No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ann Arbor, MI 48106 $19,924.00 $8,695.00
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Joe Siedenstrang Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




COMMODITY #: 070-00
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_x__ BID QUOTATION __ PROPOSAL
** Vehicle prices are per vehicle price * *
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

DEPT: Various

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

RFB 09-1625

OPENING DATE: 1/2/09

Health Family Court Wastewater
Vendor Name Light Dty TrucklLight Dty Truck]  Full-Size Sedan Cab & Chass | Cab & Chass |Full Crew Cabull Crew Truck
4x4 CNG Sedan Alternative w/ Plow Alternative Truck Alternative
Fuel Fuel Fuel
Red Holman Pontiac GMC Canyon GMC GMC No Charge
Add N/A No Bid No Bid Sierra 3500 |N/A Sierra 1500 |E85
$3,607.00 $41,503.00 $24,924.00
Family Auto Center
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Don Rypma Chevy Chevy No Charge Chevy Chevy No Charge
Add N/A Impala E85 CK31404 N/A Silverado E85
$3,208.00 $19,868.00 $43,085.00 $25,377.00
Signature Ford Ford Ranger Ford Ford No Charge
Add N/A No Bid No Bid F350 N/A F150 E85
$2,639.00 $37,393.00 24344
Super Cab
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ranger Ford Ford Ford No Charge
Add N/A Taurus N/A XL N/A F150 E85
$2,431.00 $20,673.00 $29,202.00 $26,725.00
Don Seelye Ford
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Varsity Ford
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Joe Siedenstrang Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




Page 3 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __Xx___BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 09-1625
** Vehicle prices are per vehicle price * *
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Various OPENING DATE: 1/2/09
Parks
Vendor Name 3/4 Ton 3/4 Truck Alternate
Truck Alternative
Fuel
Red Holman Pontiac GMC
Sierra 2500 [N/A
$28,752.00
Family Auto Center
No Bid No Bid
Don Rypma Chevy
Silverado N/A
$31,122.00
Signature Ford Ford w/w
F250 N/A One Ton F350
27180 Cab & Chass |38696
Great Lakes Ford Ford
F250 N/A
29383.93
Don Seelye Ford
No Bid No Bid
Varsity Ford
No Bid No Bid
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:

PURCHASING



RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Joe Siedenstrang Signature:




No. of Bids Mailed 32

No. of Bids Received 10

No. of No-Bids Received 4

No. of Non-Response 17
No. of Web Bids Received 1 late
Health
12-Passenger|12-Passenger 1/2 Ton 1/2 Ton Truck| Mid-Size Sedan Light Duty COMMENTS
Alternative Used Truck CNG Sedan CNG Truck
Fuel
GMC Pontiac GMC Wheel Base - 15-pass van
N/A No Bid Sierra 1500 [N/A G6 N/A Canyon
$19,315.00 $17,813.00 14533
Dodge No ABS - Health Sedan
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Charger N/A No Bid
$20,622.00
Chevy Chevy N/A Chevy Wheel Base - 15-pass van
N/A No Bid Sliverado N/A Impala uses E85 Colorado
$19,550.00 $19,315.00 $15,809.00
No Charge Ford Ford see bid for 15 pass van
E85 No Bid F150 N/A No Bid No Bid Ranger no full size spare
$17,511.00 $13,790.00
No Charge Ford Ford Ford see bid for 15 pass van
E85 No Bid F150 N/A Taurus N/A Ranger no limited slip on Ranger
$19,109.00 $20,173.00 $13,554.00 no power w/l on Ranger
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
possible deduct for battery
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $175




No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

DET
One Ton One Ton Body 3/4 Ton Truck [3/4 Ton Truck| Mid-Size Sedan COMMENTS
Cab & Chass | Alternative Maintainer Alternative Sedan Alternative
Fuel Fuel Fuel
GMC Pontiac No Charge cab & chass - GVWR
No Bid No Bid No Bid Sierra 2500 [N/A G6 E85 & sway bar
$22,449.00 $18,099.00 1/2 ton box size - W/W
Dodge no ABS - DET
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Charger N/A
$20,622.00
Chevy Chevy No Charge cab & chass - see spec
No Bid No Bid No Bid Silverado N/A Impala E85 trucks - see specs
$23,581.00 19315
Ford
No Bid No Bid No Bid F250 N/A No Bid No Bid
20845
Ford Ford Ford cab to axle - W/W cab
F350 N/A No Bid F250 N/A Taurus N/A & chass
$32,292.00 $22,870.00 $20,536.00 no flat bed or plow
no spotlight on one ton
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

o

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

COMMENTS

no dual battery - Parks







