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COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X__BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater

RFB 09-1635

OPENING DATE: 2/24/09

No. of Bids Mailed 8

No. of Bids Received 7

No. of No-Bids Received 1

No. of Non-Response 0

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Roundup Headline Eptam Permit Prowl 3.3EC Pursuit
Vendor Name Power Fungicide Herbicide Herbicide or Equivalent COMMENTS
Max
Wilbur Ellis $42.90 No Bid $36.00 $17.18 $24.00 No Bid
4160 10 Mile Road, NW $26,812.50 $10,440.00 $3,092.40 $6,840.00
Sparta, Ml 49345 Acumen 3.3
Daylight Enterprises $49.00 $257.25 $34.95 $16.00 $24.95 $510.00
280 S. Ringle Road $30,625.00 $10,290.00 $10,135.50 $2,880.00 $7,110.75 $13,770.00
Fairgrove, MI 48733 Acumen
Troyer Grower Supply $56.45 $272.50 $37.77 $16.38 $20.99 $451.00
16496 124th Street $35,281.25 $10,900.00 $10,953.30 $2,948.40 $5,982.15 $12,177.00
Nunica, M| 49448
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. $53.47 $247.47 $39.97 $18.00 $26.47 $486.97
2327 64th Avenue $33,418.75 $9,898.80 $11,591.30 $3,072.06 $7,543.95 $13,148.19
Zeeland, Ml 49464
Alpine Plant Foods Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8873 S. Clearwater Drive
Zeeland, M| 49464
Reister's Grower Services No Bid $322.00 $39.40 $20.44 $28.80 $498.80 Permit & Pursuit - did not
1718 Gooding Road $12,880.00 $11,426.00 $3,270.40 $8,208.00 $12,968.80 |[bid complete gty
Conklin, MI 49403
Crop Production Services $52.50 $317.50 $35.10 $17.00 $33.00 $518.00
6288 S. Greenville Road $32,812.00 $12,700.00 $10,179.00 $2,901.39 $9,405.00 $13,986.00
Greenville, M| 48838 Prowl H20
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: ACCT MANAGER Name: Joseph Siedenstrang Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
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Eezyman Baythroid R-56 ENC Basagran Valor SX
Vendor Name or Warrior or Crop Kicker COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis $6.55 $382.40 $19.05 $4.90 $77.00 $65.00
$14,737.50 $25,238.40 $3,810.00 $15,190.00 $4,812.50 $7,150.00
Warrior Il 12-4-6
Daylight Enterprises $6.38 $208.00 $29.05 $16.00 $81.60 $61.00
$14,355.00 $13,728.00 $5,810.00 $49,600.00 $5,304.00 $6,710.00
Baythroid
Troyer Grower Supply $6.93 $145.00 $7.75 $8.30 $68.34 $55.40
$15,592.50 $9,570.00 $1,550.00 $25,730.00 $4,373.76 $6,094.00
Surfac 820
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. No Bid $234.47 No Bid No Bid $85.47 $68.97
$15,475.02 $5,470.08 $7,586.70
Warrior
Alpine Plant Foods Corp $18.76 No Bid No Bid $9.87 No Bid No Bid
$42,210.00 $30,597.00
Reister’'s Grower Services No Bid $199.00 $17.70 No Bid $68.40 $78.60
$13,134.00 $3,540.00 $4,377.60 $7,860.00
Province Spray Activat
Crop Production Services $16.00 $410.40 $12.95 $24.00 $80.00 $70.00
$36,000.00 $27,086.40 $2,590.00 $74,400.00 $5,120.00 $7,700.00
6% EDTA mn Warrior Il Bond Max Task Force 2
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No. of Bids Received
COMMODITY #: 675-45 _X__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 09-1635 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater OPENING DATE: 2/24/09 No. of Web Bids Received
Crop Oil ESN
Vendor Name Concentrate COMMENTS
Wilbur Ellis $8.35 $540.00
$542.75 $121,500.00
Daylight Enterprises $11.00 No Bid
$715.00
Troyer Grower Supply $6.20 No Bid
$403.00
Farmers Coop Elevator Co. $9.97 No Bid
$648.50
Alpine Plant Foods Corp No Bid No Bid
Reister's Grower Services $8.55 No Bid
$555.75
Crop Production Services $15.00 $515.00
$975.00 $115,875.00
Herbimax
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Vendor Name Eazyman Baythroid R-56 ENC Pursuit COMMENTS
or Warrior or Crop Kicker
* * Alternatives * *
Crop Production Services $360.00 $24.00
$23,760.00 $4,800.00
Tombstone Activator 90
Reister’s Grower Services $133.00
$8,778.00
Silencer
Daylight Enterprises $7.55 $321.00 $16.00 $5.50
$8,493.75 $21,186.00 $3,200.00 $17,050.00
Axil Mn 13% Warrior Il Sequel 7-7-7 micro
Troyer Grower Supply $357.00
$9,639.00
Thunder
Helena Chemical Company No Bid




