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COMMODITY #: 962-56

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Office Moving Services and Furniture Purchases DEPT: Clerk, District Court, Drain

RFB 09-1679

OPENING DATE: 10/23/09

No. of Bids E-Mailed 26

No. of Bids Received 6

No. of No-Bids Received 4

No. of Non-Response 16

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Vendor Name Clerk District Crt Drain Grand Total Hourly Rate Comments
Moving Srvs | Moving Srvs | Moving Srvs

Corrigan Moving Systems $40/Hr Per Mover Anytime.
7409 Expressway Ct SW $20/Hr Per Truck.
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548 $3,490.00 $13,990.00 $1,895.00 $19,375.00 [See Comments $0 Equipment.
Custer Workplace Interiors
217 Grandville SW Ste 100
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503 $11,800.00 $29,800.00 $8,640.00 $50,240.00 $32.00
Integrity Business Solutions
6548 Schamber Drive
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $8,400.00 $9,900.00 $8,900.00 $27,200.00 $20.00 2% Discount Net 30.
Lakeshore Office Furniture Pick Product & Deliver at $45
2615 Temple Street Per Man Hour; Rework at $35
Muskegon, Ml 49444 $2,400.00 $9,960.00 $2,900.00 $15,260.00 |See Comments Per Man Hour.
Taylor Office Furniture
6747 North Point Drive
Fruitport, Ml 49415 $4,417.00 $11,472.00 $3,748.00 $19,637.00 $30.00 2% Discount 10 Days Net 30.
\Warner-Schuitema Moving $100.00 For Bid Includes Packing Material.
327 E Laketon Avenue 2 Men & Does Not Include Disassembly
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $2,080.00 $10,399.00 $1,387.00 $13,866.00 Semi-Trailer or Reassembly of Furniture.

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine R. Johnson
WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe

ACCOUNTING MGR Name: Joseph W. Siedenstrang ~ Signature:

Signature:
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COMMODITY #: 962-56 X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 09-1679

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Office Moving Services and Furniture Purchases DEPT: Clerk, District Court, Drain OPENING DATE: 10/23/09

Vendor Name Clerk Drain Grand Total COMMENTS
Furniture Furniture
Allowance

Corrigan Moving Systems
7409 Expressway Ct SW
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548 $5,000.00 $1,145.35 $6,145.35

Custer Workplace Interiors
217 Grandville SW Ste 100
Grand Rapids, Ml 49503 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Integrity Business Solutions
6548 Schamber Drive
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $5,000.00 $881.00 $5,881.00 2% Discount Net 30.

Lakeshore Office Furniture
2615 Temple Street
Muskegon, Ml 49444 $5,000.00 $298.00 $5,298.00

Taylor Office Furniture
6747 North Point Drive
Fruitport, Ml 49415 $5,000.00 $1,710.49 $6,710.49 2% 10 Days Net 30.

\Warner-Schuitema Moving
327 E Laketon Avenue
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid




