Page 1 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 8

No. of Bids Received 4

COMMODITY #: 968-72 __X__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 10-1693 No. of No-Bids Received 2
No. of Non-Response 2
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Snow Plowing Services DEPT: DPW / Facilities Mgmt OPENING DATE: 12/15/09 No. of Web Bids Received 0
** 1st line - Per Plow; 2nd line - Plow Driving Lanes; 3rd Line - Per Time Salt * *
Vendor Name HOJ Government DET CVvB Animal Halmond Comments
Lot1&2 Complex Building Shelter Center
Franklin Contractors, Inc. $600.00 $400.00 $75.00 $50.00 $50.00 $250.00
3500 S. Getty Street $300.00 $200.00 $50.00 $35.00 $35.00 $125.00
Muskegon, MI 49444 $480.00 $360.00 $120.00 $60.00 $60.00 $240.00
Free Lance Enterprises $550.00 $550.00 $175.00 $150.00 $125.00 $550.00
1385 E. Keating Avenue $150.00 $150.00 $50.00 $35.00 $35.00 $150.00
Muskegon, MI 49442 $350.00 $350.00 $125.00 $100.00 $100.00 $350.00
Ultimate excavating, LLC $560.00 $1,095.00
4661 W. River Road $150.00 $325.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49445 $437.50 $562.50
Borgman Tree Service
1596 S. Hilton Service Bid per hour price for all lots. 3 trucks @ $55 per hour. 2 trucks with rear blades @ $60 per hour. Loader with bucket $80 per hour.
Muskegon, MI 49442 Loader with push box @ $100 per hour. Salter @ $55 per hour. Salt not included. $10 per bag. 2 dump trucks @ $55 per hour.
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: ACCOUNTING MGR Name: Joseph W. Siedenstrang ~ Signature:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST: N/A
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
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COMMODITY #: 968-72

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Snow Plowing Services

X

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: DPW / Facilities Mgmt
* * 1st line - Per Plow; 2nd line - Plow Driving Lanes; 3rd Line - Per Time Salt * *

RFB 10-1693

OPENING DATE: 12/15/09

No. of Bids Mailed 8

No. of Bids Received 4

No. of No-Bids Received 2

No. of Non-Response 2

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Vendor Name Agnus Peck Emerg. Serv. Totals Comments
Patuznik Street Hazmat

Franklin Contractors, Inc. $50.00 $75.00 $35.00 $1,385.00

3500 S. Getty Street $35.00 $45.00 $25.00 $750.00

Muskegon, MI 49444 $60.00 $60.00 $45.00 $1,285.00

Free Lance Enterprises $175.00 $150.00 $80.00 $2,505.00

1385 E. Keatig Ave $50.00 $50.00 $40.00 $710.00

Muskegon, MI 49442 $150.00 $100.00 $50.00 $1,675.00

Ultimate excavating, LLC

4661 W. River Road No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Muskegon, MI 49445

Borgman Tree Service
1596 S. Hilton Service
Muskegon, MI 49442

Per lot pricing

Bill Tysman
Double L Enerprises

No Bid
No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST: N/A
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson

ACCOUNTING MGR Name: Joseph W. Siedenstrang ~ Signature:

Signature:




