MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 14

No. of Bids Received 5

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __X__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 10-1697 No. of No-Bids Received 1
No. of Non-Response 8
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Various OPENING DATE: 1/5/10 No. of Web Bids Received 0
CMH DPW Solid Waste
Vendor Name Comments
15-pass. Van Van Mid-Size 12-pass. Van | 1/2ton Crew | 3/4ton Truck
Conversion Sedan Cab Truck |w/Snow Plow
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford
2469 Apple Avenue Econoline No Bid Fusion Econoline F150 F250 4x4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $20,648.00 $14,056.00 $19,401.00 $23,799.00 $26,249.00
Holman Automotive Group GMC GMC GMC GMC
35300 Ford Road Savana No Bid No Bid Savana Sierra 1500 [ Sierra 2500 HD
\Westland, MI 48185 $24,330.00 $25,600.00 $23,245.00 $27,100.00
Signhature Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford Ford
1960 E. Main Street E350 No Bid Fusion E350 F150 F250 4x4
Owosso, Ml 48867 $24,328.50 $14,145.00 $22,772.00 $26,216.00 $27,207.00
Clock Conversions Sampson
6700 Clay Avenue, SW No Bid Braun/Millenium No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, M| 49458 $12,500.00
Mobility Transportation Ford Millenium Ford Ford Fusion Alt. Fuel add $9,800
42000 Kopparnich, #A3 S3B, E350 Braun Fusion E3B, E350 No Bid No Bid
Canton, M| 48187 $20,460.00 $11,581.00 $14,930.00 $21,115.00
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: ACCOUNTING MGR Name: Joseph W. Siedenstrang ~ Signature:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST: N/A
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:
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COMMODITY #: 070-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Various

RFB 10-1697

OPENING DATE: 1/5/10

No. of Bids Received 5

No. of No-Bids Received 1

No. of Non-Response 8

No. of Web Bids Received 0

W/wW Sheriff District Library
Vendor Name Comments
3/4 ton Cargo Van Mini Van
Ext. Cab Truck

Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford
2469 Apple Avenue F250 4x4| Econoline SD No Bid
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $29,189.00 $20,351.00
Holman Automotive Group GMC
35300 Ford Road No Bid| Savana 3500 No Bid
Westland, Ml 48185 $24,600.00
Signhature Ford Ford Ford
1960 E. Main Street F250 E350 No Bid
Owosso, Ml 48867 $30,338.00 $21,202.50
Clock Conversions
6700 Clay Avenue, SW No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Ml 49458
Mobility Transportation
42000 Kopparnich, #A3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Canton, M| 48187
Duthler Truck Center No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson

N/A

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

ACCOUNTING MGR Name: Joseph W. Siedenstrang ~ Signature:




