COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater /Farm

RFB 10-1732

OPENING DATE: 2/26/10

No. of Bids Mailed 11

No. of Bids Received 6

No. of No-Bids Received 1

No. of Non-Response 4

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Vendor Name Roundup Eptam Prowel 3.3 EC Pursuit Baythroid FoliGro or Comments

Power Max Herbicide or Acumen or Warrior Crop Kicker

TMF Ag Supply $34.64 $23.40 $352.00 $119.95 $4.97 Warrior (Silencer) $77.50

16396 124th Street No Bid $9,179.60 $3,627.00 $16,192.00 $8,996.25 $12,176.50 $5,8121.50 extended

Nunica, MI 49448 Thunder Baythroid

Wilbur-Ellis Company $26.25 $36.00 $24.00 $485.00 $114.00 $4.15

4160 10 Mile Road $8,925.00 $9,540.00 $3,720.00 $22,310.00 $8,550.00 $10,167.50

Sparta, Ml 49345 Province

Day Light Enterprises $22.25 $34.00 $25.80 $482.91 $191.49 $5.40

280 S. Ringle Road $7,565.00 $9,010.00 $3,999.00 $22,213.86 $14,361.75 $13,230.00

Fairgrove, Ml 48733 Touchdown

Alpine Plant Food Corp. $9.20

8873 S. Clearwater Drive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,540.00

Zeeland, Ml 49464

Troyer Growers Supply $22.45 $40.10 $22.67 $354.90 $117.87

817 Rt. 97 $7,633.00 $10,626.50 $3,513.85 $16,325.40 $8,840.25 No Bid

Waterford, PA 16441

Crop Production Services $21.90 $38.10 $21.90 $466.60 $112.00 $8.05

6288 S. Greenville Road $7,446.00 $10,096.50 $3,394.50 $21,463.60 $8,400.00 $19,722.50

Greenville, Ml 48838 Stealth Tombstone Taskforce Il

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

ACCOUNTING MGR Name: Joseph W. Siedenstrang ~ Signature:

N/A

Christine Johnson

Signature:

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 11




COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Wastewater/Farm

RFB 10-1732

OPENING DATE: 2/26/10

No. of Bids Received 6

No. of No-Bids Received 1

No. of Non-Response 4

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Vendor Name Halex GT Eezyman 0-0-60 ESN Comments
Potash
TMF Ag Supply $29.40 $6.48
16396 124th Street $18,081.00 $6,480.00 No Bid No Bid
Nunica, Ml 49448
Wilbur-Ellis Company $5.45 $455.55 $485.55
4160 10 Mile Road No Bid $5,450.00 $81,999.00 $106,821.00
Sparta, MI 49345 0-0-62 Super U
Day Light Enterprises $29.85 $6.94
280 S. Ringle Road $18,357.75 $6,940.00 No Bid No Bid
Fairgrove, MI 48733
Alpine Plant Food Corp. $19.26
8873 S. Clearwater Drive No Bid $19,260.00 No Bid No Bid
Zeeland, Ml 49464
Troyer Growers Supply $29.43 $6.25 T-MN: $6.25 unit
817 Rt. 97 $18,099.45 $6,250.00 No Bid No Bid $6,250.00 extended
\Waterford, PA 16441
Crop Production Services $30.55 $16.50 $450.00 $530.00
6288 S. Greenville Road $18,788.25 $16,500.00 $81,000.00 $116,600.00

Greenville, M| 48838

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

ACCOUNTING MGR Name: Joseph W. Siedenstrang ~ Signature:

N/A

Christine Johnson

Signature:




