BID SUMMARY
VEHICLE LUBRICANTS

RFB 10-1804
Description Price Volume Description Alternate Volume
Vesco Oil Corp. Pricing
Chemsearch

Bug Buster W/W Solvent $65.45 55 Gallon no bid 5 Gallon
CAM2 Superpro 10W30-Bulk $6.29 / gal 275 Bulk Lubra Max Ultra 10w30 $17.36 / gal 330 Gallon
CAM2 Tractor Hyd-Bulk $6.15/ gal 275 Bulk no bid
CAM2 Ultra Plex EP2 $261.20 120 Ibs Maxi-Lube #2 $3.39/1b 120 Ibs
CAM2 Ultra PIx EP2 $24.61 10 packs 14 oz Maxi-Lube #2 (¥ case) $236.87 / case 24 cart/ 14

cartridges 0z case
Carb Cleaner $21.77 (12) 13 0z no bid
DELVAC 1300 S 15W40 $9.59 / gal 1000 Bulk Lubra Max Ultra 15w40 $18.52/ gal 3/330 qt
DELVAC Synthetic GO 75W90 $348.29 105 Ibs Lubra Tech Synthetic 75 $6.42 / Ib 120 Ibs
DEXRON VI ATF $675.43 55 Gallon Lubra Systems ATF $17.56 / gal 55 Gallon
Multi-Vehicle ATF $598.95 55 Gallon Lubra Systems ATF $17.56 / gal 55 Gallon
DTE 10 EXCEL 22 $752.13 55 Gallon Lubra Guard 22 $15.84 / gal 55 Gallon
CESQG washer fluid no bid 10 Gallon no bid
Parts cleaner washer fluid disposal charge no bid 30 Gallon no bid
GEAR 600 XP 220 $72.87 38 Ibs Lubra Tech 220 $2.55/1b 35 Ibs
Gear Oil Pump no bid 1 Each no bid
Grease Clean/Ind $348.15 55 Gallon no bid 5 Gallon
Grease XHP 222 $113.14 35.2 Ibs Maxi Lube $123.90 35 Ibs
Ice Braker with Washer Solvent $90.75 55 Gallon no bid 5 Gallon
LUX EP 023 $82.75 35 Pounds no bid 5 Gallon
Mobil 1 Synthetic 10W30 $1371.15 55 Gallon Lubra Max Ultra 10w30 $18.54 / gal 55 Gallon
Multi Purpose Solvent $23.4 12.250z no bid
Soft T Sorb $4.99 40 Ibs no bid 10 Ibs
Service Com parts washer $50.50 10 Gallon no bid
Service Gal PW Unit parts washer $104.25 30 Gallon no bid
Tire Muscle Industrial no bid 5 Gallon no bid 1 Gallon
Trans HD 30 $711.56 55 Gallon no bid 5 Gallon
Trans HD 50 $779.63 55 Gallon no bid 5 Gallon
MobilFluid Hydraulic Oil $6.69 / gal 275 Gallon Enerlex $14.57 / gal 330 gal
Used Oil Pick Up no bid 1000 Gallon no bid
Used Oil Purchases no bid 2500 min no bid
Vehicle Wash & Wax $529.65 55 Gallon no bid 5 Gallon
Vehicle Wash & Wax $68.50 5 Gallon no bid 1 Gallon
DTE 10 XL 22 $752.13 55 Gallon Lubra Guard 22 $15.84 / gal 55 Gallon
Mobil EP 023 $859.58 55 Gallon no bid 5 Gallon
Gear 630 no bid 55 Gallon no bid 5 Gallon




DTE 26 $519.20 55 Gallon no bid 55 Gallon
EP 220 Texaco Aquagear Oil no bid 55 Gallon Lubra Guard 220 $4.14/1b 400 Ibs

Hydraulic AW 46 $321.20 55 Gallon Lubra Guard 46 $15.84 / gal 55 Gallon
Hydraulic AW 68 $321.20 55 Gallon Lubra Guard 68 $15.84 / gal 55 Gallon
Oil Sampling no charge 250 year no bid 55 Gallon




