COMMODITY #: 070-00

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFB 11-1844

No. of Bids Emailed 19

No. of Bids Received 7

No. of No-Bids Received 0

No. of Non-Response 12

PRODUCT / SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Various OPENING DATE: 12/20/10 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Vendor Name Mini-Van Mid-Size 12-Passenger 1/2 Ton
Sedan Van 4x4 Truck
Berger Chevrolet Chevy Chevy Chevy 4x4 No alternative fuel options
2525 28th Street No Bid Malibu Express Silverado
Grand Rapids, MI 49512 $16,958.00 $21,367.25 $19,824.70
each each each
Red Holman Buick GMC GMC GMC Van is E-85
35300 Ford Road No Bid No Bid Savana 3500 Sierra 1500
Westland, MI 48185 $23,799.00 $19,737.00
each each
Preferred Chrysler Dodge Jee Dodge Chrysler Dodge Ram No alternative fuel options
3146 Henry Street Grand Caravan 200 No Bid 1500
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $22,227.00 $18,693.00 $20,484.00
each each each
Jorgensen Ford Sales Ford Ford E-350 Ford Fusion Hybrid $26,213.43 ea
8333 Michigan Avenue No Bid Fusion Econoline F150
Detroit, Ml 48210 $16,498.43 $23,175.86 $19,255.05
each each
Whiteside Chevrolet Buick Chevy GMC GMC Malibu is E-85 @ N/C
50714 National Road No Bid Malibu LS Savana Sierra 1500 Savanais E-85 @ N/C
St. Clairsville, OH 43950 $19,900.00 $27,941.00 $21,300.00 Sierra w/4.8L @ 22,300.00 ea
each each each
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford Ford F150 is flex fuel
2469 Apple Avenue No Bid Fusion S E-350 F150 XL
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $14,815.00 $23,401.00 $19,830.00
each each each
Signature Ford Ford Ford Ford Fusion SE $17,406.00 ea
1960 E. Main Street No Bid Fusion S E-350 F150 E-350 is E-85
Owosso, MI 48867 $14,716.00 $24,288.00 $19,847.00 F150 is E-85
each each

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID

FINANCE & MGMT DIRECTOR Name: Heath Kaplan Signhature:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST: N/A
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Name:

WITNESS Name: Christine R. Johnson

Christian Toebe

Signature:




