COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Wastewater/Farm

RFB 11-1870

OPENING DATE: 2/21/10

No. of Bids Mailed 12

No. of Bids Received 5

No. of No-Bids Received 0

No. of Non-Response 7

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Vendor Name Roundup Eptam Prowel 3.3 EC Pursuit Valor SX DG Halex GT Comments
Power Max Herbicide or Acumen
TMF Ag Supply $14.50 $24.16 $361.00 $59.45
16396 124th Street $5,075.00 No Bid $3,986.40 $15,884.00 $4,161.50 No Bid
Nunica, MI 49448 Thunder
Wilbur-Ellis Company $14.21 $33.99 $21.85 $354.85 $68.91
4160 10 Mile Road $4,973.50 $10,197.00 $3,605.25 $15,613.40 $4,823.70 No Bid
Sparta, MI 49345
Day Light Enterprises $34.00 $26.50 $510.00 $77.00 $28.10 Alternate: Touchdown Total
280 S. Ringle Road No Bid $10,200.00 $4,372.50 $22,440.00 $5,390.00 $20,934.50 |$14.00/ gallon
Fairgrove, MI 48733
Farmer Co-op Elevator Co. $14.23 $40.00 $35.00 $598.00 $82.90 $39.00
2327 64th Avenue $4,980.50 $12,000.00 $5,775.00 $26,312.00 $5,803.00 $29,055.00
Zeeland, MI 49464
Troyer Growers Supply $15.48 $46.00 $25.67 $370.00 $59.30 $31.20
817 Rt. 97 $5,418.00 $13,800.00 $4,235.55 $16,280.00 $4,151.00 $23,244.00
Waterford, PA 16441
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: Finance & Mgt Service Director: Heath Kaplan Signature:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

N/A
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MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 12




No. of Bids Received 5

COMMODITY #:. 675-45 __X__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1870 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 7
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals DEPT: Wastewater / Farm OPENING DATE: 2/21/10 No. of Web Bids Received 0
Vendor Name Bronc Max 90:10 Optimize 400 | Alfalfa Foliar [Soybean Foliar| Corn Foliar Comments
Surfactant Fertilizer Fertilizer Fertilizer
TMF Ag Supply $6.65 $9.50 $1,029.00 $3.64
$1,463.00 $665.00 $2,058.00 $19,073.60 No Bid No Bid
AMS Supreme
Wilbur-Ellis Company $10.00 $18.00 $942.25 $4.10 $5.70 $12.95
$2,200.00 $1,260.00 $1,884.00 $21,484.00 $3,448.50 $5,503.75
Day Light Enterprises $15.00 $15.00 $3.00
$3,300.00 $1,050.00 $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
800 Units
Farmer Co-op Elevator Co. $18.45 $14.56 $23.50
$4,059.00 $1,019.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,987.50
Gardian
Troyer Growers Supply $11.45
No Bid $801.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name:

Christine Johnson

Finance & Mgt Service Director: Heath Kaplan

N/A

Signature:

Signature:
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MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 12

No. of Bids Received 5




COMMODITY #: 675-45

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Agricultural Chemicals

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Wastewater/Farm

RFB 11-1870

OPENING DATE: 2/21/10

No. of No-Bids Received 0

No. of Non-Response 7

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Vendor Name 0-0-60 or ESN 18-46-0 Comments
0-0-62
TMF Ag Supply
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wilbur-Ellis Company $599.00 $648.90
$122,795.00 $165,469.50 No Bid
Day Light Enterprises
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Farmer Co-op Elevator Co. $577.00 $699.00
$118,285.00 No Bid $4,194.00
Troyer Growers Supply
No Bid No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Christine Johnson

Finance & Mgt Service Director: Heath Kaplan

N/A

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




