PAGE 1 OF 11

COMMODITY #: 801-66

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays

**Purchase Option - With 24" Time & Temp Choice

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: Administration

RFB 11-1871

OPENING DATE: 03/15/11

No. of Bids Emailed 18

No. of Bids Received 4

No. of No-Bids Received 0

No. of Non-Response 14

No. of Web Bids Received 0

Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total

Postema Sign & Graphics *$74,522.25|*Equivalent of 1% Discount
7475 S Division Avenue $25,485.00 $36,680.00 $6,555.00 EA | $6,555.00 EA for 1% 10 Days Terms
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548 $12,110.00 $13,110.00 $75,275.00
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $26,579.00 $35,879.00 $5,579.00 EA | $5,579.00 EA $73,037.00(One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $10,579.00 $10,579.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street $27,093.00 $38,391.00 No Bid $12,559.00 $78,043.00
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tischco Signs and Service $20,500.00 $34,949.00 No Bid $10,500.00 $65,949.00
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $23,783.00 $34,725.00 N/A $5,064.00 $73,637.00(Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $10,128.00 Only Grand Total Does

RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name:

WITNESS Name: Tina Nash

FINANCE & MGMT DIRECTOR Name: Heath Kaplan Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Christine R Johnson

Signature:
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 __X___BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1871
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11
**Purchase Option - With 36" Time & Temp Choice
Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total
Postema Sign & Graphics *$82,739.25*Equivalent of 1% Discount
7475 S Division Avenue $25,485.00 $36,680.00 | $10,705.00 EA | $10,705.00 EA for 1% 10 Days Terms
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548 $21,410.00 $21,410.00 $83,575.00
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $26,579.00 $35,879.00 $9,579.00 EA | $9,579.00 EA $81,337.00(One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $18,879.00 $18,879.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street $27,093.00 $38,391.00 No Bid $21,123.00 $86,607.00
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tischco Signs and Service $20,500.00 $34,949.00 No Bid $17,020.00 $72,469.00
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $23,783.00 $34,725.00 N/A $8,847.50 EA $81,204.00(Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $17,695.00 Only Grand Total Does
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 X___BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1871
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11
**Finance 3 Yr Lease Option - with 24" Time & Temp Choice
Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total
Postema Sign & Graphics
7475 S Division Avenue N/A N/A N/A N/A $2,291.14
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $960.00 $1,295.00 $204.00 EA $204.00 EA $2,634.00|One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $379.00 $379.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street N/A N/A N/A N/A $2,560.00
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tischco Signs and Service N/A N/A N/A N/A $2,165.00
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $790.31 $1,153.91 N/A $168.28 EA $2,447.00(Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $336.56 Only Grand Total Does
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 __X___ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1871
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11
**Finance 3 Yr Lease Option - with 36" Time & Temp Choice
Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total
Postema Sign & Graphics
7475 S Division Avenue N/A N/A N/A N/A $2,543.76
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $960.00 $1,295.00 $344.00 EA $344.00 EA $2,934.00|One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $679.00 $679.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tischco Signs and Service N/A N/A N/A N/A $2,840.00
- Alternate Datatronics 32"
Tischco Signs and Service N/A N/A N/A N/A $2,375.00
- Alternate Datatronics 36"
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $788.17 $1,150.79 N/A $293.21 $2,691.00(Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $586.42 Only Grand Total Does
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 _X__ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1871
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11
**True 3 Yr Lease Option - with 24" Time & Temp Choice
Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total
Postema Sign & Graphics
7475 S Division Avenue N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $953.00 $1,286.00 $202.00 EA $202.00 EA $2,614.00|One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $375.00 $375.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tischco Signs and Service No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $790.31 $1,153.91 N/A $168.28 $2,447.00(Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $336.56 Only Grand Total Does
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 __X___ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1871
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11
**True 3 Yr Lease Option - with 36" Time & Temp Choice
Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total
Postema Sign & Graphics
7475 S Division Avenue N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $953.00 $1,286.00 $341.00 EA $341.00 EA $2,912.00|One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $673.00 $673.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, Ml 49441
Tischco Signs and Service No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $788.17 $1,150.79 N/A $293.21 $2,691.00(Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $586.42 Only Grand Total Does
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 X___ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1871
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11
**Finance 5 Yr Lease Option - with 24" Time & Temp Choice
Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total
Postema Sign & Graphics
7475 S Division Avenue N/A N/A N/A N/A $1,458.48
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $673.00 $903.00 $140.00 EA $140.00 EA $1,841.00|One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $265.00 $265.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tischco Signs and Service No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $523.46 $764.30 N/A $111.46 $1,621.00|Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $222.92 Only Grand Total Does
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 X___ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1871
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11
**Finance 5 Yr Lease Option - with 36" Time & Temp Choice
Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total
Postema Sign & Graphics
7475 S Division Avenue N/A N/A N/A N/A $1,619.30
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $673.00 $903.00 $239.00 EA $239.00 $2,050.00|One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $474.00 $474.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tischco Signs and Service No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $524.18 $765.34 N/A $195.00 $1,790.00| Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $390.00 Only Grand Total Does
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 X___ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 11-1871
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11
**True 5 Yr Lease Option - with 24" Time & Temp Choice
Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total
Postema Sign & Graphics
7475 S Division Avenue N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $665.00 $893.00 $138.00 EA $138.00 EA $1,820.00|One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $262.00 $262.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49441
Tischco Signs and Service No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $523.46 $764.30 N/A $111.46 $1,621.00|Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $222.92 Only Grand Total Does
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COMMODITY #: 801-66 X RFB 11-1871

BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11

**True 5 Yr Lease Option - with 36" Time & Temp Choice

Vendor Name Governmental Hertiage Hall of Justice | Hall of Justice Grand Comments
Complex Landing Host/Client Host X 2 Total

Postema Sign & Graphics
7475 S Division Avenue N/A N/A N/A N/A No Bid
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Safari Signs LLC Pricing for Hall of Justice
DBA Port City Signs $665.00 $893.00 $236.00 EA $236.00 EA $2,026.00|One Display is More Expensive
771 Access Highway $468.00 $468.00 Than Total for Two Divided by 4
Muskegon, Ml 49442 Due to Shipping & Handling
Tischco Signs and Service
2107 Henry Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, Ml 49441
Tischco Signs and Service No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
- Alternate Datatronics
\Valley City Sign Company Individual Pricing Does Not
5009 West River Drive NE $524.18 $765.34 N/A $195.00 $1,790.00(Include Installation & Fees -
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 Per Pre-Bid $390.00 Only Grand Total Does




COMMODITY #: 801-66

X BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL

PRODUCT / SERVICE: Daktronics LED Message Displays

**Qptional ltems

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY
RFB 11-1871

DEPT: Administration OPENING DATE: 03/15/11

PAGE 11 OF 11

Vendor Name Webinar Assurance Ext. Warranty | Ext. Warranty Comments
Training Plus & Support 24" | & Support 36"
Postema Sign & Graphics Materials Payment in Advance
7475 S Division Avenue $300.00 No Charge $3,018.00 $4,648.00 and Balance Net 30 Days or
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548 1% Discount Net 10 Days
Safari Signs LLC
DBA Port City Signs Included Included Included Included
771 Access Highway See Detalils See Details See Detalils
Muskegon, Ml 49442
Tischco Signs and Service Purchase: 75% Deposit
2107 Henry Street N/A N/A N/A N/A Lease: Property Taxes Not
Muskegon, MI 49441 Included
Lease: Advance Payment
Purchase: 75% Deposit
Tischco Signs and Service N/A N/A N/A N/A Lease: Property Taxes Not
- Alternate Datatronics Included
Lease: Advance Payment
\Valley City Sign Company
5009 West River Drive NE $300.00 See Details 1Yr/ 1Yr/
Comstock Park, Ml 49321 $1,048.00 On Going On Going




