MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Emailed 37

No. of Bids Received 7

COMMODITY #: 070-00 __X___ BID QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFB 12-1936 No. of No-Bids Received 4
No. of Non-Response 26
PRODUCT / SERVICE: Fleet Vehicles DEPT: Various OPENING DATE: 12/27/11 No. of Web Bids Received 0
CMH WIW
Vendor Name
Mini-Van 15-Passenger Van 3/4 ton 4x4 Mini-Van or
Van Conversion |Truck w/ Plow Crossover

K&M Dodge/Ram Dodge Grand Ram Dodge
4100 Plainfield NE Caravan SE No Bid No Bid 2500 Journey SXT
Grand Rapids, M| 49525 $21,563.00 $27,503.00 $21,835.00
Don Rypma Chevy Chevy Chevy Chevy Alternate: Traverse w/ bench
8130 Whitehall Road No Bid Express Ext No Bid Silverado Traverse AWD seats $25,883.00 ea
Whitehall, MI 49461 $26,893.51 $27,983.98 | $29,146.43 ea
Preferred Chrysler, Jeep Dodge Grand Ram Dodge Truck with Fisher plow
3146 Henry Street Caravan No Bid No Bid 2500 Journey SXT $29,339.00
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $22,128.00 $29,598.00 $23,684.00
Clock Mobility Sampson
6700 Clay Ave., SW No Bid No Bid Braun Lift No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, M| 49548 $13,689.50
Tesco Transportation Equip. Ford Prime Time See bid for alternative fuel priceg
6401 Seaman Road No Bid E350 XL Braun Lift No Bid No Bid Alternate: Club Wagon
Oregon, OH 43616 $29,924.00 $15,049.00 $30,620.00
Great Lakes Ford Ford Ford
2469 Apple Avenue No Bid F350 No Bid F250 No Bid
Muskegon, M| 49442 $37,828.32 $26,970.82
Signature Ford Ford Ford Alternate: Ford Explorer
1960 E. Main Street No Bid No Bid No Bid F250 Flex $31,149 ea, F250 w/ Boss
Owosso, Ml 48867 $26,783.00 | $30,335.00 ea plow $26,498.00

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe

WITNESS Name: Christine R. Johnson

Signature:

FINANCE & MGMT DIRECTOR Name: Heath Kaplan Signhature:

N/A




