MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 14
No. of Bids Received 4

COMMODITY #: 926-45 BID QUOTATION _X PROPOSAL RFP 06-1482 No. of No-Bids Received 2
No. of Non-Response 9

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Household Hazardous Waste Disposal Services DEPT: Dept. of Public Works OPENING DATE: April 6, 2006 No. of Web Bids Received 1

Vendor Name Personnel Transportation Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of COMMENTS
Hourly Rate Aerosol 1lb Propane Corrosive Corrosive Corrosive Pesticide Pesticide Flammable
Per Person Cans (lab pk) Cylinders Liquid (lab pk) | Liquid (bulk) | Solids (lab pk) | Liquid (lab pk) | Solid (lab pk) Liquid (lab pk)

Drug and Laboratory Disposal

331 Broad Street $0.00 $1,040.00 $95.00 $5.00 $123.00 $275.00 $123.00 $150.00 $150.00 $123.00

Plainwell, Ml 49080

Pollution Control Ind.

4343 Kennedy Avenue $35.00 $300.00 $150.00 $10.00 $170.00 $105.00 $150.00 $255.00 $225.00 $155.00 See Bid for Comments

East Chicago, IN 46312

EQ Industrial Services

2701 N. 1-94 Service Drive $45.00 $475.00 $250.00 $5.00 $200.00 $150.00 $300.00 $350.00 $350.00 $200.00

Ypsilanti, Ml 48198

Onyx Environmental Serv

11681 Levan Road $44.00 $450.00 $150.00 $12.00 $175.00 No Bid $175.00 $195.00 $195.00 $195.00 See Bid for Comments

Livonia, Ml 48150

Clean Harbors Enviro NO BID

Environmental Resources NO BID

DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Lynn Zatalokin

RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Christine R. Johnson Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY Page 2
COMMODITY #: 926-45 BID QUOTATION _X PROPOSAL RFP 06-1482
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Household Hazardous Waste Disposal Services DEPT: Dept. of Public Works OPENING DATE: April 6, 2006
Vendor Name Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of Disposal of
Flammable Paint Paint Related Used Oxidizers Drycell Reactives Mercury Flourescent Gas Unknown Identification
Liquid (bulked) (lab pk) Materials (lab pk] Antifreeze (lab pk (lab pk) Batteries Tubes Cylinders
Drug and Laboratory Disposal
331 Broad Street $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $123.00 $0.90 $0.90 $0.90 $2.00 $5.00 $0.00
Plainwell, Ml 49080
Pollution Control Ind.
4343 Kennedy Avenue $75.00 $155.00 $155.00 $75.00 $420.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50 $1.00 Case by Case $10.00
East Chicago, IN 46312 To be $50 minimum
Determined
EQ Industrial Services
2701 N. 1-94 Service Drive $150.00 $150.00 $150.00 $20.00 $350.00 $0.50 $500.00 $5.00 $0.50 $5.00 $15.00
Ypsilanti, Ml 48198
Onyx Environmental Serv
11681 Levan Road $88.00 $195.00 $195.00 $195.00 $325.00 $ .77 and $1.55 $7.00 $.35/4ft $12.00 $20.00
Livonia, Ml 48150 $4.50 $50 minimum $75 minimum $.55/8ft
Clean Harbors Environmental No Bid
Environmental Resources Mgt No Bid




