MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed 24

No. of Bids Received 15

COMMODITY #: 485-00 BID _ X _ QUOTATION ____ PROPOSAL RFQ 04-1331 No. of No-Bids Received 4
No. of Non-Response 3
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Cleaning & Sanitary Supplies DEPT: Dept. of Public Works OPENING DATE: 2/13/04 No. of Web Bids Received 1
Vendor Name 100 Gallons 144 Quarts 80 Gallons 70 Cases 15 Cases 27 Cases COMMENTS
Chlorine Bleach Bowl Cleaner Disinfectant Trash Bags Trash Bags Hand Towels
Cleaner 33 x 40 38 x 60 Single Fold
Boise Office Solutions
357 36th Street, SE No Bid $436.32 $1,027.20 $1,064.00 $306.15 $764.64
Grand Rapids, Ml 49548
Capitol Distributing Company
P.O. Box 169 $150.00 $208.80 $344.00 $1,190.00 $360.00 $386.10
Ferrysburg, MI 49409
Corporate Express
28241 Mound Road $112.00 $352.80 $437.60 $707.70 $204.30 $366.39
Warren, Ml 48092
Daniels Office Plus
394 Muskegon Mall $239.00 $446.00 $735.00 $1,217.00 $364.00 $666.00
Muskegon, MI 49440
Grainger Industrial
2476 Azo Drive $271.15 $233.28 $538.40 $1,343.30 $422.70 $520.83
Kalamazoo, Ml 49048
J.A.M. Unlimited
1720 Delevan Avenue $589.95 $552.00 1,500.00 $1,399.30 $299.85 $1,619.46
Lansing, M1 48910 267# Powder
KSS Enterprises
410 Unit E 44th Street, SW $105.11 $144.37 $468.18 $802.61 $251.08 $344.25
Grand Rapids, M|l 49548
Menards
5487 Harvey Street $128.64 $177.12 $476.80 $2,209.20 No Bid No Bid
Muskegon, MI 49444
Michigan State Industries
5656 South Cedar, Ste 100 $222.50 $182.25 $558.00 No Bid $357.90 No Bid
Lansing, M| 48909 100/Cs, 30 Cs
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

COMMODITY #: 485-00 BID _ X QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFQ 04-1331 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Cleaning & Sanitary Supplies DEPT: Dept. of Public Works OPENING DATE: 2/13/04 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name 30 Boxes 30 Boxes 72 Cases 60 Gallons 50 Cases 2 Dozen COMMENTS
Nitrile Gloves Nitrile Gloves JRT Jr. Liquid Soap Rolled Sponges
Size Large Size Medium Toilet Paper Refill Hand Towels
Boise Office Solutions $122.10 $122.10 $2,203.20 $699.00 $1,005.50 $11.52
Capitol Distributing Company $105.00 $105.00 $1,591.20 $375.00 $1,450.00 $26.00
Corporate Express $236.70 $236.70 $1,360.80 $382.20 $1,408.50 $26.56
Daniels Office Plus $105.00 $105.00 $3,500.00 $426.00 $1,740.00 $30.00
Grainger Industrial $88.50 $88.50 $2,520.72 $480.90 $1,322.00 $44.44
J.A.M. Unlimited $270.00 $270.00 $3,959.28 $750.00 $2,250.00 $33.98
15 Boxes, 200/Box | 15 Boxes, 200/Box 6" x 3-7/16"
KSS Enterprises $166.02 $166.02 $1,591.20 $379.09 $1,345.00 $19.18
8 x 630'/Case

Menards $530.40 $764.40 $1,731.60 $286.20 No Bid $15.68
Michigan State Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid $491.25 No Bid No Bid
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson
RECOMMENDATION:

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

COMMODITY #: 485-00 BID _ X__ QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFQ 04-1331 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Cleaning & Sanitary Supplies DEPT: Dept. of Public Works OPENING DATE: 2/13/04 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name 20 Dozen 4 Dozen 20 Cases 3 Cases COMMENTS
Urinal Blocks Mop Heads Toilet Paper Window
2-Ply Cleaner
Boise Office Solutions $98.60 $168.48 $428.80 $115.35
Capitol Distributing Company $100.00 $100.80 $590.00 $26.25 2% 10 Days
Corporate Express $71.60 $89.36 $449.60 $28.71
Daniels Office Plus $95.00 $107.00 $735.00 $119.00 2% 10 Days
Grainger Industrial $93.00 $98.40 $768.80 $69.36
J.A.M. Unlimited $400.00 $208.00 $1,099.80 $119.97
4.8 Gal/2.5 Cases
KSS Enterprises $100.91 $165.27 $544.00 $48.81 Ready to Use
$10.94 Concentrate
Menards $199.80 $311.52 $481.00 $71.64
Michigan State Industries No Bid $220.80 No Bid $51.75
(48 Quarts)

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

COMMODITY #: 485-00 BID __ X _QUOTATION ___ PROPOSAL RFQ 04-1331 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Cleaning & Sanitary Supplies DEPT: Dept. of Public Works OPENING DATE: 2/13/04 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name 100 Gallons 144 Quarts 80 Gallons 70 Cases 15 Cases 27 Cases COMMENTS
Chlorine Bleach Bowl Cleaner Disinfectant Trash Bags Trash Bags Hand Towels
Cleaner 33 x40 38 x 60 Single Fold
Nichols Paper & Supply
2291 Olthoff Drive $125.00 $194.40 $400.00 $882.00 $277.50 355.05
Muskegon, M| 49444
Superior Supply Company
P.O. Box 826 $174.00 $226.20 $553.80 $1,112.16 $335.88 $370.75
Muskegon, Ml 49443
Tico Duckett Distributing
618 Sheridan Street $120.00 $213.12 $368.00 $1,004.50 $244.50 $391.50
Lansing, MI 48906
Total Perfection/DBA TMG
1551 Kalamazoo, SE $750.00 $200.16 $529.60 $1,155.70 $307.95 $391.50
Grand Rapids, M| 49507
United Commercial Services
924 W Fulton Street $202.00 $246.12 $730.00 $1,388.80 $402.30 $433.35
Grand Rapids, MI 49504
Xpedx
4140 E Paris Avenue $115.43 $166.68 $455.20 No Bid No Bid $361.53
Kentwood, M| 49512 (102 Gallons)
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




COMMODITY #: 485-00

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Cleaning & Sanitary Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

BID _ X__ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: Dept. of Public Works

RFQ 04-1331

OPENING DATE: 2/13/04

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name 30 Boxes 30 Boxes 72 Cases 60 Gallons 50 Cases 2 Dozen COMMENTS
Nitrile Gloves Nitrile Gloves JRT Jr. Liquid Soap Rolled Sponges
Size Large Size Medium Toilet Paper Refill Hand Towels
Nichols Paper & Supply $183.00 $183.00 $1,728.00 $372.00 $1,350.00 $28.80
Superior Supply Company $203.40 $203.40 $1,411.47 $397.22 $1,365.00 $32.11
Tico Duckett Distributing $157.50 $157.50 $1,778.40 $462.00 $770.00 $16.32
(8" x 350" Roll)
Total Perfection/DBA TMG $307.50 $307.50 $1,624.30 $540.00 $1,605.00 $27.60
United Commercial Services $215.10 $215.10 $2,106.00 $567.60 $1,847.00 $35.04
Xpedx $170.70 $170.70 $1,511.28 $263.85 $694.50 No Bid
(350' Roll)
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

COMMODITY #: 485-00 BID _ X_ QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFQ 04-1331 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Cleaning & Sanitary Supplies DEPT: Dept. of Public Works OPENING DATE: 2/13/04 No. of Web Bids Received
Vendor Name 20 Dozen 4 Dozen 20 Cases 3 Cases COMMENTS
Urinal Blocks Mop Heads Toilet Paper Window
2-Ply Cleaner
Nichols Paper & Supply $95.00 $136.80 $590.00 $38.40
Superior Supply Company $99.12 $126.32 $570.70 $41.37 3% 10 Days
Tico Duckett Distributing $92.00 $127.20 $647.00 $63.00
Total Perfection/DBA TMG $121.40 $190.00 $697.00 $55.10
United Commercial Services $488.40 $425.76 $690.00 $67.26
Xpedx $85.80 No Bid $555.80 $32.28
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine Johnson
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:
PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




