COMMODITY #: 948-68

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Spectacle Kits & Lenses

BID

__X___ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY
RFQ 05-1430

DEPT: SheriffEmergency Services OPENING DATE: 7/25/05

No. of Bids Mailed 8

No. of Bids Received 5

No. of No-Bids Received 1

No. of Non-Response 2

No. of Web Bids Received 0

MSA Kit MSA Lens

Vendor Name SCOTT Kit SCOTT Lens COMMENTS
Kent Optical See quote package for other
105 West Exchange $95.00 $19.00 pricing on lenses
Spring Lake, M| 49456 $51.00 $19.00
Fairway Optical See quote package for other
1343 Whitehall Road $54.00 $19.50 pricing on lenses
Muskegon, Ml 49445 $38.00 $19.50
North Muskegon Eye Care See quote package for other
301 Center Street $162.00 $42.75 pricing on lenses
North Muskegon, M| 49445 $130.00 $42.75
Hagemeyer North America
3300 W. Montague Ave. $38.40 No Bid
N. Charleston, SC 29418 $29.50 No Bid
Aramsco, Inc.
1655 Imperial Way $46.99 No Bid
Thorofare, NJ 08086 No Bid No Bid
Shoreline Optical No Bid No Bid

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christian Toebe
WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:




