Page 1 of 6 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 8
No. of Bids Received 10
COMMODITY #: 485-64 BID _ X QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFQ 07-1531 No. of No-Bids Received 0
No. of Non-Response 1
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies DEPT: DPW/Parks OPENING DATE: 2-9-07 No. of Web Bids Received 4
Vendor Name Chlorine Bowl Disinfectant Trash Bags | Hand Towels Gloves COMMENTS
Bleach Cleaner Cleaner 38 x 60 Single Fold Large
6 Gal/Cs 12 Qt/Cs 4 Gal/Cs 200 Bgs/Cs 4,000/Cs 100/Box
Benjamin Plastics & Supplies
515-E Wild Avenue
Staten Island, NY 10314 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.05/Cs No Bid No Bid [1%10/Net 30
Central Poly Corporation
18 Donaldson Place
Linden, NJ 07036 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.40/Cs No Bid No Bid [1%10/Net 30
Integrity Business Solutions
6548 Schamber Drive (No Brush) 100/Cs
Muskegon, Ml 49444 $1.88/Gal $1.17/Qt $15.96/Gal $11.89/Cs $16.79/Cs $2.82/Bx|1-1/2%10/Net 30
KSS Enterprises
616 E. Vine Street (4,020)
Kalamazoo, MI 49001 $7.99/Cs $15.25/Cs $33.24/Cs $23.93/Cs $17.85/Cs $3.99/Bx
Sparkle Janitorial Service
4100 Woodward Ave., Ste. 9 4 Gal/Cs
Detroit, Ml 48201 $12.50/Cs $24.77/Cs $34.40/Cs $37.40/Cs $40.94/Cs $7.93/Bx |3%10/Net 30
Action Industrial Supply
1840 Sixth Street
Muskegon, Ml 49441 $2.04/Gal $2.08/Qt 10.76/Gal $34.69/Cs $19.95/Cs $2.51/Bx
Nichols
PO Box 291 5.25%Bleach
Muskegon, MI 49443 $1.34/Gal $1.41/Qt $6.04/Gal $25.97/Cs $15.37/Cs $2.88/Bx
DEPARTMENT BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine R. Johnson
RECOMMENDATION:
WITNESS Name: Christian Toebe Signature:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION: PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin Signature:

THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:




Page 2 of 6 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed
No. of Bids Received
COMMODITY #: 485-64 BID X  QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFQ 07-1531 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies DEPT: DWP/Parks OPENING DATE: 2-9-07 No. of Web Bids Received
JRT Jr.
Vendor Name Gloves Toilet Paper | Liquid Soap | Hand Towels | Toilet Paper Dumpster COMMENTS
Medium Double Ply Refill Rolled 2 Ply Deodorizer
100/Box 6/2000°/Cs 4 Gal/Cs 12/600°/Cs 80/550Sh/Cs 28 Oz/Can
Benjamin Plastics & Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Central Poly Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96/Cs

Integrity Business Solutions $2.82/Box $24.67/Cs $5.70/Gal $32.69/Cs $30.97/Cs No Bid

6/800°Cs 96/Cs 8# Jug
KSS Enterprises $3.99/Box $29.26/Cs $26.68/Cs $23.08/Cs $43.04/Cs $13.40/Jug

96/Cs
Sparkle Janitorial Service $7.93/Box $30.80/Cs $44.45/Cs $33.60/Cs $36.20/Cs No Bid
Action Industrial Supply $2.51/Bx $28.00/Cs $10.47/Gal $42.97/Cs $44.00/Cs No Bid
9/42.6-0z/Cs

Nichols $2.88/Bx $15.75Cs $7.22/Gal $28.40/Cs $33.22/Cs $3.42/Cn
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COMMODITY #: 485-64

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: DPWf/Parks

BID _ X QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFQ 07-1531

OPENING DATE: 2-9-07

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Graffiti Urinal Blocks Window Sanitary Soft Scrub COMMENTS
Remover Cleaner Receptacles | With Bleach
Dozen 12/4-0z/Bx 4 Gal/Cs Each 6/36-02/Cs
Benjamin Plastics & Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Central Poly Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 0z. Spray
Integrity Business Solutions $6.29 $44.99/Bx $3.89/Gal $26.69/Ea $3.47Ea
6Qts/Cs 12Qts/Cs
KSS Enterprises $53.12/Cs $5.72/Bx $13.41/Cs $32.64/Ea $27.07/Cs
12/20-0z/Cs
Sparkle Janitorial Service $59.29/Cs $8.29/Bx $26.13/Cs $41.23/Ea $32.86/Cs
Action Industrial Supply $47.18/Cs $6.17/Bx $23.12/Cs $34.81/Ea $5.01/Ea
Nichols $55.95/Cs $4.40/Bx $17.63/Cs $18.01/Ea $4.29/Ea




Page 4 of 6 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed
No. of Bids Received

COMMODITY #: 485-64 BID _ X QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFQ 07-1531 No. of No-Bids Received
No. of Non-Response

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies DEPT: DWP/Parks OPENING DATE: 2/9/09 No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Chlorine Bowl Disinfectant Trash Bags | Hand Towels Gloves COMMENTS
Bleach Cleaner Cleaner 38 x 60 Single Fold Large
6/Gal/Cs 12 Qt/Cs 4 Gal/Cs 200 Bgs/Cs 4,000/Cs 100/Box

Continental Paper

6400 E Eight Mile Rd. 08/25

Detroit, M1 48234 $8.25/Cs $19.37/Cs $32.54/Cs $27.30 $14.68/Cs $2.70/Bx

Zep Manufacturing

4401 Northside Pkwy, Ste 700

Atlanta, GA 30327 No Bid No Bid $67.00/Cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

Arnold Sales

11380 E. Lakewood Blvd.

Holland, MI 49423 $9.99/Cs $16.99/Cs $31.50/Cs $21.50/Cs $15.50/Cs
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COMMODITY #: 485-64

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

BID _X__ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: DWP/Parks

RFQ 07-1531

OPENING DATE: 2/9/07

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

JRT Jr.
Vendor Name Gloves Toilet Paper | Liquid Soap | Hand Towels | Toilet Paper Dumpster COMMENTS
Medium Double Ply Refill Rolled 2 Ply Deodorizer
100/Box 6/2000°/Cs 4Gal/Cs 12/600°/Cs 80/550Sh/Cs 28 Oz/Can
4.5x3.75

12/1000’ 6/800° 80/605Sh 3/10#
Continental Paper $2.70/Bx $23.97 $41.47/Cs $23.14 $32.85 $98.76
12/1#
Zep Manufacturing No Bid No Bid $30.06/Cs No Bid No Bid $55.00
Arnold Sales $2.90/Bx $23.50/Cs $23.50/Cs $25.99/Cs $34.50/Cs $37.50/Cs
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COMMODITY #: 485-64

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: DWP/Parks

BID X __ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFQ 07-1531

OPENING DATE: 2/9/07

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Graffiti Urinal Blocks Window Sanitary Soft Scrub COMMENTS
Remover 12/4-0z/Bx Cleaner Receptacles | With Bleach
Dozen 4 Gal/Cs Each 6/36-02z/Cs
12/18-0z 9/24-0Oz
Continental Paper $25.85 $4.65Dz $6.98 $30.63/Ea $29.15
12/24-0Oz 12-21-0Oz
Zep Manufacturing $39.12Cs No Bid $13.39/Cs No Bid $2.46/Qt
Arnold Sales $39.10/Cs $6.29/Dz $16.75/Cs $11.99/Ea $25.25/Cs




