Page 1 of 6 MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY No. of Bids Mailed 7
No. of Bids Received 10
COMMODITY #: 485-64 BID _ X__ QUOTATION PROPOSAL RFQ 08-1581 No. of No-Bids Received 1
No. of Non-Response 3
PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies DEPT: DPW/Parks OPENING DATE: 2-14-08 No. of Web Bids Received 6
Vendor Name Chlorine Bowl Disinfectant Trash Bags | Hand Towels Gloves COMMENTS
Bleach Cleaner Cleaner 38 x 60 Single Fold Large

6 Gal/Cs 12 Qt/Cs 4 Gal/Cs 200 Bgs/Cs 4,000/Cs 100/Box
Central Poly Corporation
18 Donaldson Place
Linden, NJ 07036 No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.20/Case No Bid No Bid 1% 10 Days
Dash Medical Gloves, Inc.
10180 S. 54th Street
Franklin, WI 53132 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.29/Box 10 Bx Minimum Glove Order
Harambee Enterprises, Inc.
450 W Hackley Ave, Ste A
Muskegon, Ml 49442 $7.42/Case $16.15/Case $27.85/Case $26.62/Case $18.12/Case $3.00/Box  |1% 10 Days
HD Supply Facilities Maint. 38" x 58"
10641 Scripps Summit Ct 1.12 Gallon 14 Micron
San Diego, CA 92131 No Bid No Bid $11.20 /Each | $34.00/Case No Bid $5.79/Box
HP Products
8652 Haggerty, Ste 200
Belleville, Ml 48111 $7.43/Case $13.36/Case | $30.28/Case | $27.87/Case | $16.36/Case $2.61/Box
Integrity Business Solutions
6548 Schamber Drive
Muskegon, Ml 49444 $10.28/Carton | $20.33/Carton | $35.13/Carton | $18.33/Carton | $19.32/Carton $3.31/Box | 1-1/2% 10 Days
Interboro Packaging Corp
114 Bracker Road Will Only Ship Gloves in
Montgomery, NY 12549 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.84 No Bid $3.00 100/Box 10 Box/Case

DEPARTMENT
RECOMMENDATION:

PURCHASING
RECOMMENDATION:

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID Name: Christine R. Johnson

WITNESS Name: Lynn Zatalokin

PURCHASING MANAGER Name: Lynn Zatalokin
THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION WAS AWARDED TO:

Signature:

Signature:
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COMMODITY #: 485-64

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: DWP/Parks

BID _ X__ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFQ 08-1581

OPENING DATE: 2-14-08

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

JRT Jr.

Vendor Name Gloves Toilet Paper | Liquid Soap Broom Toilet Paper Dumpster COMMENTS
Medium Double Ply Refill Corn Straw 2 Ply Deodorizer
100/Box 8/2000°/Cs 4 Gal/Cs 56" Tall/Reg | 80/550Sh/Cs 28 Oz/Can

Central Poly Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dash Medical Gloves, Inc. $3.29/Box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6/Case 2-8Lb/Case
Harambee Enterprises, Inc. $3.00/Box $25.94/Case | $24.44/Case $4.68/Each $35.84/Case | $26.07/Case
Core 303"
1000/Roll Pkg/2
HD Supply Facilities Maint. $5.79/Box $28.80/Case | $7.97/Gallon $18.04/Pkg $42.95/Case No Bid
12 Rolls
1000/Roll 96 Rolls/Case 3/10#
HP Products $2.61/Box $20.76 $22.25/Case $5.13/Each $31.76 $94.08/Case
96 Rolls/Ctn
Integrity Business Solutions $3.31/Box $34.53/Carton | $41.44/Carton | $6.50/Each | $32.00/Carton No Bid
Interboro Packaging Corp $3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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COMMODITY #: 485-64

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

BID _ X ___ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: DPW/Parks

RFQ 08-1581

OPENING DATE: 2-14-08

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Soft Scrub Mop Heads Sponges COMMENTS
With Bleach | Cotton String | Scotch Brite
6/36-0z/Cs 24 Oz Type, 2 Sided
Central Poly Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dash Medical Gloves, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid
6/320z/Case 20/Case
Harambee Enterprises, Inc. $37.96/Case $31.94/Case | $29.83/Case
HD Supply Facilities Maint. $5.22/Each No Bid No Bid
12 Quarts/Case 20/Case
HP Products $20.59/Case | $41.64/Case $1.39/Each
9/260z/Ctn 10/Pack
Integrity Business Solutions $35.87/Carton | $2.69 Each $5.27/Pack
Interboro Packaging Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid
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COMMODITY #: 485-64

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: DWP/Parks

BID X __ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFQ 08-1581

OPENING DATE: 2/14/08

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Chlorine Bowl Disinfectant Trash Bags | Hand Towels Gloves COMMENTS
Bleach Cleaner Cleaner 38 x 60 Single Fold Large

6/Gal/Cs 12 Qt/Cs 4 Gal/Cs 200 Bgs/Cs 4,000/Cs 100/Box

Interboro Packaging Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.74 No Bid $3.00

Interboro Packaging Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.34 No Bid $3.00

KSS Enterprises

410 E 44th Street, SW

Grand Rapids, Ml 49458 $1.49/Gallon $16.60/Case | $14.80/Gallon | $26.41/Case [ $20.13/Case $3.66/Box

Nichols

PO Box 291

Muskegon, Ml 49443 $7.46/Case $18.00/Case $24.16/Case $29.48/Case $21.35/Case $3.05/Box

Sam Tell & Son Inc.

5851 Maspeth Avenue

Maspeth, NY 11378 $11.95/Case No Bid $19.50/Case No Bid $29.50/Case $3.85/Box
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COMMODITY #: 485-64

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

DEPT: DWP/Parks

BID X __ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

RFQ 08-1581

OPENING DATE: 2/14/08

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

JRT Jr.

Vendor Name Gloves Toilet Paper | Liquid Soap Broom Toilet Paper Dumpster COMMENTS
Medium Double Ply Refill Corn Straw 2 Ply Deodorizer
100/Box 8/2000°/Cs 4Gal/Cs 56" Tall/Reg | 80/550Sh/Cs 28 Oz/Can

Interboro Packaging Corp $3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Interboro Packaging Corp $3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Rolls/Case 1/Jug
KSS Enterprises $3.66/Box $36.79/Case | $7.14/Gallon $9.95 $35.06/Case $14.07/Jug
12/Case 605Sh/Roll | 9-42.50z/Case
Nichols $3.05/Box $25.12/Case | $35.88/Case $4.99/Each $37.98/Case | $31.80/Case
12/1000’ 96 Rolls
Sam Tell & Son Inc. $3.85/Box $39.50/Case | $49.50/Case $5.84/Each $44.50/Case No Bid
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COMMODITY #: 485-64

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Janitorial Supplies

MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARY

BID __ X__ QUOTATION PROPOSAL

DEPT: DWP/Parks

RFQ 08-1581

OPENING DATE: 2/14/08

No. of Bids Mailed

No. of Bids Received

No. of No-Bids Received

No. of Non-Response

No. of Web Bids Received

Vendor Name Soft Scrub Mop Heads Sponges COMMENTS
With Bleach | Cotton String | Scotch Brite
6/36-0z/Cs 24 Oz Type, 2 Sided
Interboro Packaging Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid
Interboro Packaging Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Qts/Case 1/Sponge
KSS Enterprises $27.07/Case No Bid $1.07 Each
6-320z/Case 20/Case
Nichols $27.80/Case | $35.40/Case | $15.54/Case
9/260z 40 Ct/Case
Sam Tell & Son Inc. $49.50/Case | $35.88/Case | $22.59/Case
ePoly Star, Inc. - No Bid






