
No. of Bids Mailed             82MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARYPage 1 of 9
No. of Bids Received            21   

No. of No-Bids Received         1              RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65
No. of Non-Response  2                

No. of Web Bids Received  4       OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Supplies 0

CommentsLargeTowelsTrash BagsDisinfectantBowl CleanerChlorine BleachVendor Name
GlovesSingle Fold38 X 60CleanerQuartGallon

100/Bx Cost4000/Cs Cost200/Cs CostGal. CostCostCost
Quote Rejected - All American Poly
Quotation Summary / Pg. 240 Turner Place
Not Completed as InstructedPiscataway, NJ 08854

4 Gal/Cs12/CsAction Industrial Supply
$4.33$23.21$42.93$83.22/Cs$43.56/Cs$2.281840 Sixth Street

Eqv.  $20.81Eqv.  $3.63Muskegon, MI  49441

4/Cs12/Cs6/CsApplied - Michigan LTD
$5.19$25.49$86.99$33.92/Cs$64.79/Cs$10.63/Cs6090 Grand Haven Road

Eqv.  $8.48Eqv.  $5.40Eqv.  $1.77Norton Shores, MI  49441

12/CsChemsearch Div NCH Corp
No BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$90.72/CsNo BidPO Box 152170

Eqv.  $7.56Irving, TX  75015

10/Cs4/Cs12/Cs6/CsCentral Michigan Paper
$28.55/Cs$18.50$22.25$78.50/Cs$23.00/Cs$10.30/Cs6194 E. Fulton Road
Eqv.  $2.86Eqv.  $19.63$1.92Eqv.  $1.72Ada, MI  49301

Quote Rejected - Central Poly Corporation
Quotation Summary / Pg. 218 Donaldson Place, 
Not Completed as InstructedBox 4097

Linden, NJ  07036
Quote Rejected - Dash Medical Gloves Inc
Quotation Summary / Pg. 210180 S 54th Street
Not Completed as InstructedFranklin, WI  53132

BUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID  Name:   Christine R JohnsonDEPARTMENT 
RECOMMENDATION:

Signature:  ______________________________WITNESS  Name:    Christian Toebe
PURCHASING

Signature:  ______________________________ACCOUNTING MGR Name: Joseph W. SiedenstrangRECOMMENDATION:
RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR / SUBCONTRACTOR CHECKLIST:    N/A

    THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION  WAS AWARDED TO:   
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         RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65

OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Supplies

CommentsLargeTowelsTrash BagsDisinfectantBowl CleanerChlorine BleachVendor Name
GlovesSingle Fold38 X 60CleanerQuartGallon

100/Bx Cost4000/Cs Cost200/Cs CostGal. CostCostCost
EM Services LLC

$5.92$35.53$34.20$11.46$1.98$2.824500 Empire Way - Ste. 1
Lansing, MI  48917

4/Cs12/Cs6/CsExpar Company
$5.50$20.45$27.00$31.80/Cs$34.00/Cs$12.63/Cs504 W Hovey Street

Eqv.  $7.95Eqv.  $2.83Eqv.  $2.11Muskegon, MI  49444

Quote Rejected - Genesis II Inc
Quotation Summary / Pg. 2PO Box  11226
Not Completed as InstructedRock Hill, SC  29731

4/Cs12/Cs6/CsIntegrity Business Solutions
$4.36$18.49$14.49$36.69/Cs$37.99/Cs$10.75/Cs6548 Schamber Drive

2%10 Net 30Eqv.  $4.30Eqv.  $18.12Eqv.  $14.20Eqv.  $8.99Eqv.  $3.10Eqv.  $1.76Muskegon, MI  49441

Quote Rejected - Interboro Packaging -Bids A-E
Quotation Summary / Pg. 2114 Bracken Road
Not Completed as InstructedMontgomery, NY  12549

Cs/4020KSS Enterprises
$4.06$17.85/Cs$25.47$12.37$2.02$2.10410-E 44th Street, S.W.

Eqv.  $17.76Grand Rapids, MI  49548

4/Cs12/Cs6/CsMidland Chemical Company
$3.65$16.90$21.20$22.50/Cs$24.30/Cs$8.95/Cs1500 Commerce Drive

Eqv.  $5.63Eqv.  $2.03Eqv.  $1.49Midland, MI  48642
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         RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65

OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Supplies

CommentsLargeTowelsTrash BagsDisinfectantBowl CleanerChlorine BleachVendor Name
GlovesSingle Fold38 X 60CleanerQuartGallon

100/Bx Cost4000/Cs Cost200/Cs CostGal. CostCostCost
10/Cs4/Cs12/Cs6/CsNichols

$33.00/Cs$18.50$21.50$25.55/Cs$17.65/Cs$10.56/CsPO Box  291
Eqv.  $3.30Eqv.  $6.39Eqv.  $1.47Eqv.  $1.76Muskegon, MI  49443

150/Cs4/Cs12/Cs6/CsOne Way Porducts Inc
$5.00$20.00$19.17/Cs$32.92/Cs$24.50/Cs$10.31/Cs433 E. Ransom Street

Eqv.  $25.56Eqv.  $8.23Eqv.  $2.04Eqv.  $1.72Kalamazoo, MI  49005

4/Cs12/Cs4/CsPerfection Commerc. Supplies
$4.20$23.25$25.45$35.25/Cs$26.20/Cs$40.50/Cs905 North Church Street

2%10 Net 30Eqv.  $4.12Eqv.  $22.79Eqv.  $24.94Eqv.  $8.64Eqv.  $2.14Eqv.  $9.92Tekonsha, MI  49092

6/96oz/CsQuill Corporation
$5.88$20.88No BidNo BidNo Bid$2.22 Ea100 Schelter Road

Eqv.  $2.96Lincolnshire, IL  60069

4/Cs12/Cs6/CsTico Duckett Distributing
$3.90$24.50$24.85$35.00/Cs$24.00/Cs$10.05/Cs618 Sheridan Street
VinylEqv.  $8.75Eqv.  $2.14Eqv.  $1.68Lansing, MI  48906

Quote Rejected - Tronex Tnternational
Quotation Summary / Pg. 22 Cranberry Road
Not Completed as InstructedParsippany, NJ  07054

10/100/CsWatkins Surgical Supply
$35.60/Cs$25.50No BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid1391 E. Sherman Blvd
Eqv.  $3.56Muskegon, MI  49444
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         RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65

OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Supplies

CommentsJRT Jr TPTowels RolledDumpsterLiquid SoapJRT JR TPMediumVendor Name
Dispenser 12/600'/CsDeodorizerRefillDouble PlyGloves
Cost EachCost28oz CostGallon Cost8/2000/CsBx/100

Quote Rejected - All American Poly
Quotation Summary / Pg. 240 Turner Place
Not Completed as InstructedPiscataway, NJ 08854

9/42.6oz/Cs4/CsCs/6/2000Action Industrial Supply
$38.17$46.28$34.14/Cs$38.29/Cs$27.05/Cs$4.331840 Sixth Street

Eqv.  $2.49Eqv.  $9.57Eqv.  $4.51 RIMuskegon, MI  49441

Alternate 4/CsCs/8/2000Applied - Michigan LTD
ReplacementNo BidNo Bid$51.63/Cs$36.30/Cs$5.196090 Grand Haven Road

59209Eqv.  $12.91Eqv.  $4.54 RINorton Shores, MI  49441
$52.13

6/6.3oz/Cs2 x 2.5 Gal/CsChemsearch Div NCH Corp
No BidNo Bid$174.31/Cs$167.35/CsNo BidNo BidPO Box 152170

Eqv.  $129.12Eqv.  $33.47Irving, TX  75015

4/CsCs/6/200010/CsCentral Michigan Paper
No BidNo BidNo Bid$49.70/Cs$28.60/Cs$28.55/Cs6194 E. Fulton Road

Eqv.  $12.43Eqv.  $4.77 RIEqv.  $2.86Ada, MI  49301

Quote Rejected - Central Poly Corporation
Quotation Summary / Pg. 218 Donaldson Place, 
Not Completed as InstructedBox 4097

Linden, NJ  07036
Quote Rejected - Dash Medical Gloves Inc
Quotation Summary / Pg. 210180 S 54th Street
Not Completed as InstructedFranklin, WI  53132
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         RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65

OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Services

CommentsJRT Jr TPTowels RolledDumpsterLiquid SoapJRT JR TPMediumVendor Name
Dispenser 12/600'/CsDeodorizerRefillDouble PlyGloves
Cost EachCost28oz CostGallon Cost8/2000/CsBx/100

EM Services LLC
No Bid$59.42No Bid$12.57$46.14/Cs$5.924500 Empire Way - Ste. 1

Eqv.  $5.77 RILansing, MI  48917

4/Cs12/1000/CsExpar Company
No Bid$34.00No Bid$45.00/Cs$26.00/Cs$5.59504 W Hovey Street

Eqv.  $11.25Eqv.  $4.33 RIMuskegon, MI  49444

Quote Rejected - Genesis II Inc
Quotation Summary / Pg. 2PO Box  11226
Not Completed as InstructedRock Hill, SC  29731

Alternate 4/CsIntegrity Business Solutions
Replmnt 59209$47.79No Bid$46.99/Cs$42.92$4.396548 Schamber Drive

2%10 Net 30$37.95Eqv.  $46.83Eqv.  $11.51Eqv.  $5.26 RIEqv.  $4.30Muskegon, MI  49441
Eqv.  $37.19

Quote Rejected - Interboro Packaging -Bids A-E
Quotation Summary / Pg. 2114 Bracken Road
Not Completed as InstructedMontgomery, NY  12549

6/800'/Cs8# Jug12/1000/CsKSS Enterprises
No Bid$22.95/Cs$14.57/Jug$9.39$29.61/Cs$4.06410-E 44th Street, S.W.

Eqv.  $34.42Eqv.  $3.19Eqv.  $4.94 RIGrand Rapids, MI  49548

Alternate 12/20oz/Cs4/Cs12/900/CsMidland Chemical Company
Replacement$31.95$27.50/Cs$34.25/Cs$14.70/Cs$3.651500 Commerce Drive

59209Eqv.  $3.21Eqv.  $8.56Eqv.  $2.60 RIMidland, MI  48642
$45.50
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         RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65

OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Supplies

CommentsJRT Jr TPTowels RolledDumpsterLiquid SoapJRT JR TPMediumVendor Name
Dispenser 12/600'/CsDeodorizerRefillDouble PlyGloves
Cost EachCost28oz CostGallon Cost8/2000/CsBx/100
Alternate 9/42.6oz/Cs4/Cs12/1000/Cs10/CsNichols

Replacement$31.98$32.75/Cs$23.86/Cs$24.10/Cs$33.00/CsPO Box  291
SCA56TEqv.  $5.97Eqv.  $5.97Eqv.  $4.02 RIEqv.  $3.30Muskegon, MI  49443
$22.50

Alternate 12/650'/Cs9/42.6oz/Cs4/Cs12/2000/CsOne Way Porducts Inc
Replacement$34.00/Cs$34.00/Cs$36.00/Cs$22.42/Cs$5.00433 E. Ransom Street

59209Eqv.  $31.38Eqv.  $2.48Eqv.  $9.00Eqv.  $1.87 RIKalamazoo, MI  49005
$44.00

Alternate 6/800'/Cs2/8# Jug/Cs4/Cs12/1000/CsPerfection Commerc. Supplies
Replmnt 85250$21.75/Cs$27.50/Cs$45.65/Cs$29.50/Cs$4.20905 North Church Street

2% 10 Net 30$34.45Eqv.  $31.97Eqv.  $2.95Eqv.  $11.18Eqv.  $4.82 RIEqv.  $4.12Tekonsha, MI  49092
Eqv.  $33.76

4/1000/CsQuill Corporation
No BidNo BidNo Bid$12.44$22.72/Cs$5.88100 Schelter Road

Eqv.  $11.36 RILincolnshire, IL  60069

6/800'/Cs4/Cs6/2000/CsTico Duckett Distributing
$30.00$28.20/CsNo Bid$27.30/Cs$34.60/Cs$3.90618 Sheridan Street

Eqv.  $41.76Eqv.  $6.83Eqv.  $5.77 RIVinylLansing, MI  48906

Quote Rejected - Tronex Tnternational
Quotation Summary / Pg. 22 Cranberry Road
Not Completed as InstructedParsippany, NJ  07054

4/Cs10/100/csWatkins Surgical Supply
No BidNo BidNo Bid$43.64/CsNo Bid$35.60/Cs1391 E. Sherman Blvd

Eqv.  $10.91Eqv.  $3.56Muskegon, MI  49444
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         RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65

OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Supplies

CommentsJanitor'sTrash BagsMop HeadsToilet PaperVendor Name
Broom33X40 RolledDozen2 Ply

Cost Each250/Cs CostCost80/550sht/Cs
Quote Rejected - All American Poly
Quotation Summary / Pg. 240 Turner Place
Not Completed as InstructedPiscataway, NJ 08854

96/500/CsAction Industrial Supply
$6.52$28.18$40.28$32.48/Cs1840 Sixth Street

Eqv.  $0.33 RIMuskegon, MI  49441

Dozen80/500/CsApplied - Michigan LTD
$82.50/Dz$84.84$80.80$75.00/Cs6090 Grand Haven Road
Eqv.  $6.88Eqv.  $1.03 RINorton Shores, MI  49441

Chemsearch Div NCH Corp
No BidNo BidNo BidNo BidPO Box 152170

Irving, TX  75015

96/500/CsCentral Michigan Paper
$5.98$19.90$40.70$42.00/Cs6194 E. Fulton Road

Eqv.  $0.44 RIAda, MI  49301

Quote Rejected - Central Poly Corporation
Quotation Summary / Pg. 218 Donaldson Place, 
Not Completed as InstructedBox 4097

Linden, NJ  07036
Quote Rejected - Dash Medical Gloves Inc
Quotation Summary / Pg. 210180 S 54th Street
Not Completed as InstructedFranklin, WI  53132
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         RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65

OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Supplies

CommentsJanitor'sTrash BagsMop HeadsToilet PaperVendor Name
Broom33X40 RolledDozen2 Ply

Cost Each250/Cs CostCost80/550sht/Cs
EachEM Services LLC

$7.98$26.57$4.64/Ea$61.78/Cs4500 Empire Way - Ste. 1
Eqv.  $55.68Eqv.  $0.77 RILansing, MI  48917

96/500/CsExpar Company
$4.75$18.50$48.00$45.50/Cs504 W Hovey Street

Eqv.  $0.52 RIMuskegon, MI  49444

Quote Rejected - Genesis II Inc
Quotation Summary / Pg. 2PO Box  11226
Not Completed as InstructedRock Hill, SC  29731

EachIntegrity Business Solutions
$8.39$19.39$2.39/Ea$51.19/Cs6548 Schamber Drive

2%10 Net 30Eqv.  $8.22Eqv.  $19.00Eqv.  $28.11Eqv.  $0.63 RIMuskegon, MI  49441

Quote Rejected - Interboro Packaging -Bids A-E
Quotation Summary / Pg. 2114 Bracken Road
Not Completed as InstructedMontgomery, NY  12549

Each80/500/CsKSS Enterprises
$10.63$18.59$3.11$34.42/Cs410-E 44th Street, S.W.

Eqv.  $37.32Eqv.  $0.47 RIGrand Rapids, MI  49548

96/1000/CsMidland Chemical Company
$6.35$13.80$42.50$33.70/Cs1500 Commerce Drive

Eqv.  $0.19 RIMidland, MI  48642
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         RFQ 10-1707_____ BID   ___X__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSALCOMMODITY #:   485-65

OPENING DATE:   02/17/10DEPT:  Dept. of Public Works / ParksPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Janitoral Supplies

CommentsJanitor'sTrash BagsMop HeadsToilet PaperVendor Name
Broom33X40 RolledDozen2 Ply

Cost Each250/Cs CostCost80/550sht/Cs
96/500/CsNichols

$5.24$14.04$28.05$31.92/CsPO Box  291
Eqv.  $0.37 RIMuskegon, MI  49443

96/550/CsOne Way Porducts Inc
$7.25$15.52$86.00$43.27/Cs433 E. Ransom Street

Eqv.  $0.45 RIKalamazoo, MI  49005

Each96/500/CsPerfection Commerc. Supplies
$7.75$20.60/Cs$2.70/Each$38.75/Cs905 North Church Street

2%10 Net 30Eqv.  $7.30Eqv.  $20.19Eqv.  $31.75Eqv.  $0.44 RITekonsha, MI  49092

80/605/CsQuill Corporation
$11.44No Bid$39.89$57.81/Cs100 Schelter Road

Eqv.  $0.66 RILincolnshire, IL  60069

AlternateTico Duckett Distributing
Corn$19.20$45.60$48.10618 Sheridan Street
$9.00Lansing, MI  48906

Quote Rejected - Tronex Tnternational
Quotation Summary / Pg. 22 Cranberry Road
Not Completed as InstructedParsippany, NJ  07054

Watkins Surgical Supply
No BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid1391 E. Sherman Blvd

Muskegon, MI  49444

No Bid on All ItemsBob Barker Company, Inc
No Bid on All ItemsStaples


