
No. of Bids Mailed  Picked up individual      MUSKEGON COUNTY SUMMARYPage 1
No. of Bids Received              _____ BID   ___x__  QUOTATION   ____  PROPOSAL
No. of No-Bids Received               RFQ 10-1773COMMODITY #:   998-94
No. of Non-Response    0            

No. of Web Bids Received     0  OPENING DATE:  9/7/10DEPT:   VariousPRODUCT/SERVICE:  Vehicles for Sale
Vehicle #12Vehicle #11Vehicle #10Vehicle #9Vehicle #8Vehicle #7Vehicle #6Vehicle #5Vehicle #4Vehicle #3Vehicle #2Vehicle #1

FordBuickChevyChevyFordChevyChevyChevyChevyFordFordOldsmobileVendor Name
E-Super DutyCenturyTruck 4x4ImpalaClubLuminaExpress VanExpress VanExpress VanClubE350 VanCutlass
Cutaway BusWagon VanWagon VanWagon

No Bid$650.00$150.00No BidNo Bid$650.00$1,600.00$1,600.00$1,600.00$1,400.00$1,750.00$900.00Alvin Fletcher
No BidNo BidNo Bid$1,683.00No BidNo Bid$1,831.00$2,179.00$1,829.00No Bid$1,581.00No BidKyle Maxim

$800.00No BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$200.00$800.00$800.00$800.00No Bid$800.00No BidVictor Rockafellow
No Bid$400.00No Bid$400.00No Bid$300.00No BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$250.00David Chester
No BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$690.00$750.00No BidASAP Supply 

$427.00$237.00$146.00$767.00$727.00$327.00$1,427.00$1,227.00$1,527.00$747.00$1,287.00$327.00Harolds Used Cars
No Bid$876.00No BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$576.00Joni Freiesleben
No Bid$300.00No Bid$700.00No Bid$350.00No BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$300.00Anthony McDonald
$1,002.00$626.00No Bid$1,001.00$502.00$302.00$851.00$451.00$902.00$645.00$901.00$409.00Glen Visscher

$800.00$200.00$100.00$300.00$1,500.00$500.00$2,300.00$2,250.00$2,500.00$1,000.00$800.00$200.00Ambu-Care of W. MI
No BidNo BidNo Bid$1,200.00No BidNo Bid$1,500.00No BidNo BidNo BidNo BidNo BidRon Allard
No Bid$300.00$300.00$250.00No BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$200.00No BidNo BidNo BidDuane Little
No Bid$257.00No Bid$805.00No Bid$212.00$1,257.00$1,093.00$1,313.00No BidNo Bid$268.00True Legend Corvette

Christian ToebeBUYER RESPONSIBLE FOR BID  Name:  DEPARTMENT

RECOMMENDATION:     

Signature:  ______________________________WITNESS  Name:   Christian Toebe

PURCHASING 

Signature:  ______________________________Accounting Manager:  Joseph SiedenstrangRECOMMENDATION:     

    THIS BID, PROPOSAL OR QUOTATION  WAS AWARDED TO:   
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