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Commodity Numbers: 420-16; 420-24; 420-44; 420-84; 680-72

Bid: RFB 14-2139
Product / Service: Detention Furniture

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

Department: Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center

Release Date: 06/20/2014
Opening Date: 07/15/2014

~MITN Solicitation Statistics™

Vendors Received Notice: 89

Vendors Accessed Attachments: 30

Proposals Received: 3

No-Proposal Form Received: 0

Multi-Purpose Rectangle

Multi-Purpose Rectangle

Vendor Name & Address Table {30"x96") - 13 *Alternate Table {30"x60") - 2 *Alternate Comments
Norix* C-Tech Norix* C-Tech
Blockhouse Company, Inc.
3285 Farmirail Road Delivery 7 - 10 Weeks
York, PA 17406 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Net 30 Days
Correctional Technologies, Inc. $190.00 Each $140.00 Each
Cortech USA *Equivalent *Equivalent
7530 Plaza Court *$186.20 Each *$137.20 Each Delivery 30 - 45 Days
Willowbrook, IL 60527 No Bid *$2,420.60 Total No Bid *$274.40 Total *2% 10 Early Payment Discount
Kentwood Office Furniture
3063 Breton Road $915.82 Each $682.35 Each Delivery 6 - 8 Weeks
Grand Rapids, Ml 49512 $11,905.66 Total No Bid $1,364.70 Total No Bid Net 30 Days

Estimated Cost $157,532.00
Not Advertised in L.ocal Paper

Department Recommendations:

Biockhouse Company, Inc.: Medium Impact Lounge Chairs and Occasional Tables
Coirectional Technologies, Inc., Cortech USA: High Impact 48" Tables and Stacking Chairs

Kentwood Office Furniture: High Impact Lounge Chairs, Tables/Ottornans, Beds, Nightstands,

Desks, Desk Stools, 4-Shelf Storage Units, Tamper Resistant Classroom Tables

Vendor Awarded:

Name of Buyer: Christine R. Johnson

Name of Accounting Manager: Dwight D. Avery

Board Approval Date:

Signature: / J L /7 /L/(W
// (4 /’

Purchase Order Number:
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Commodity Numbers: 420-16; 420-24; 420-44; 420-84; 680-72

Bid: RFB 14-2139
Product / Service: Detention Furniture

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMNMARY

Release Date: 06/20/2014
Opening Date: 07/15/2014

Department: Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center

**MITN Solicitation Statistics**

Vendors Received Notice: 89

Vendors Accessed Attachments: 30

Proposals Received: 3

No-Proposal Form Received: 0

Vendor Name & Address

High Impact Stacking
Chair - 93

Norix - Integra*

*Alternate
Cortech Razorback

Comments

Blockhouse Company, Inc.
3285 Farmtrail Road

York, PA 17406 No Bid No Bid

Correctional Technologies, inc. $33.65 Each

Cortech USA *Equivalent

7530 Plaza Court *$32.98 Each

Willowbrook, IL 60527 No Bid *$3,067.14 Total *2% 10 Early Payment Discount

Kentwood Office Furniture
3063 Breton Road
Grand Rapids, M! 49512

$140.76 Each
$13,090.68 Total

No Bid
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Commodity Numbers: 420-16; 420-24; 420-44; 420-84; 680-72

Bid: RFB 14-2139
Product / Service: Detention Furniture

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

Department: Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center

Release Date: 06/20/2014
Opening Date: 07/15/2014

**MITN Solicitation Statistics™

Vendors Received Notice: 89

Vendors Accessed Attachments: 30

Proposals Received: 3

No-Proposal Form Received: 0

High Impact Lounge High Impact
Vendor Name & Address Chair - 40 *Alternate Table/Ottoman - 16 *Alternate Comments
Norix - Hondo* ModuForm Norix - Hondo* ModuForm
Blockhouse Company, Inc.
3285 Farmtrail Road
York, PA 17406 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Correctional Technologies, Inc. $508.45 Each $520.84 Each
Cortech USA *Equivalent *Equivalent
7530 Plaza Court *$498.28 Each *$510.42 Each
Willowbrook, IL 60527 No Bid *$19,931.20 Total No Bid *$8,166.72 Total *2% 10 Early Payment Discount

Kentwood Office Furniture
3063 Breton Road
Grand Rapids, Ml 49512

$847.00 Each
$33,880.00 Total

No Bid

$687.12 Each
$10,9983.92 Total

No Bid
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Commodity Numbers: 420-16; 420-24; 420-44; 420-84; 680-72

Bid: RFB 14-2139
Product / Service: Detention Furniture

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUNMMARY

Department: Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center

Release Date: 06/20/2014
Opening Date: 07/15/2014

**MITN Solicitation Statistics™

Vendors Received Notice: 89

Vendors Accessed Attachments: 30

Proposals Received: 3

No-Proposal Form Received: 0

High Impact Table

Vendor Name & Address (48"Dia) - 10 *Alternate Comments
Norix - X-Base* ModuFarm
Blockhouse Company, Inc.
3285 Farmtrail Road
York, PA 17406 No Bid No Bid
Correctional Technologies, Inc. $459.95 Each
Cortech USA *Equivalent
7530 Plaza Court *$450.75 Each Total Adjusted for Cost for 10 Tabies
Willowbrook, IL 60527 No Bid *$4,507.50 Total *2% 10 Early Payment Discount

Kentwood Office Furniture
3063 Breton Road
Grand Rapids, Ml 49512

$777.12 Each
$7,771.20 Total

No Bid
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Commodity Numbers: 420-16; 420-24; 420-44; 420-84; 680-72

Bid: RFB 14-2139
Product / Service: Detention Furniture

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

Department: Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center

Release Date: 06/20/2014
Opening Date: 07/15/2014

**MITN Solicitation Statistics™

Vendors Received Notice: 83

Vendors Accessed Attachments: 30

Proposals Received: 3

No-Proposal Form Received: 0

Vendor Name & Address

High Impact Bed - 34
Norix - Attenda

*Alternate
Cortech Endurance

High Impact Nightstand -
28

Norix - Attenda

*Alternate
Cortech Endurance

Comments

Blockhouse Company, inc.
3285 Farmtrail Road

York, PA 17406 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Correctional Technologies, Inc. $883.70 Each $243.70 Each

Cortech USA *Equivalent *Equivalent

7530 Plaza Court *$866.03 Each *$238.83 Each

Willowbrook, IL 60527 No Bid *$29,445.02 No Bid *$6,687.24 Total *2% 10 Early Payment Discount
Kentwood Office Furniture

3063 Breton Road $1,244.06 Each $401.24 Each

Grand Rapids, Ml 49512 $42,298.04 Total No Bid $11,234.72 Total No Bid
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Commodity Numbers: 420-16; 420-24; 420-44; 420-84; 680-72

Bid: RFB 14-2139
Product / Service: Detention Furniture

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUNMMARY

Department: Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center

Release Date: 06/20/2014
Opening Date: 07/15/2014

**MITN Solicitation Statistics*~

Vendors Received Notice: 89

Vendors Accessed Attachments: 30

Proposals Received: 3

No-Proposal Form Received: 0

Vendor Name & Address

High impact Desk - 32
Norix - Attenda

*Alternate
Cortech Endurance

High Impact Desk Stool -
32

Norix - Attenda

*Alternate
Cortech Endurance

Comments

Blockhouse Company, Inc.
3285 Farmtrail Road

York, PA 17406 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Correctional Technologies, inc. $438.70 Each $128.70 Each

Cortech USA *Equivalent *Equivalent

7530 Plaza Court *$429.93 Each *$126.13 Each

Willowbrook, IL 60527 No Bid *$13,757.76 Total No Bid *$4,036.16 Total *2% 10 Early Payment Discount
Kentwood Office Furniture

3063 Breton Road $707.76 Each $250.35 Each

Grand Rapids, Mi 49512 $22,648.32 Total No Bid $8,011.20 Total No Bid
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Commodity Numbers: 420-16; 420-24; 420-44; 420-84; 680-72

Bid: RFB 14-2139
Product / Service: Detention Furniture

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUNIMARY

Department: Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center Release Date: 06/20/2014
Opening Date: 07/15/2014

“*MITN Solicitation Statistics™

Vendors Received Notice: 89

Vendors Accessed Attachments: 30

Proposals Received: 3

No-Proposal Form Received: 0

Vendor Name & Address

High Impact 4 Shelf
Storage Unit - 20

Norix - Attenda

*Alternate
Cortech Endurance

Comments

Blockhouse Company, Inc.
3285 Farmtrail Road

York, PA 17406 No Bid No Bid

Correctional Technologies, Inc. $418.70 Each

Cortech USA *Equivalent

7530 Plaza Court *$410.33 Each

Willowbrook, 1L 60527 No Bid *$8,206.60 Total *2% 10 Early Payment Discount

Kentwood Office Furniture
3063 Breton Road
Grand Rapids, M| 49512

$667.53 Each
$13,350.60 Total

No Bid
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Commodity Numbers: 420-16; 420-24; 420-44; 420-84; 680-72

Bid: RFB 14-2139
Product / Service: Detention Furniture

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY

Department: Muskegon County Juvenile Transition Center Release Date: 06/20/2014
Opening Date: 07/15/2014

**MITN Solicitation Statistics™

Vendors Received Notice: 89

Vendors Accessed Attachments: 30

Proposals Received: 3

No-Proposal Form Received: 0

Vendor Name & Address

Medium Impact Lounge
Chair - 8
Blockhouse Gallant

Medium Impact
Occasional Table - § Grand Total

Blockhouse Arcadia

Comments

Blockhouse Company, Inc. Partial Bid

3285 Farmtrail Road $855.02 Each $352.24 Each

York, PA 17406 $6,840.16 Total $1,761.20 Total $8,601.36

Correctional Technologies, Inc. Partial Bid

Cortech USA $114,630.69

7530 Plaza Court *Equivalent

Willowbrook, IL 60527 No Bid No Bid *$112,338.08 *2% 10 Early Payment Discount
Kentwood Office Furniture Partial Bid

3063 Breton Road

Grand Rapids, Ml 48512 No Bid No Bid $176,549.04




MUSKEGON COUNTY JUVENILE TREATMENT CENTER
FURNISHINGS AND EQUIPMENT BIDS

8/7/2014

BLOCKHOUSE
Description |Qty. |Manufacturer Model Number Color IPrice (each) IDiscounl (% Off List) Total |Remarks NOTES
DETENTION/RESIDENT FURNITURE
Specified Medium Impact Lounge Chair 8 Blockhouse - Gallant T.B.S./Smoke $720.00 |-20% = $1,152.00 $4,608.00
Blockhouse 8 Blockhouse - Gallant $855.02 $6,840.16
Specified Medium Impact Occasional Table 5 Blockhouse - Arcadia T.B.S. / Smoke $300.00 |-20% = $300.00 1,200.00
Blockhouse 5 Blockhouse - Arcadia 352.24 1,761.20
Blockhouse Total $8,601.36
Budget Total $5,808.00
Difference ($2,793.36)




MUSKEGON COUNTY JUVENILE TREATMENT CENTER
FURNISHINGS AND EQUIPMENT BIDS

8/7/2014

CORTECH
Description |Q\y, |Manufacturer Model Number Color |Pn'oe (each) |Discoum (% Off List) ITotaI |Remarks NOTES
DETENTION/RESIDENT FURNITURE
Specified High Impact Table - 48"D 10 Norix - X-Base XB4800PT T.B.S. $1,279.00 |-40% = $5,116.00 7,674.00
Cortech 10 ModuForm 5000-542R-SLR $450.75 $4,507.50
Specified High Impact Stacking Chair 93 Norix - Integra C110 T.B.S. $77.00 |-40% = $2,864.40 $4,296.60
Cortech 93 Razorback 86484 $32.89 3,058.77
Cortech Total $7,566.27
Budget Total $11,970.60
Difference $4,404.33




MUSKEGON COUNTY JUVENILE TREATMENT CENTER
FURNISHINGS AND EQUIPMENT BIDS

8/7/12014

KENTWOOD / NORIX
Description |Q!y. |Manufacturer Model Number Color |Price (each) IDiscounl (% Off List) Total IRemarks NOTES
DETENTION/RESIDENT FURNITURE
Specified High Impact Lounge Chair 40 Norix - Hondo C910 T.B.S. $1,344.00]-40% = $21,504.00 | $32,256.00
Kentwood 40 Norix - Hondo C910 $847.00 $33,880.00
Specified High Impact Table/Ottoman 16 Norix - Hondo C915 T.B.S. $1,233.00 |-40% = $7,891.20 11,836.80
Kentwood 16 Norix - Hondo C915 $687.12 10,993.92
Specified High Impact Bed 34 orix - Attenda ATN101 T.B.S. $2,161.00 |-40% = $29,389.60 $44,084.40
Kentwood 34 orix - Attenda ATN101 $1,244.06 $42,298.04
Specified High Impact Nightstand 28 orix - Attenda ATN250 T.B.S. $569.00 |-40% = $6,372.80 $9,559.20
Kentwood 28 Norix - Attenda ATN250 $401.24 11,234.72
Specified High Impact Desk 32 Norix - Attenda ATN600 T.B.S. $1,148.00 |40% = $14,694.40 22,041.60
Kentwood 32 Norix - Attenda ATN601 707.76 22,648.32 | Same as ATNG0O
Specified High Impact Desk Stool 32 orix - Attenda ATNS500 T.B.S. 284.00 |-40% = $3,635.20 $5,452.80
Kentwood 32 orix - Attenda ATN500 250.35 $8,011.20
Specified High Impact 4 Shelf Storage Unit 20 orix - Attenda ATN400 T.B.S. $1,072.00 J-40% = $8576.00 | $12,864.00
Kentwood 20 Norix - Attenda ATN400 $667.53 $13,350.60
Specified Tamper Resistant Classroom Table 10 Norix MP3096PT Titanium Evolve 4810-60 $1,541.00 |-40% = $6,164.00 $9,246.00 J30"x96" County Lists 13
Kentwood 10 Norix MP3096PT $915.82 $9,158.20
Specified Tamper Resistant Classroom Table 2 Norix MP3072PT Titanium Evolve 4810-60 $1,277.00 |-40% = $1,021.60 $1,5632.40 |30"x72" County did not include
Specified Tamper Resistant Classroom Table 2 Norix MP3060PT Titanium Evolve 481060 $1,100.00 |-40% = $880.00 $1,320.00 30"x60"
Kentwood 2 Norix MP3060PT $682.35 $1,364.70
| Kentwood Total $152,939.70
Budget Total $157,906.80
Difference $4,967.10




