
(Recommended vendors above) March 7, 2019 BPW-19-034

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY 

Commodity Numbers: 02031, 335XX,67540,67545,67555,67558,67565,67584,67585,67590 

Department: Waste Water 

Bid: RFB 19-2336 Release Date: 01/23/2019 

Product I Service: Agricultural Chemicals & Fertilizers Opening Date: 02/12/2019 

Vendor Name & Address Responsive Received Total 

Bid 

CHS Inc Yes Yes $350,630.95 

4645 Washington St 

Hamilton Ml 49419 

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC Yes Yes $191,358.46 

349 Wilston St 

Conklin Ml 49403 

Nutrien Ag Solutions Yes Yes $6,908,997.99 

6288 S Greenville Rd 

Greenville Ml 48838 

Wilbur Ellis Company Yes Yes $362,449.25 

4160 10 Mile Rd 

Sparta Ml 49345 

Department Recommendation: Helena Agri-Enterprises -Alfalfa Starter Name of Buyer: Jamie Burmeister 

Nutrien Ag Solutions: Roundup Power Max 

Raptor 

Vendor Awarded: 

Boundary 6.SEC 

Low Vol. 6 

Mustang Maxx 

Maximizer 

0-0-62 Fertilizer 

Wilbur Ellis Company: Acuron 

Volunteer 

Alfalfa Foiliar Fertilizer 

Soybean Foliar Fertilizer 

Corn Starter Fertilizer 

ESN Fertilizer Signature: 

Board Approval Date: --------------- Board Motion Number: 

-sid Net Solicitation Statistics-

Received Notice: 117 

Viewed Documents: 17 

Solicitatiorr Received: 4 

No-Solicit Form Received: 0 

Comments 

~~~~~~~~~~----Eogelof7 



MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY 

-sid Net Solicitation Statistics-

Commodity Numbers: 02031 , 335XX, 67540,67545,67555,67558, 67565, 67584, 67585,67590 Received Notice: 117 

Department Waste Water Viewed Documents: 17 

Bid: RFB 19-2336 Release Date: 01/23/2019 Solicitation Received: 4 

Product I Service: Agricultural Chemicals & Fertilizers Opening Date: 02/1212019 No-Solicit Form Received: 0 

Vendor Name & Address Roundup Power Max Raptor Boundary 6.SEC Acuron 

500 gal. 28 gal. 170 gal. 1,000 gal. 

CHS Inc $9,330.00 $13,305.32 $13,192.00 $50,850.00 

4645 Washington St 

Hamilton Ml 49419 

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC $9,250.00 $12,824.00 $10,557.00 $48,000.00 

349 Wilston St 

Conklin Ml 49403 

Nutrien Ag Solutions $8,625.00 $10,241 .84 $10,036.80 $47,000.00 

6288 S Greenville Rd 

Greenville Ml 48838 

Wilbur Ellis Company $9,595.00 $11,788.00 $11 ,230.20 $45,000.00 

4160 10 Mile Rd 

Sparta Ml 49345 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY 

-sid Net Solicitation Statistics-

Commodity Numbers: 02031, 335XX, 67540, 67545, 67555, 67558, 67565, 67584, 67585, 67590 Received Notice: 117 

Department: Waste Water Viewed Documents: 17 

Bid: RFB 19-2336 Release Date: 01 /23/2019 Solicitation Received: 4 

Product I Service: Agricultural Chemicals & Fertilizers Opening Date: 02/12/201 9 No-Solicit Form Received: c 
ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE 

Vendor Name & Address 2, 4-D Ester Barrage HF Low Vol. 6 Weedone LVG Mustang Maxx Sulfrus 

50 gal. 20 gal. 50 gal. 50 gal. 104 gal. 28 gal. 

CHS Inc $1,136.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,558.08 No Bid 

4645 Washington St 

Hamilton Ml 49419 

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC No Bid $715.00 No Bid No Bid $10,021.44 $9,983.96 

349 Wilston St 

Conklin Ml 49403 

Nutrien Ag Solutions No Bid No Bid $945.00 No Bid $9,048.00 No Bid 

6288 S Greenville Rd 

Greenville Ml 48838 

Wilbur Ellis Company No Bid No Bid No Bid $970.00 $9,651 .20 No Bid 

4160 10 Mile Rd 

Sparta Ml 49345 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY 

- Bid Net Solicitation Statistics-

Commodity Numbers: 02031, 335XX, 67540, 67545, 67555, 67558, 67565, 67584, 67585, 67590 Received Notice: 117 

Department: Waste Water Viewed Documents: 17 

Bid: RFB 19-2336 Release Date: 01 /23/201 9 Solicitation Received: 4 

Product I Service: Agricultural Chemicals & Fertil izers Opening Date: 02/12/2019 No-Solicit Form Received: 0 

Select ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE 

Vendor Name & Address Max Gatlin Tap Out Volunteer 

135 gal. 135 gal. 90 gal. 135 gal. 

CHS Inc $12,029.85 $9,202.95 No Bid No Bid 

4645 Washington St 

Hamilton Ml 49419 

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC No Bid No Bid $10,393.20 No Bid 

349 Wilston St 

Conklin Ml 49403 

Nutrien Ag Solutions $10,633.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6288 S Greenville Rd 

Greenville Ml 48838 

Wilbur Ellis Company No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,972.75 

4160 10 Mile Rd 

Sparta Ml 49345 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY 

-sid Net Solicitation Statistics-

Commodity Numbers: 02031 , 335XX, 67540, 67545,67555, 67558,67565, 67584,67585,67590 Received Notice: 117 

Department: Waste Water Viewed Documents: 17 

Bid: RFB 19-2336 Release Date: 01/23/2019 Solicitation Received: 4 

Product I Service: Agricultural Chemicals & Fertilizers Opening Date: 02/1212019 No-Solicit Form Received: c 
ALTERNATE ALTERNATE ALTERNATE 

Vendor Name & Address Crop Oil Concentrate Agri-Dex Maximizer R.O.C. 

250 gal. 

CHS Inc $5,467.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4645 Washington St 

Hamilton Ml 49419 

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC No Bid $2,355.00 No Bid No Bid 

349 Wilston St 

Conklin Ml 49403 

Nutrien Ag Solutions No Bid No Bid $2,145.00 No Bid 

6288 S Greenville Rd 

Greenville Ml 48838 

Wilbur Ellis Company No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,237.50 

4160 10 Mile Rd 

Sparta Ml 49345 
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY 

- sid Net Solicitation Statistics-

Commodity Numbers: 02031, 335XX, 67540, 67545, 67555, 67558, 67565, 67584, 67585,67590 Received Notice: 117 

Department: Waste Water Viewed Documents: 17 

Bid: RFB 19-2336 Release Date: 01 /23/2019 Solicitation Received: 4 

Product I Service: Agricultural Chemicals & Fertil izers Openino Date: 02/12/2019 No-Solicit Form Received: ( 

ALTERNATE ALTERNATE 

Vendor Name & Address Alfalfa Foliar Fertilzer Ele-max Enc Soybean Foliar Fertilizer Ele-max Enc 

3,600 gal. 900 gal. 780 gal. 195 gal. 

CHS Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

4645 Washington St 

Hamilton Ml 49419 

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC No Bid $14,850.00 No Bid $3,217.50 

349 V\lilston St 

Conklin Ml 49403 

Nutrien Ag Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

6288 S Greenville Rd 

Greenville Ml 48838 

Wilbur Ellis Company $21 ,384.00 No Bid $5,670.60 No Bid 

4160 10 Mile Rd 

Sparta Ml 49345 



MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY 

-sid Net Solicitation Statistics-

Commodity Numbers: 02031 , 335XX, 67540, 67545,67555, 67558, 67565, 67584,67585,67590 Received Notice: 117 

Department: Waste Water Viewed Documents: 17 

Bid: RFB 19-2336 Release Date: 01 /23/2019 Solicitation Received: 4 

Product I Service: Agricultural Chemicals & Fertilizers Opening Date: 02/12/2019 No-Solicit Form Received: 0 

ALTERNATE 0-0-30 

Vendor Name & Address Com Starter Fertilizer 0-0-62 Fertilizer ESN Fertilizer Urea Alfalfa Starter Fertilizer Comments 

17,000 gal. 250 tons 175 tons 175 tons 120 tons 

CHS Inc $36,720.00 $87,000.00 No Bid $77,175.00 $36,693.60 

4645 Washington St 

Hamilton Ml 49419 

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC $35,530.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $33,682.80 

349 Wilston St 

Conklin Ml 49403 

Nutrien Ag Solutions $6,604, 160.00 $84,500.00 $91 ,000.00 No Bid $30,662.40 

6288 S Greenville Rd 

Greenville Ml 48838 

Wilbur Ellis Company $29,580.00 $89,000.00 $85,050.00 No Bid $34,320.00 

4160 10 Mile Rd 

Sparta Ml 49345 
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