
March 12, 2020 BPW-20-053Multiple Award

MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY
"Bid Net Solicitation Statistics"

Commodity Numbers: 335XX, 675XX Received Notice: 97
Department: Muskegon County Waste Water Viewed Documents: 18

Release Date: 02/04/2020
Opening Date: 02/18/2020

Bid: RFB 20-2378
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers

Solicitation Received: 5
No-Solicit Form Received: 0

Total Extended
Value

CommentsVendor Name & Address Received Responsive

$154,573.50 No Bid on Acuron, Bronc Max, Alfalfa
Foliar, Soybean Foliar, Corn Starter
ESN Fertilizer and 39-0-0-6S.

Ceres Solutions
4633 W Stoney Rd
McBain Ml 49657

YesYes

No Bid on Alfalfa Foliar, Soybean
Foliar, 39-0-0-6S Fertilizer and
0-0-30 Alfalfa Starter.

$249,965.78CHS Inc
4645 Washington St
Hamilton Ml 49419

YesYes

No Bid on Bronc Max, Alfalfa Foliar,
Soybean Foliar and ESN Fertilizer.

$283,570.20Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC
349 Wilson St
Conklin Ml 49403

Yes Yes

No Bid on Alfalfa Foliar, Soybean
Foliar and 39-0-0-6S Fertilizer.

$330,971.68Nutrien Ag Solutions
6288 S Greenville Rd
Greenville Ml 48838

Yes Yes

Submitted a bid for all chemicals$337,953.17Wilbur Ellis Company
277 South Maple Street
Grant Ml 49327

YesYes

CHS: LowVol 6 Ester
Helena Agri-Enterprises: Boundary 6.5ES, Acuron, 0-0-30 Alfalfa Starter Fertilizer
Nutrient Ag Solultions:Roundup Power Max, Mustang Max, ESN Fertilzer
Wilbur Ellis: Bronc Max, Alfalfa Foiliar, Soybean Fertilizer, Corn Starter,

0-0-62 Fertilizer, 39-0-0-6S Fertilizer

Name of Buyer: Jamie BurmeisterDepartment Recommendation:

Director of Finance/Assistant Courjtv^dmhjstratef'sYlame: BeJtTDick
Signature:

Board Motion Number:Board Approval Date:Vendor Awarded:
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY
“Bid Net Solicitation Statistics**

97Received Notice:Commodity Numbers: 335XX, 675XX
18Department: Muskegon County Waste Water Viewed Documents:

5Release Date: 02/04/2020
Opening Date: 02/18/2020

Solicitation Received:Bid: RFB 20-2378
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers 0No-Solicit Form Received:

60 gal.
Low Vol
6 Ester

164 gal.
Mustang Maxx

(Inscticide)

1,105 gal.
Acuron

750 gal.
Roundup

Power Max

170 gal.
Boundary 6.5ECVendor Name & Address

$117.00 / gal.
$19,188.00

$19.10 / gal.
$1,146.00

$69.10 / gal.
$11,747.00

No BidCeres Solutions
4633 W Stoney Rd
McBain Ml 49657

$17.89 / gal.
$13,417.50

$15.97 / gal.
$958.20

$96.12 / gal.
$15,763.68

$51.50 / gal.
$56,907.50

$17.84 / gal.
$13,380.00

$74.98 / gal.
$12,746.60

CHS Inc
4645 Washington St
Hamilton Ml 49419

'Coin Toss*

$59.00 / gal.
$10,030.00

$17.73 / gal.
$1,063.80

$86.50 / gal.
$14,186.00

$44.95 / gal.
$49,669.75

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC
349 Wilson St
Conklin Ml 49403

$16.62 / gal.
$12,465.00

$17.00 / gal.
$1,020.00

$83.00 / gal.
$13,612.00

$45.40 / gal.
$50,167.00

$59.00 / gal.
$10,030.00

Nutrien Ag Solutions
6288 S Greenville Rd
Greenville Ml 48838

$16.50 / gal.
$12,375.00

$18.75 / gal.
$1,125.00

$94.36 / gal.
$15,475.04

$45.90 / gal.
$50,719.50

$17.95 / gal.
$13,462.50

$68.95 / gal.
$11,721.50

Wilbur Ellis Company
277 South Maple Street
Grant Ml 49327
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY
"Bid Net Solicitation Statistics"

97Commodity Numbers: 335XX, 675XX Received Notice:
18Department: Muskegon County Waste Water Viewed Documents:

Release Date: 02/04/2020
Opening Date: 02/18/2020

5Bid: RFB 20-2378
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers

Solicitation Received:
0No-Solicit Form Received:

•ALTERNATE*
250 gal.
Fixate

•ALTERNATE*
250 gal.

Water Conditioner
18,720 gal

Corn Starter
Fertilizer

3,500 gal.
Alfalfa Foliar

Fertilizer

771 gal.
Soybean
Fertilizer

250 gal.
Bronc Max
(Adjuvant)

Vendor Name 8i Address

No Bid No BidNo Bid No BidNo Bid No BidCeres Solutions
4633 WStoney Rd
McBain Ml 49657

$1.96 / gal.
$36,691.20

No Bid No BidNo Bid $23.49 / gal.
$5,872.50

No BidCHS Inc
4645 Washington St
Hamilton Ml 49419

No Bid $1.99 / gal.
$37,252.80

No Bid No BidHelena Agri-Enterprises LLC
349 Wilson St
Conklin Ml 49403

No Bid No Bid

$1.744 / gal.
$32,647.68

$12.00 / gal.
$3,000.00

No Bid No BidNo BidNutrien Ag Solutions
6288 S Greenville Rd
Greenville Ml 48838

No Bid

$1.74 / gal.
$32,572.80

No Bid $5.91 / gal.
$20,685.00

$7.23 / gal.
$5,574.33

$7.45 / gal.
$1,862.50

No BidWilbur Ellis Company
277 South Maple Street
Grant Ml 49327
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MUSKEGON COUNTY BID SUMMARY
“Bid Net Solicitation Statistics**

97Received Notice:Commodity Numbers: 335XX, 675XX
18Department: Muskegon County Waste Water Viewed Documents:

5Release Date: 02/04/2020
Opening Date: 02/18/2020

Solicitation Received:Bid: RFB 20-2378
Product / Service: Agricultural Chemicals and Fertilizers 0No-Solicit Form Received:

‘ALTERNATE*
70 tn.

Urea Treated with
N-Edge 2

95 tn.
0-0-30

Alfalfa Starter
Fertilizer

‘ALTERNATE*
250 tn.
0-0-60

Red Potash

125 tn.
39-0-0-6S
Fertilizer

70 tn.250 tn.
0-0-62

Fertilizer
ESNVendor Name & Address

Fertilizer

$285.00 / tn.
$27,075.00

No Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid$328.00 / tn.
$82,000.00

Ceres Solutions
4633 W Stoney Rd
McBain Ml 49657

*Non-Equivalent*
$409.23 / tn.
$28,646.10

No BidNo BidNo BidNo Bid$316.00 / tn.
$79,000.00

CHS Inc
4645 Washington St
Hamilton Ml 49419

No Bid $440.75 / tn.
$55,093.75

$263.78 / tn.
$25,059.10

No BidNo Bid$315.00 / tn.
$78,750.00

Helena Agri-Enterprises LLC
349 Wilson St
Conklin Ml 49403

No Bid $266.00 / tn.
$25,270.00

$455.00 / tn
$31,850.00

No Bid$298.00 / tn.
$74,500.00

$306.00 / tn.
$76,500.00

Nutrien Ag Solutions
6288 S Greenville Rd
Greenville Ml 48838

$273.00 / tn
$25,935.00

No Bid $434.00 / tn.
$54,250.00

$476.00 / tn.
$33,320.00

No Bid$285.00 / tn.
$71,250.00

Wilbur Ellis Company
277 South Maple Street
Grant Ml 49327
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